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NORTH LITTLE ROCK SCHOOL DISTRICT
OFFICE OF THE SUPERINTENDENT

AGENDA

Regular Meeting - Board of Education
Administration Building

2700 Poplar Street
North Little Rock, Arkansas 72115

Thursday, April 21, 2016 05:30 PM

PUBLIC COMMENTS

I. CALL TO ORDER

Luke King, President

II. INVOCATION

Kennedy Banks, 8th Grader, North Little Rock, Middle School, daughter of Alexandria Hatton and Keatron Banks

III. FLAG SALUTE

Kennedy Banks, 8th Grader, North Little Rock, Middle School, daughter of Alexandria Hatton and Keatron Banks

IV. MISSION STATEMENT AND VISION STATEMENT

Mission Statement:
The North Little Rock School District and the Community will provide for achievement, accountability, acceptance and the
necessary assets in the pursuit of each student’s educational success.

Vision Statement:
World Class Schools for World Class Students

V. ROLL CALL OF MEMBERS

Luke King, President

Sandi Campbell, Vice President

Darrell Montgomery, Member
Tracy Steele, Secretary

Ron Treat, Parliamentarian

Scott Teague, Member

Dorothy Williams, Disbursing Officer

VI. RECOGNITION OF PEOPLE/EVENT/PROGRAMS
1. Recognition - NLRHS Packet page 2 of 147



Presenter: Kathy Kite, NLRHS Teacher

1. NLRHS Students:
Mason Graves
Mitchell Harvey
Da'Viona Sims

2. Recognition - NLRMS
Presenter: Principal, Lee Tackett

3. Superindent's Honor Roll

a. Melissa Farrar - Homebound Facilitator
Presenter: Jennifer Brown, Director of Special Services

VII. DISPOSITION OF MINUTES OF PRIOR MEETINGS
1. Regular Board Meeting Minutes - March 17, 2016

Regular Board Meeting Minutes March 17 2016.pdf (p. 6)

VIII. ACTION ITEMS - NEW BUSINESS
1. Consent Agenda

Presenter: Kelly Rodgers, Superintendent

a. Monthly Financial Reports

Monthly Financial April 2016.pdf (p. 10)

b. Employment of Personnel

Employment of Personnel - April 2016.pdf (p. 33)

c. Business Office Items

Business Office Items - April 2016.pdf (p. 35)

d. Payment of Regular Bills

Check Registry April 2016.xlsx (p. 40)

2. Licensed Personnel Policies Committee Report

3. Classified Personnel Policies Committee Report
Classified Personnel Policy Committee - April 2016.docx (p. 44)

4. 2016-2017 Meal Price Increase
Presenter: Marsha Satterfield, Child Nutrition Manager

Lunch Price Increase 16-17 Recommendation.docx (p. 45)

5. Budget Amendment
Presenter: Denise Drennan, CFO

Budget Amendment - April 2016.pdf (p. 46)

6. 2016 Summer School - North Little Rock High School
Presenter: Dr. Beth Stewart, Deputy Superintendent

2016 Summer School North Little Rock High School - April 2016.pdf (p. 48)
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7. 2016 Summer School - North Little Rock Academy
Presenter: Dr. Beth Stewart, Deputy Superintendent

15-16 North Little Rock Academy Summer Program - April 2016.docx (p. 49)

8. Policy 5.4 School Improvement Teams
Presenter: Dr. Beth Stewart, Deputy Superintendent

Policy 5.4 School Improvement Teams - April 2016.pdf (p. 51)

9. Pulaski Technical College MOU
Presenter: Christie Toland - Director of College and Career Readiness

Pulaski Technical College MOU - April 2016.pdf (p. 52)

10. Taggart Agreement Between Owner and Architect for North Little Rock Middle School
Presenter: Gene Hawk, Director of Facilities Management

North Liitltle Rock Middle School Agreement Between Owner and Architect - April 2016.pdf (p. 61)

11. NLRMS Facility Plan
Presenter: Mr. Rodgers, Superintendent

12. Fit2Be a Wildcat Summer Camp
Presenter: Heather Rhodes-Newburn, School Health Coordinator

Fit2Be a Wildcat Camp - April 2016.pdf (p. 80)

13. 2016-2017 Approved Legal Transfers
Presenter: Michael Stone, Executive Director of Student & Equity Services

2016-2017 Approved Legal Transfers - April 2016.pdf (p. 82)

14. Verizon Arena Contract - North Little Rock School District
Presenter: Brian Brown, Director of Purchasing and Finance

Verizon Arena Contract - NLRSD.pdf (p. 84)

15. White River Services - North Little Rock High School
Presenter: Jerry Dowdy, IT Manager

White River Services NLRHS - April 2016.pdf (p. 96)

16. Recommendation to add Instructional Specialists
Presenter: Karli Saracini, Executive Director of Human Resources

Creating Administrative Post for Board - April 2016.pptx (p. 97)

2016-2017 Instructional Specialist Job Descriptions.pdf (p. 116)

IX. CALENDAR OF EVENTS

NLR Academic Signing Day, Wednesday, April 27, 2016 at 10:00 am, North Little Rock Chamber of Commerce
NLRHS Choir Concert, Thursday, April 28, 2016 at 5:30 pm, NLRHS Auditorium
Teacher Appreciation Week, Monday, May 2, 2016 - Friday, May 6, 2016
VIPS Luncheon, Thursday, May 5, 2016 at 11:30 am, First Assembly of God
The Wizard of Oz, Thursday, May 5, 2016 at 6:00 pm, Crestwood Elementary School Cafeteria
The Wizard of Oz, Friday, May 6, 2016 at 6:00 pm, Crestwood Elementary School Cafeteria
NLRHS Graduation, Monday, May 16, 2016, at 7:00 pm, Verizon Arena
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1. Capital Improvement Program (CIP) Project Reports
Presenter: Gene Hawk, Director of Facility Management

a. Construction Schedule Update

Construction Schedule Update - April 2016.pdf (p. 132)

2. Superintendent's Report
Presenter: Mr. Rodgers, Superintendent

Superintendent's Report - April 2016.pdf (p. 133)

3. NLR Booster Agreements
Presenter: Scott Miller, NLR Athletic Boosters

a. Wildcat City Agreement

Wildcat City Agreement - April 2016.pdf (p. 144)

b. ATM Agreement

ATM Agreement - April 2016.pdf (p. 146)

XI. ADJOURNMENT
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NORTH LITTLE ROCK SCHOOL DISTRICT
OFFICE OF THE SUPERINTENDENT

AGENDA

Regular Meeting - Board of Education
Meeting Minutes
Administration Building

2700 Poplar Street
North Little Rock, Arkansas 72115
Thursday, March 17, 2016 05:30 PM

PUBLIC COMMENTS

I. CALL TO ORDER

President Luke King called the meeting to order at 5:30 pm.

II. INVOCATION

KeKoa How, Second Grader Ridgeroad Elementary School, prayed.

III. FLAG SALUTE

Tristen Clark, Third Grader Ridgeroad Elementary School, led the salute to our American flag.

IV. MISSION STATEMENT AND VISION STATEMENT

Board member Dorothy Williams read our Mission and Vision statement.

V. ROLL CALL OF MEMBERS

Present:
Luke King, President
Sandi Campbell, Vice President
Tracy Steele, Secretary
Ron Treat, Parliamentarian
Dorothy Williams, Disbursing Officer

Absent:
Darrell Montgomery, Member
Scott Teague, Member

VI. DISPOSITION OF MINUTES OF PRIOR MEETINGS

MOTION
Dorothy Williams moved to accept the minutes of the regular February 18, 2016 board meeting and special
Board meeting on February 26, 2016 and March 3, 2016 as printed. Sandi Campbell seconded the motion.

YEAS: Campbell, King, Steele, Treat, and Williams
NAYS: Absent ( Montgomery, Teague)

1. Regular Board Meeting Minutes - February 18, 2016

2. Special Board Meeting Minutes - February 26, 2016

3. Special Board Meeting Minutes - March 3, 2016
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VII. ACTION ITEMS - NEW BUSINESS

Mr. Rodgers presented the monthly financial report, employment of personnel, business office items, and
payment of regular bills.

1. Consent Agenda

MOTION
Ron Treat moved to accept the consent agenda as presented and printed on the agenda. Sandi
Campbell seconded the motion.

YEAS: Campbell, King, Steele, Treat, and Williams
NAYS: Absent ( Montgomery, Teague)

a. Monthly Financial Reports

b. Employment of Personnel

c. Business Office Items

d. Building Use Request

e. Payment of Regular Bills

2. Memorandum of Understanding - Arkansas Department of Career Education

Christie Toland presented the Memorandum of Understanding with the Arkansas Department of Career
Education.

MOTION
Tracy Steele moved to accept the Memorandum of Understanding - Arkansas Department of Career
Education as presented and printed on the agenda. Dorothy Williams seconded the motion.

YEAS: Campbell, King, Steele, Treat, and Williams
NAYS: Absent ( Montgomery, Teague)

3. Memorandum of Understanding - Educational Service Cooperatives

Christie Toland presented the Memorandum of Understanding with the Educational Service
Cooperatives.

MOTION
Tracy Steele moved to accept the Memorandum of Understanding - Educational Service Cooperatives
as presented and printed on the agenda. Dorothy Williams seconded the motion.

YEAS: Campbell, King, Steele, Treat, and Williams
NAYS: Absent ( Montgomery, Teague)

4. Licensed Personnel Policies Committee Report

Kendra Leirer presented the Licensed Policies Committee Report.

MOTION
Dorothy Williams moved to accept the proposal for the head volleyball coach to receive equitable pay
which is a stipend of $10,500 and a 240 day contract as all other head coaches for major sports. Tracy
Steele seconded the motion.

YEAS: Campbell, King, Steele, Treat, and Williams
NAYS: Absent ( Montgomery, Teague)

5. Classified Personnel Policies Committee Report

George Ray presented the Classified Personnel Policies Committee proposals.

Proposal
1.5% salary increase based on the steps and range of each classified employee. This should mimic the
LPPC 1.5% salary request. Packet page 7 of 147



Motion
Dorothy Williams moved to accept the CPPC 1.5% salary increase as presented and printed on the
agenda. Tracy Steele seconded the motion.

Roll Call Vote
Luke King - no
Sandi Campbell - no
Darrell Montgomery - absent
Tracy Steele - yes
Ron Treat - yes
Scott Teague - absent
Dorothy Williams - yes

6. Staff Pay Proposal

Karli Saracini presented the Staff Pay proposal for one Manufacturing/STEM Teacher.

MOTION
Dorothy Williams moved to accept the staff pay proposal for one Manufacturing/STEM Teacher as
presented and printed on the agenda. Ron Treat seconded the motion.

YEAS: Campbell, King, Steele, Treat, and Williams
NAYS: Absent ( Montgomery, Teague)

a. Manufacturing/STEM Teacher

7. Wildcat Foundation Chair Sponsorship Program Agreement

Mr. Rodgers presented the Wildcat Foundation Chair Sponsorship Agreement.

MOTION
Dorothy Williams moved to accept the Wildcat Foundation Chair Sponsorship Agreement as presented
and printed on the agenda. Ron Treat seconded the motion.

YEAS: Campbell, King, Steele, Treat, and Williams
NAYS: Absent ( Montgomery, Teague)

8. White River Services and Solutions

Brian Brown presented the White River Services and Solutions agreement.

MOTION
Ron Treat moved to accept the White River Services and Solutions agreement as presented and
printed on the agenda.Tracy Steele seconded the motion.

YEAS: Campbell, King, Steele, Treat, and Williams
NAYS: Absent ( Montgomery, Teague)

The Board went into a closed Executive Session to discuss personnel at 7:04 pm.
The Board reconvened in open session at 7:25 pm.

9. Settlement of Back Pay Claim

Mr. Rodgers presented the settlement of back pay claims for Leslie Joshua and Fred Abraham.

a. Leslie Joshua

MOTION
Ron Treat moved to accept the settlement of back pay claim agreement for Leslie Joshua as
printed.Tracy Steele seconded the motion.

YEAS: Campbell, King, Steele, Treat, and Williams
NAYS: Absent ( Montgomery, Teague)
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b. Fred Abraham

MOTION
Tracy Steele moved to accept the settlement of back pay claim agreement for Fred Abraham as
printed. Dorothy Williams seconded the motion.

YEAS: Campbell, King, Steele, Treat, and Williams
NAYS: Absent ( Montgomery, Teague)

VIII. ADJOURNMENT

MOTION
Dorothy Williams moved to adjourn the meeting. Ron Treat seconded the motion.

YEAS: Campbell, King, Steele, Treat, and Williams
NAYS: Absent ( Montgomery, Teague)

Board President Luke King declared the meeting adjourned at 7:50 pm.

________________________________________        ______________________________________
Luke King, President                                                       Rhonda Colquitt, Recording Secretary
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*            Did not meet specifications 
**           Part of all or no bid 
***         Quality not recommended 
****        Limited Coverage 
*****       Recommended 
******      Recommended Pending Contract Negotiation                     

 

 

NORTH LITTLE ROCK SCHOOL DISTRICT 
BUSINESS OFFICE ITEMS FOR CONSENT AGENDA APPROVAL 

April 21, 2016 
 
 
ITEM: Band Repairs 
ITEM DESCRIPTION: Band Repairs 
COMPETITIVE BID: NA 
BID NAME: NA 
SOURCE OF FUNDING: Operating & Fundraising  
LOCATION: Middle School 
 
Independent Music Services Inc.     $11,863.72***** 
 
 
ITEM: Food Production Equipment 
ITEM DESCRIPTION: Food Production Equipment 
COMPETITIVE BID: NA 
BID NAME: NA 
SOURCE OF FUNDING:  Food Production Start Up Grant 
LOCATION: High School 
 
Pioneer Food Service Equipment & Supplies    $11,254.00***** 
 
 
ITEM: NGSS Science TechBook 2016/2017 
ITEM DESCRIPTION: NGSS Science TechBook 2016/2017 
COMPETITIVE BID: NA  
BID NAME: NA 
SOURCE OF FUNDING:  Textbook Fund 
LOCATION: Middle School 
 
Discovery Education       $83,250.00***** 
 
 
ITEM: IPad Air 16GB (3) & Bretford Powersync Cart (1) 
ITEM DESCRIPTION: IPad Air 16GB (3) & Bretford Powersync Cart (1) 
COMPETITIVE BID: Yes 
BID NAME: State Contract # 4600035722 
SOURCE OF FUNDING: Title I  
LOCATION: High School 
 
Apple Computer       $21,689.10***** 
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*            Did not meet specifications 
**           Part of all or no bid 
***         Quality not recommended 
****        Limited Coverage 
*****       Recommended 
******      Recommended Pending Contract Negotiation                     

 

 

 
 
 
 
ITEM: MacBook Pro 13 (2), IPad Mini (6), IPad Mini & Applecare (9) 
ITEM DESCRIPTION: MacBook Pro 13 (2), IPad Mini (6), IPad Mini & Applecare (9) 
COMPETITIVE BID: Yes 
BID NAME: State Contract # 4600035722 
SOURCE OF FUNDING:  Title I 
LOCATION: Meadow Park 
 
Apple Computer       $28,264.26***** 
 
 
ITEM: MacBook Pro 13 (1), IPad Mini (3) & Applecare (1) 
ITEM DESCRIPTION: MacBook Pro 13 (1), IPad Mini (3) & Applecare (1) 
COMPETITIVE BID: Yes 
BID NAME: State Contract # 4600035722 
SOURCE OF FUNDING:  Title I 
LOCATION: Indian Hills 
 
Apple Computer       $12,772.63***** 
 
 
ITEM: Library Books 
ITEM DESCRIPTION: Library Books 
COMPETITIVE BID: NA 
BID NAME: NA 
SOURCE OF FUNDING:  Title I 
LOCATION: Indian Hills 
 
Houghton Mifflin       $18,071.76***** 
 
 
ITEM: Football Jerseys & Football Practice Jerseys Customized 
ITEM DESCRIPTION: Football Jerseys & Football Practice Jerseys Customized 
COMPETITIVE BID: NA 
BID NAME: NA 
SOURCE OF FUNDING:  Operational 
LOCATION: High School 
 
All American Inc.        $20,229.83***** 
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*            Did not meet specifications 
**           Part of all or no bid 
***         Quality not recommended 
****        Limited Coverage 
*****       Recommended 
******      Recommended Pending Contract Negotiation                     

 

 

 
 
 
 
ITEM: Dell Poweredge Server & Optiplex 7040 with 24” Monitors 
ITEM DESCRIPTION: Dell Poweredge Server & Optiplex 7040 with 24” Monitors 
COMPETITIVE BID: Yes  
BID NAME: Tips/Taps # 2062515 
SOURCE OF FUNDING:  Title I 
LOCATION: Youth Home 
 
White River Services       $19,500.71*****  
     
 
ITEM: VEX IQ Full Competition Field 
ITEM DESCRIPTION: VEX IQ Full Competition Field 
COMPETITIVE BID: NA 
BID NAME: NA 
SOURCE OF FUNDING:  NSLA 
LOCATION: Glenview 
 
Project Lead The Way, Inc.      $14,256.90***** 
 
 
ITEM: Structure and Function Kits 
ITEM DESCRIPTION: Structure and Function Kits 
COMPETITIVE BID: NA 
BID NAME: NA 
SOURCE OF FUNDING:  NSLA 
LOCATION: Glenview 
 
Project Lead The Way, Inc.      $16,970.50***** 
 
 
ITEM: Classroom Furniture 
ITEM DESCRIPTION: Classroom Furniture 
COMPETITIVE BID: Yes 
BID NAME: Tips/Taps # 1102512 
SOURCE OF FUNDING:  Construction 
LOCATION: Crestwood 
 
Virco         $14,995.11***** 
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*            Did not meet specifications 
**           Part of all or no bid 
***         Quality not recommended 
****        Limited Coverage 
*****       Recommended 
******      Recommended Pending Contract Negotiation                     

 

 

 
 
 
 
ITEM: Classroom Furniture 
ITEM DESCRIPTION: Classroom Furniture 
COMPETITIVE BID: Yes 
BID NAME: Tips/Taps # 1102512 
SOURCE OF FUNDING:  Construction 
LOCATION: Glenview 
 
Virco         $1,918.11***** 
 
 
ITEM: Classroom Furniture 
ITEM DESCRIPTION: Classroom Furniture 
COMPETITIVE BID: Yes 
BID NAME: Tips/Taps # 1102512 
SOURCE OF FUNDING:  Construction 
LOCATION: Seventh Street 
 
Virco         $3,723.27***** 
 
 
ITEM: Classroom Furniture 
ITEM DESCRIPTION: Classroom Furniture 
COMPETITIVE BID: Yes 
BID NAME: Tips/Taps # 1102512 
SOURCE OF FUNDING:  Construction 
LOCATION: North Little Rock High School 
 
Virco         $4,977.84*****  
       
 
ITEM: Mounting Projectors 
ITEM DESCRIPTION: Mounting Projectors 
COMPETITIVE BID: Yes 
BID NAME: Tips/Taps # 1121914 
SOURCE OF FUNDING:  Construction 
LOCATION: High School Coach Office 
 
Piraino         $3,546.88***** 
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*            Did not meet specifications 
**           Part of all or no bid 
***         Quality not recommended 
****        Limited Coverage 
*****       Recommended 
******      Recommended Pending Contract Negotiation                     

 

 

 
 
 
ITEM: Supply & Installation of Play Turf & Padding Underlay 
ITEM DESCRIPTION: Supply & Installation of Play Turf & Padding Underlay 
COMPETITIVE BID: Yes 
BID NAME: School Playground Turf 
SOURCE OF FUNDING:  ABC Pre-K 
LOCATION: Pike View Pre-K 
 
Barre Commercial Playgrounds, Inc.     $16,635.00***** 
Baldwin & Shell        $22,000.00 
Grounds For Play       $19,219.10 
         
 
ITEM: Amendment #1 Professional Services Agreement (Architect) 
ITEM DESCRIPTION: Amendment #1 Professional Services Agreement (Architect) 
COMPETITIVE BID: NA 
BID NAME: NA 
SOURCE OF FUNDING:  Construction 
LOCATION: Pike View Pre-K 
 
Taggart Architect       $17,500.00***** 
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North Little Rock School DistrictRevenue

FY15 FY16 FY16 FY16 Actual
as of Annual as of compared to

6/30/2015 Budget 3/31/2016 FY16 Budget
Revenue:
11110 Property Taxes Current (7/1-12/31) 17,778,102 18,000,000 18,664,707 664,707 
11120 Property Taxes (1/1-6/30) 13,516,522 13,500,000 1,712,987 (11,787,013)
11140 Property Tax- Delinquent 2,283,805 2,250,000 1,082,809 (1,167,191)
11150 Excess Commission 610,043 600,000 (600,000)
11160 Land Redemption- In State Sale 389,151 350,000 119,879 (230,121)
11400 Penalties/Interest on Tax 6,714 6,714 
13120 Summer School Tuition 18,713 16,000 (3,380) (19,380)
13140 Day Care Tuition 177,319 173,000 127,504 (45,496)
15100 Interest On Investments 190,302 50,185 81,973 31,788 
16210 Student Food Service 337,786 350,100 232,879 (117,221)
16215 A La Carte Food Service 360,933 365,000 185,041 (179,959)
16220 Adult Food Service 18,671 18,700 13,343 (5,357)
16300 Special Function Contract Meals 8,428 8,400 229 (8,171)
16900 Other Food Service Revenue 6,342 16,000 1,864 (14,136)
17110 Athletic Admissions 6,675 0 
17200 Student Sales 698,604 407,352 407,352 
17500 Enterprise Activities 89,987 32,597 32,597 
17900 Other Student Activity Revenue 19,062 3,000 163,066 160,066 
19120 Other Rent - Land Owned 30,600 0 20,950 20,950 
19130 Buildings & Facilities 50,016 30,600 3,460 (27,140)
19140 Equipment & Vehicles 2,223 2,223 
19200 Private Contributions 66,991 10,681 10,681 
19300 Sales of Supplies and Material 1,281 0 
19800 Refunds of Prior Year Expense (44,272) 67,855 67,855 
19900 Misc Rev From Local Sources 309,022 228,800 351,380 122,580 
21200 Severance Tax 11,913 10,000 2,512 (7,488)
21900 Other Revenue from County 1,898 (1,898) (1,898)
31101 Foundation Funding 36,544,632 36,049,684 26,218,145 (9,831,539)
31103 98% Tax Collect Rate Guaranteed 639,386 200,000 (200,000)
31450 Student Growth 0 
31460 Declining Enrollment 338,179 538,637 538,637 0 
31900 Other Grants and Aid 500 500 
32232 Progress Awards 19,035 0 
32250 Pathwise Mentoring Grant 62,700 37,200 34,800 (2,400)
32253 Pathwise Mentor Training 403 403 
32256 Professional Development 225,092 215,597 215,597 0 
32310 Children with Disabilities 33,511 33,500 (33,500)
32314 Special Ed Extended School Year 3,108 4,736 6,512 1,776 
32350 Early Childhood Special Education 215,794 194,776 136,343 (58,433)
32355 Special Ed Cat. Loss Funding 162,541 162,541 (162,541)
32361 GT Advanced Placement 6,450 4,150 4,300 150 
32364 IB Exams-Fees 19,928 0 
32370 Alternative Learning Environment 830,988 208,645 639,335 430,690 
32371 Limited English Proficiency 137,261 142,560 149,688 7,128 
32381 National School Lunch Funding 5,176,332 6,316,604 4,583,891 (1,732,713)
32415 Secondary Workforce Centers 25,729 15,438 (10,292)
32430 Coord Comp WF ED - Special Need 2,243 2,000 (2,000)
32480 Workforce New Program Start Up 56,821 59,316 59,316 
32520 State Matching - School Food Servi 29,523 29,656 27,592 (2,064)
32710 Arkansas Better Chance Grant 2,748,470 2,838,240 2,374,503 (463,737)
32740 Infant/Toddler Program 15,390 14,000 15,985 1,985 
32813 Magnet & M to M Transportation 488,338 0 
32904 Desegregation Settlement 7,940,864 7,642,338 6,252,822 (1,389,516)
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North Little Rock School DistrictRevenue

FY15 FY16 FY16 FY16 Actual
as of Annual as of compared to

6/30/2015 Budget 3/31/2016 FY16 Budget
32912 General Facilities Funding 16,306 0 
32915 Debt Service Supplemental 144,693 140,702 140,702 0 
32924 Academic Facilities Partnership Pr (617,698) 10,371,402 180,689 (10,190,713)
32931 Broadband Facilities Matching Gra 265,947 0 
32941 Governor's Computer Science Grant 49,750 20,000 (29,750)
43119 Innovative Approach to Literacy 75,090 0 
43160 Reserve Officer's Training Corp - 118,997 125,000 86,878 (38,122)
45110 Federal Title 1 Regular Education 3,947,619 4,649,339 2,332,834 (2,316,504)
45114 Federal Title 1 School Improvement 233,246 16,981 16,981 (0)
45140 Federal McKinney Homeless Act 52,150 49,728 49,728 0 
45166 Federal Promoting Adolescent Heal 6,930 14,500 14,500 0 
45167 High Quality Preschool Program 657,600 460,320 (197,280)
45310 Federal Carl Perkins Basic Grant 111,738 150,689 66,098 (84,591)
45510 Lunch Reimbursements through A 2,184,870 2,450,000 1,993,780 (456,220)
45511 Lunch Reimbursements through D 8,554 0 
45512 SL-4 Lunch Reimbursement 47,059 53,000 41,171 (11,829)
45520 Breakfast Reimbursements - ADE 823,815 930,000 740,634 (189,367)
45540 Snack Reimbursements - ADE 23,259 26,500 14,823 (11,677)
45541 Snack Reimbursements through D 54,586 54,800 49,159 (5,641)
45561 Regular Commodities 215,000 (215,000)
45562 Fresh Fruits and Vegetables 60,000 (60,000)
45613 Federal Title VI-B Pass Through 1,538,855 2,192,097 1,193,618 (998,479)
45630 Federal Special Ed Early Childhood 96,408 85,987 198 (85,790)
45650 Medicaid Reimbursement 358,232 355,000 206,184 (148,816)
45910 Medicaid Reimbursement 54 54 
45913 Medicaid General Health Services 119,695 155,000 36,513 (118,487)
45916 Medicaid General Hlth - Personal Ca 4,667 4,500 (4,500)
45917 Medicaid General Hlth - Vision/Hear 32,895 32,500 36 (32,464)
45918 Medicaid General Hlth - Audiology 671 600 214 (386)
45925 Title II Improve Teacher Quality 329,028 550,132 (550,132)
45935 Title III English Language Acquisiti 42,591 57,736 24,642 (33,095)
51100 Bonded Indebtedness 65,465,000 20,000,000 (20,000,000)
52900 Indirect Cost Reimbursement 365,861 (365,861)
53200 Sale of Building and Grounds 461,568 490,339 490,521 182 
53400 Compensation or Loss - Fixed Asse 71,798 25,000 53,345 28,345 

Total Revenue 168,653,044 134,960,121 72,774,153 (62,185,968)
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North Little Rock School District Expenditures

FY15 FY16 FY16 FY16 Actual
as of Annual as of compared to

Expenditures 6/30/2015 Budget 3/31/2016 FY16 Budget

60000-6Salaries & Benefits 68,935,767 65,372,984 41,976,875 23,396,109 

Other:
63130 Board of Education Services 1,061,729 1,067,476 1,074,504 (7,027)
63210 Instruction Service 2,000 2,668 2,821 (153)
63220 Substitute Teachers 683,384 762,390 625,986 136,404 
63221 Classified Substitutes 101,391 100,740 285 100,455 
63230 Consulting Educational 187,954 351,581 155,738 195,843 
63240 Student Assessment 22,959 51,391 48,972 2,419 
63310 Professional Dev - Certified 114,937 406,382 266,121 140,261 
63320 Professional Dev - Classified 8,423 29,241 6,053 23,188 
63410 Pupil Service 3,733 1,700 433 1,267 
63431 Financial Audits 28,325 28,500 29,200 (700)
63441 Legal Defense of District 109,342 95,663 64,845 30,818 
63442 Legal Plaintiff Sue St 15,500 0 
63443 Legal District as Plaintiff 14,501 15,000 3,701 11,299 
63445 Legal Research-Opinion 1,051 0 
63450 Medical 1,954 1,954 
63460 Information Technology 455 105 105 
63480 Security 11,937 (11,937)
63490 Other Professional Services 236,189 267,653 99,355 168,298 
63491 Security 2,751 0 
63530 Software Maint & Support 42,491 43,442 43,287 155 
63590 Other Technical Services 80,971 64,454 39,456 24,998 
63591 Drug Testing 4,977 8,972 5,351 3,621 
63592 Webhosting 33,794 33,794 
63900 Other Prof / Tech Services 251,612 1,467,732 212,789 1,254,942 
64110 Water/Sewer 152,307 169,600 116,720 52,880 
64210 Disposal/Sanitation 89,757 85,900 89,868 (3,968)
64231 Pest Control 20,165 19,825 12,358 7,467 
64240 Lawn Care 17,357 24,927 22,464 2,463 
64310 Non Tech Repairs/Maintenance 194,303 187,973 249,452 (61,479)
64320 Tech Repairs/Maintenance 5,035 538,637 538,637 
64410 Rent of Land and Buildings 42,699 10,420 6,635 3,784 
64420 Rent of Equipment and Vehicles 10,048 6,674 1,467 5,207 
64421 Rent of Buses - Internal 32,124 37,849 982 36,867 
64430 Copier/Comp Lease 309,144 429,469 318,261 111,208 
64431 Technology Rental 14,000 3,880 10,120 
65190 From Other Sources 3,098 0 
65210 Property Insurance 480,628 534,320 591,777 (57,458)
65240 Fleet Insurance 112,806 111,638 (111,638)
65250 Accident Insurance for Students 29,880 44,696 29,880 14,816 
65290 Other Insurance 27,653 37,753 32,323 5,430 
65300 Communication 155 (155)
65310 Telephone 197,513 161,975 146,641 15,334 
65311 Radio Airtime 1,325 756 569 
65320 Postage 24,123 18,179 19,779 (1,599)
65331 Broadband 101,524 274,872 474,117 (199,246)
65400 Advertising 105,165 63,040 32,336 30,704 
65500 Printing & Binding 11,729 18,838 26,279 (7,440)
65610 Tuition To LEA Within State 802,968 755,130 265,479 489,652 
65630 Tuition To Private Schools 387,047 232,413 198,185 34,228 
65690 Other Tuition 39,628 153,757 36,680 117,077 
65810 Travel Certified 24,714 34,640 11,712 22,929 
65820 Travel Classified 12,211 13,078 3,582 9,497 
65830 Travel Certified - Out of District 4,800 8,099 4,648 3,451 
65840 Travel Classified - Out of District 698 350 108 242 
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North Little Rock School District Expenditures

FY15 FY16 FY16 FY16 Actual
as of Annual as of compared to

Expenditures 6/30/2015 Budget 3/31/2016 FY16 Budget
65850 Travel Certified - Out of State 7,640 42,811 8,571 34,241 
65860 Travel Classified - Out of State 1,155 1,227 173 1,055 
65870 Travel Non - Employee 6,154 17,957 11,618 6,340 
65880 Meals 6,933 12,551 5,913 6,639 
65890 Lodging 20,053 37,876 18,544 19,332 
65900 Medicaid State Match 133,168 100,794 32,373 
66100 General Supplies and Materials 2,541,580 4,744,658 2,287,208 2,457,451 
66108 Food - Workshops/Meetings 27,231 57,804 15,565 42,239 
66114 Supplies - Flooring 58,300 123,914 87,516 36,398 
66119 Supplies - Hvac 1,989 48,185 48,185 
66210 Natural Gas 318,098 363,000 152,565 210,435 
66220 Electricity 1,255,037 5,086,209 950,500 4,135,709 
66260 Gasoline 80,688 149,851 38,783 111,068 
66265 Diesel 263,858 228,478 133,959 94,519 
66300 Food - Sch Food Service Prgm 1,563,914 2,149,415 1,060,411 1,089,004 
66410 Textbooks 82,140 25,673 169,913 (144,240)
66411 Electronic Textbooks 27,750 (27,750)
66420 Library Books 25,648 35,051 14,635 20,416 
66421 Electronic Library Books 3,725 0 
66430 Periodicals 11,826 5,435 1,713 3,722 
66431 Electronic Subscriptions 1,550 0 
66440 Audiovisual Materials 1,326 500 468 32 
66510 Software 301,459 665,534 676,012 (10,479)
66511 Technology Applications 60,596 3,808 3,258 550 
66512 Tablet Computers 287,920 492,502 324,471 168,031 
66520 Technology Supp Other 14,065 6,605 3,904 2,701 
66526 Toner/Ink Cartridges 42,603 36,076 29,094 6,982 
66527 Technology Supp <$1000.00 824,355 394,284 367,663 26,621 
66900 Other Supplies & Material 44,848 10,533 10,575 (42)
67310 Machinery 0 
67320 Vehicles 6,475 215,501 309,320 (93,819)
67340 Technology Related Hardware 1,703,348 959,191 592,832 366,358 
67341 Tech Rel Hardware (insured) 25,733 25,733 0 
67350 Tech Software 16,584 14,317 5,999 8,318 
67390 Other Equipment 17,759 53,199 1,555 51,644 
68100 Dues and Fees 88,334 83,359 48,723 34,636 
68100 Bond Fees 1,628,011 0 
68102 Background Checks 7,941 7,500 5,890 1,610 
68300 Interest 4,289,150 8,869,103 9,481,381 (612,278)
68400 Indirect Costs 373,611 1,507 372,104 
68600 Penalties and Interest 32,444 (32,444)
68700 Out of Court Settlement 62,000 62,000 0 
68830 Property Tax 8,739 9,478 (9,478)
68900 Miscellaneous Expenditures 344 344 
69100 Redemption of Principal 3,805,040 2,955,000 3,158,710 (203,710)
69310 To Salary Fund 32,976,489 12,011,866 20,964,623 
69320 To Operating Fund 2,581,626 2,581,626 
69321 To Fund 2000 54,490,896 54,490,896 
69330 To Building Fund 7,997,999 7,997,999 
69340 To Debt Service Fund 12,191,601 12,191,601 
69360 To Federal Grants Fund 445,649 445,649 
69370 To Student Activity Fund 16,070 58,554 (42,484)
69410 Remittance to ADE – ARVA Student (84,964) 45,000 45,000 

Construction Projects from Bonds 89,900,755 453,846 46,434,902 (45,981,056)
Total Other Exp 115,455,664 148,369,715 84,241,464 64,128,251 

TOTAL EXPENSE 184,391,431 213,742,699 126,218,339 87,524,360 
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Classified Personnel Policy Committee

April 12, 2016

9:00A.M.

The CPPC met T THE Child Nutrition Office on Tuesday, April 12, 2016 at 9:00A.M.; 
committee present Michael Stone, Marsha Satterfield, Tamara Rogers, Donald 
Williams, George Ray, Javis Dickerson and Karli Saracini.

I. Minutes- Tamara Rogers
II. Old Business- CPPC members wanted to know when the retro checks would 

be ready; we were told sometime in May.
III. New Business- Tuition reimbursement for classified staff pursing a teaching 

license. Classified staff can be reimbursed for 6 credit hours a year, if they 
agree to work for the district 1 contract year.
CPPC members would like to have a Seniority Policy based on hire date.

IV. Meeting  adjourn at 9:50A.M.
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(501) 771-8000   www.nlrsd.org

April 2, 2016

To: Mr. Kelly Rodgers, Superintendent

From: Marsha Satterfield, Director of Child Nutrition

Re: Increase in 2016–2017 School Lunch Prices

USDA created  a  Paid  Equity  Tool  to  help  School  Food Authorities  calculate  their  paid  lunch  price
increase requirement. Non-Federal source contributions must meet the requirements in Section 205 of the
Healthy, Hunger-Free Kids Act of 2010. If the pricing requirements calculated by the Paid Equity Tool are
not met, an increase is required. According to the calculations it is necessary to increase our lunch prices.
Current Meal prices for 2015-2016 
Elementary-$2.50
Secondary-$2.75
Adult-$3.50

Required USDA Lunch Prices for 2016-2017 
Elementary-$2.75                                              
Secondary-$3.00
Adults-$3.75

Reduced prices are always the same.
Breakfast-$.30
Lunch -$.40

Breakfast prices will remain the same.
All Students-$1.50
Adult-$1.85
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North Little Academy 

Summer School Proposal

April 5, 2016

1 – Teacher 

20 days (5 weeks)  

6 hours per day (120 hours total)

$25 per hour

$3000

1 – Paraprofessional

20 days (5 weeks)

6 hours per day (120 hours)

$16 per hour

$1920

Total - $4920

Note: Special Services will provide 3 hours of services for SPED
students during summer school.

.5 – Teacher

20 days (5 weeks)

3 hours per day (60 hours)

$25 per hour

$1500
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Creating Administrative 
Math/Science/Literacy Positions
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Elementary & Secondary 
Math Instructional Specialist 
Positions
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2015 PARCC 3-5 Math % Met 
Expectations

Grade 3 Grade 4 Grade 5
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NLRSD STATE PARCC Consortium

2 of 9 elementary schools are Focus. 1 of 2 Focus schools met Year 1 
Exit Criteria.
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2015 PARCC 6-8 Math % Met 
Expectations
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1 of 2 secondary schools are Focus. NLRMS did not meet Year 1 Exit 
Criteria.
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2015 PARCC NLRHS Math % Met 
Expectations

Algebra I Geometry
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Why the need?

Curriculum Alignment
Leader, Teacher & Student Support
Student Centered Professional Development
Innovative Best Practices
Personalized Learning
New Standards & Assessments
Data Literacy
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Elementary & Secondary 
Science Instructional 
Specialist Positions
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2015 ACTAAP 5 Science % 
Pro./Adv.
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2015 ACTAAP 7 Science % 
Pro./Adv.

Grade 7
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2015 ACTAAP Biology % 
Pro./Adv.
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Why the need?

Curriculum Alignment
Leader, Teacher & Student Support
Student Centered Professional Development
Innovative Best Practices
Personalized Learning
Next Gen Science Standards 
New Assessments
Data Literacy Packet page 107 of 147



Secondary Literacy 
Specialist Position 
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2015 PARCC 6-8 Literacy % Met 
Expectations
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1 of 2 secondary schools are Focus. NLRMS did not meet Year 1 Exit 
Criteria.
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2015 PARCC NLRHS Literacy % Met 
Expectations
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0

5

10

15

20

25

30

35

40

27

20

36 37
40

37

NLRSD STATE PARCC Consortium
Packet page 110 of 147



2016 PARCC NLRHS STAR Grade 
Equivalent Pre-Test to Mid-Yr

NLRMS NLRHS
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2016 PARCC NLRHS STAR Instructional 
Reading Level (IRL) Pre-Test to Mid-Yr

NLRMS NLRHS
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Why the need?

Curriculum Alignment
Leader, Teacher & Student Support
Student Centered Professional Development
Innovative Best Practices
New Standards & Assessments
Data Literacy
Conversion Charter

Packet page 113 of 147



NLRSD ACT Scores from 2014 to 2015 
for Students in Gr. 12

Reading English Math Science Composite
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NSLA Funding & Title I
• Use of Money-Can

▫ Support Staff (These 
Positions of Instructional 
Specialist)

▫ Above what is required 
Materials & Supplies to 
improve student 
achievement

▫ After School & Summer 
School

▫ Student Computers
▫ Professional Development

• Use of Money-Can’t
▫ No Classroom Teachers 

that are required
▫ Teacher computers
▫ Anything that is required 

by ADE Standards for 
Accreditation 
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**August 17, 2015 ‐ NLR First Day of School** NORTH LITTLE ROCK SCHOOL DISTRICT

PROJECT COMPLETION MILESTONES ‐ UPDATE

NLR School District ‐ Projects

Contract 

Substantial 

Completion

PROJECTED 

Substantial 

Completion

Crestwood Elem School 05/19/16 05/19/16

* Phase 1 ‐ A ‐ 2 Story Add C of O

* Phase 2 ‐ C ‐ Fire Prot Complete

* Phase 2 ‐ B ‐ Admin 02/12/16

* Phase 2 ‐ B ‐ Gym / Kitchen 03/11/16

* Phase 3 ‐ Demo Exst Cafe 05/19/15

* Site Work 05/19/16

7th Street Elem School 02/29/16 02/29/16

* Area E ‐ Gymnasium 12/18/15

* Area A ‐ Kindergarten / Pre‐K C of O

* Area D ‐ Classroom C of O

* Area B ‐ Multipurpose / Cafeteria C of O

* Area C ‐ Classroom 02/29/16

* Miscellaneous Site Work 03/18/16

NLR High School 12/02/16 12/02/16

* Athletic Stadium 09/09/14 C of O

* SLC 1 ‐ Tower A and B 04/03/15 C of O

* SLC 2 ‐ Tower C and D 12/02/16 C of O

* Cafeteria / Kitchen 12/02/16 04/01/16

* Commons / Downstairs Dining 12/02/16 09/08/16

* Upstairs Dining 12/02/16 01/04/16 Complete

* Performing Arts Center 12/02/16 09/08/16

* Admin / Gymnasium 12/02/16 09/08/16
* Remaining Site / Park 12/02/16 12/02/16
* Main Street Road Widening 12/02/16 Complete

NLR Middle School ‐ Cafeteria 08/01/16 08/01/16
* New Kitchen Turn Over 04/11/16
* Dining Room Renovations 08/01/16

Have Certificate of Occupancy

Have Certificate of Occupancy

Have Certificate of Occupancy

Have Certificate of Occupancy

2185

Project Completion Milestones

AS OF JANUARY 28, 2016

2182

2184

2186

Notes / Comments

Have Certificate of Occupancy

Have Certificate of Occupancy

Have Certificate of Occupancy

Project Milestones - Update Page 1 of 1 1/28/2016

Packet page 132 of 147

estesj
Text Box
Ridgeroad Elementary

    *   3rd Grade                                                                                     Complete
    *   Upstairs Demo                                                                              Started

estesj
Line
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