Part F.1 - Catalog Discount for Items in a Commercially

Available Catalog

—
Association of Educational AEPA #020-B Carpet and Resilient Flooring

PURCHASING AGENCIES

Bidding Company Name: The Gillespie Group, Inc.

Name of Catalog:
(This must be the catalog in effect as of
the bid date)

Note: Groupings to be defined by Bidder and can be by sub-category, manufacturer, etc.

PartF.1 is a REQUIRED FORM

No. |[Grouping of Discount DlSCOElnt Offel:ed for Comments
This Grouping
1 |J +] Flooring Group 5% For carpet & flooring
2 |Acrylicon 5%
3 |Altro 10%
4 |Ardex 12%
5 |Armstrong 20%
6 |Forbo 5%
7 [Nora 5%
8 [Protective Industrial Polymers 10%
9 |Regupol America 7%
10 [Tarkett Johnsonite Product Price List 10%
Wall Base-Transitions-Rubber Tile-
Treads

11 |Uzin Product Catalog/Price List 5%
12 |Taraflex (Thor) 5%
13 |Boen Sports 20%
14
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No. Manufacturer Catalog/Price List Catalog/Price List Date Mam;fla(\fjturer VZ’;‘;‘;:;:E:: )(lf I\/(ljel:stlflfe Cat::-(iwcgehst Bl:grlzgf;l;;t NeBti;Eflf:ic;ve Comments No.
1 |EXAMPLE Atlas Carpet Mills Product Catalog/Price List 2019 sY $XX.00 20.0% $X.00 1
2 |EXAMPLE Atlas Anatolia Broadloom (pgs. 21-26) AC10015258 SY $XX.00 20.0% $X.00 2
3 |EXAMPLE Atlas Ambrosia Broadloom (pgs. 16-20) AAB1001530 SY $XX.00 15.0% $X.00 3
4 |Aladdin Aladdin Commercial Carpet Price List June 2019 $ - NO BID 4

5 [Atlas Carpet Mills Atlas Carpet Mills Product Catalog/Price List 4/8/2019 2019 $ = NO BID 5

6 |Bentley Bentley Price List 2019 $ - NO BID 6

7 __|EF Contract EF Contract Catalog Pricing March 2019 $ = NO BID 7
9 |Interface Interface Carbon Neutral Flooring Price List May 2019 $ - NO BID 9
10 ] +]J Flooring Group ] + ] Flooring Group Product Catalog/Price List 2019 SY 5.0% $ - SEE ATTACHED CATALOG 10
11 |Kraus Flooring Kraus Catalog/Price List April 2019 $ - NO BID 11
12 |Mannington Mannington Product Catalog/Price List 2019 $ = NO BID 12
13 |Masland Carpet Masland Contract Product Catalog/Price List April 2019 $ = NO BID 13
14 |Mats Inc. Mats Inc. Price List (Excludes Matting Products) November 2018 $ - NO BID 14
15 |Milliken Milliken Product Catalog/Price List 1/25/2019 2019 $ - NO BID 15
16 [Mohawk Group Mohawk Group Product Catalog/Mohawk Carpet Price List April 2019 $ = NO BID 16
17 |Next Floor Next Floor Product Catalog/Price List June 2019 $ - NO BID 17
18 |Patcraft Carpet Tile Patcraft Carpet Tile Products Price List March 2019 $ = NO BID 18
19 |Patcraft Broadloom Patcraft Broadloom Products Price List March 2019 $ - NO BID 19
20 |Peerless Balsan Peerless Balsan Price List 2019 $ - NO BID 20
21 |Peerless Broadloom Peerless Broadloom Price List 2019 $ = NO BID 21
22 |Peerless City Tiles Peerless City Collection Price List 2019 $ - NO BID 22
23 |Peerless DI Design Peerless DI Design Price List 2019 $ - NO BID 23
24 |Pentz Commercial Flooring Solutions/Pentz Price List 1/1/2019 April 2019 $ = NO BID 24
25 Philadelphia Commercial Philadelphia Commercial Product Catalog/Carpet Price List June 2019 $ ° NO BID 25
26 [Shaw Contract Shaw Contract Product Catalog/Price List 2019 $ - NO BID 26
27 _|Tarkett Tandus-Centiva Tarkett Tandus-Centiva Price List 4/1/2019 2019 $ - NO BID 27
28 |Van Gelder Van Gelder Your Source Book Vol. 18 2018 $ - NO BID 28
29 |Van Gelder Van Gelder Product Price List 2019 $ - NO BID 29
30 $ - 30
31 $ - 31
32 $ - 32
33 $ - 33
34 $ - 34
35 $ - 35
36 $ - 36
37 $ - 37
38 $ - 38
39 $ - 39
40 $ - 40
41 $ - 41
42 $ - 42
43 $ - 43
44 $ - 44
45 $ - 45
46 $ - 46
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q n . . Manufacturer | Vendor SKU (if | Unitof | Catalog List|Bid Discount| Net Effective
h Manufacturer h
No. ufactu Catalog/Price List Catalog/Price List Date SKU applicable) Measure Price Percentage Bid Price Comments No.
47 $ = 47
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No. Manufacturer Catalog/Price List Catalog/Price List Date Mam;fla(\;turer VZ’;‘;‘;:;:E:: )(lf I\/(ljel:stlflfe Cat::-(i)cgehst B;g:zgf;‘;;t NeBti;Eflf:ic;ve Comments No.

1 |EXAMPLE Acrylicon Product Catalog/Price List 1-May-19 SF $XX.00 20.0% $X.00 1

2 |EXAMPLE Acrylicon Flake System (pgs. 40-45) AC10015258 SF $XX.00 20.0% $X.00 2

3 |EXAMPLE Acrylicon Lacquer System (pgs. 46-50) AAB1001530 SF $XX.00 15.0% $X.00 3

4 |Aacer Aacer Catalog/Price List 5/15/2019 $ = NO BID 4

5 Acrylicon Acrylicon Product Catalog/Price List May 1, 2019 SF 5.0% $ - SEE ATTACHED CATALOG 5

6 | Action Floor Systems Action Floors Systems Price List May 2019 $ - NO BID 6

7 |Aladdin Aladdin Commercial Flooring Price List May 2019 $ o NO BID 7

9 |Allied Allied Price List 9/24/2018 $ - NO BID 9
10 |Altro Floors & Walls Altro Floors & Walls Product Catalog/Price List 4/1/2019 SY, SF, EA 10.0% $ = SEE ATTACHED CATALOG 10
11 | American Biltrite Flooring American Biltrite Flooring Product Catalog/Price List 2019 $ - NO BID 11
12 | American Olean American Olean Product Price List 3/8/2019 $ - NO BID 12
13 | American Tile American Tile Product Catalog/Price List Apri 1,2016 $ - NO BID 13
14 |Ardex Ardex Product Catalog/Price List 1/15/2019 EA 12.0% $ = SEE ATTACHED CATALOG 14
15 |Armorpoxy Price List Armorproxy Price List 1/1/2019 $ = NO BID 15
16 |Armstrong Armstrong Product Catalog/Price List 4/1/2019 SF.LF, EA 20.0% $ - SEE ATTACHED CATALOG 16
17 |Ava Ava Catalog/Price List 2/14/2019 $ - NO BID 17
18 |Bentley Bentley Price List 2019 $ - NO BID 18
20 |Boss Flooring Boss LVT Product Catalog/Boss Flooring Price List 9/7/2017 2019 $ = NO BID 20
21 |Burke Flooring Burke Flooring Product Catalog/Price List November 6, 2017 $ = NO BID 21
22 |Capri Capri: Fitness & Rec List Price 1/1/2019 $ - NO BID 22
23 | CBC Flooring-Toli/Halo/Takiron CBC Flooring Toli/Halo/Takiron Product Catalog/Price List 10| 2019 $ - NO BID 23
24 |Centaur Centaur Catalog/Price List 1/1/2019 $ - NO BID 24
25 |CMP Specialty Products CMP Specialty Products Product Catalog/Price List 1/15/2019 $ - NO BID 25
26 |Cobalt Surfaces Katanga Loose Lay - Glue Down LVT/Cobalt Price List 4-30-19 May 2019 $ ° NO BID 26
27 |Cobalt Surfaces HushCore Engineered LVT Plank/Cobalt Price List 4-30-19 May 2019 $ ° NO BID 27
28 |Cobalt Surfaces Tangent LVT/Cobalt Price List 4-30-19 2019 $ - NO BID 28
29 |Congoleum Tile Congoleum Tile Product Catalog/Price List 10/29/2018 $ - NO BID 29
30 [DuraCryl International/Corques Corques Liquid Lino by Michael Halibean L10 Pricing 5/1/2019 $ - NO BID 30
31 |Ecore Ecore Product Catalog/Price List January 2019 $ ° NO BID 31
32 |EF. Contract E.F. Contract Catalog/Price List March 29, 2019 $ - NO BID 32
33 |Expanko-Stonhard Stonhard-Expanko Product Catalog/Price List 5/15/2019 $ - NO BID 33
34 |Flexco Flexco Product Catalog/Price List July 1,2018 $ - NO BID 34
35 |FloorFolio FloorFolio List Price 1/1/2019 $ ° NO BID 35
36 |Florock Florock Pricing Guide February 2019 $ - NO BID 36
37 |Forbo SF, SY, LF, 5.0% $ ° SEE ATTACHED CATALOG 37

Forbo Product Catalog/Price List 1/1/2019 EA

38 |Gerflor Thor Gerflor Product Catalog/Price List January 2019 $ - NO BID 38
39 |Halex/Kovara GCP-Halex/Kovara Product Catalog/Price List 10/15/2018 $ - NO BID 39
40 |Interface Interface LVT Catalog/Price List May 2019 $ - NO BID 40
41 |IVCTile & Linoleum IVC Tile & Linoleum Product Catalog/IVC Seamless solutions P| January 2019 $ - NO BID 41
42 |] &] Flooring Group / Engineered  [1&] Flooring Group /Engineered Floors Product Catalog/Price | 2019 SF 5.0% $ = SEE ATTACHED CATALOG 42
43 |Junckers Junckers Product Catalog/Price List January 2019 $ - NO BID 43
44 |Kahr's Kahr's Price List 2/1/2019 $ - NO BID 44
45 |Karndean Design Flooring Karndean Design Flooring Product Catalog/Price List April 2019 $ - NO BID 45
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No. Manufacturer Catalog/Price List Catalog/Price List Date Mam;f;;turer vz‘;‘:)?:c:lb(ﬂ )(lf B;Jel::::e Catlz::-(i)cgehst Bl::rl:zf;‘;:t N;:(Ef;:ic:ve Comments No.
46 |Kolay Flooring Kolay Flooring Catalog/Price List 2019 $ - NO BID 46
47 |Kraus Kraus Catalog/Price List April 2019 $ - NO BID 47
48 |Liquid Elements-Stonhard Stonhard-Liquid Elements Product Catalog/Price List 5/15/2019 $ - NO BID 48
49 |Lonseal Flooring Lonseal Flooring Catalog/Lonseal Price List 4/1/2019 June 2018 $ - NO BID 49
50 [Mannington Mannington Product Catalog/Price List 2019 $ - NO BID 50
51 [Mapei Mapei Product Catalog/Price List 1/1/2019 $ - NO BID 51
52 |Marazzi Marazzi Price List 3/8/2019 $ ° NO BID 52
53 |Masland Masland Contract Product Catalog/Price List 4/1/2019 $ - NO BID 53
54 |Mats Inc. (Excludes Matting Mats Inc. Price List (Excludes Matting Products) November 2018 $ - NO BID 54
55 |Milliken Milliken Product Catalog/Price List 1/25/2019 2019 $ = NO BID 55
56 |Mohawk Mohawk Product Catalog/Mohawk Flooring Price List April 2019 $ - NO BID 56
57 |MSI MSI Product Presentation/MSI Price List 3/12/2018 2019 $ = NO BID 57
58 |Musson Rubber Co. Stair & Floor Coverings,Entry Flooring,Raised Design $ o NO BID 58

Tile,Vinyl Stair Treads/Price List NO.90A Musson Rubber

Products 7/31/2017 2018
59 |Musson Rubber Co. Entrance Mats Product Catalog/PRICE LIST NO. 90A Musson R 2018 $ - NO BID 59
60 |Musson Rubber Co. Musson Commercial Matting Catalog/Price List NO.90A Musso| 2018 $ - NO BID 60
61 |Next Floor Next Floor Product Catalog/Price List June 10, 2019 $ - NO BID 61
62 |Nora Nora Product Catalog/Price List 3/6/2019 SF, LF, EA 5.0% $ - SEE ATTACHED CATALOG 62
63 |[Nydree Nydree Catalog/Price List November 15, 2018 $ - NO BID 63
64 |Parterre Avara Luxury Vinyl Floor & Storri Luxury Vinyl/Parterre Price| 2018 $ - NO BID 64
65 |Patcraft Static Dissipative Porcelain [Ppatcraft Resilient Static Dissipative Porcelain Price List 3/27/2019 $ - NO BID 65
66 | Patcraft Porcelain and Ceramic Patcraft Porcelain and Ceramic Products Price List 3/27/2019 $ - NO BID 66
67 |Patcraft Resilient Products Patcraft Resilient Products Price List 3/27/2019 $ = NO BID 67
68 |Philadephia Commercial Philadephia Commercial Product Catalog/Flooring Price List 6/1/2019 $ - NO BID 68
69 |Polyflor Polyflor Catalog/Price List 2018 $ = NO BID 69
70 |Procedo Procedo Product Catalog/Price List 2019 $ = NO BID 70
71 |Protective Industrial Polymers Protective Industrial Polymer Price List 1/9/2017 SF, EA 10.0% $ - SEE ATTACHED CATALOG 71
72 |Raskin Raskin Product Catalog/Price List April 18, 2019 $ - NO BID 72
73 |Regupol America Regupol America Product Catalog/Price List January 2019 SF 7.0% $ = SEE ATTACHED CATALOG 73
74 _|Rickett Rickett Catalog/Price List 1/1/2019 $ - NO BID 74
75 |Roppe Roppe Product Catalog June 29,2018 $ = NO BID 75
76 __|Schdnox Schénox Catalog/Price List August 2018 $ = NO BID 76
77 _|Shannon Specialty Floors Shannon Specialty Floors/Price List Feb 27,2019 $ - NO BID 77
78 |Shaw Shaw Contract Product Catalog/Price List 2019 $ = NO BID 78
79 |Sika Subfloor Prep & Floor Bonding Systems Product Guide/Price L 1/14/2019 $ = NO BID 79
80 |Six Degrees Six Degrees LVT Price List 4/30/2019 $ - NO BID 80
81 |Southwind Southwind Product CatalogSouthwind Price List June 10, 2019 $ - NO BID 81
82 |Spectrum Spectrum Flooring Catalog/Spectrum Rigid Core Price List $ - NO BID 82

5/1/2019 2019
83 [Stonhard Stonhard Product Catalog/Price List 5/15/2019 $ g NO BID 83
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Part F.3 - Support Product Price Schedule

AEPA #020-B Carpet and Resilient Flooring

T ——

Association of Educational Bidding Company Name: The Gillespie Group, Inc.
Part F.3 is a REQUIRED FORM
Description Unit Of Measure | List Price | Discount Net Ef;ifctlve el Comment

Furnish 1/4" Cement Board SF NA

Furnish 1/2" Cement Board SF NA

1/4" Plywood SF s  1.08] 20% |[$ 0.90
1/2" Plywood SF $ 150 20% | $ 1.25
3/4" Plywood SF s 210| 20% |[$ 1.75
Floating Plywood Subfloor SF S 3.00] 20% |$ 2.50
Pinned Plywood Subfloor SF $ 960) 20% |$ 8.00
Cove Base Adhesive EA S 6.00] 20% |$ 5.00
Cove Base Tip Applicator EA $ 12.00 20% $ 10.00
Integral Cove Base - inside corner EA NA

Integral Cove Base - outside Corner EA NA

Integral Cove Base with vinyl cap LF NA

4" Rubber Cove Base LF S 1.26 20% | $ 1.05
6" Rubber Cove Base LF $ 180 20% | $ 1.50
4" Vinyl Cove Base LF S 1.08 20% $ 0.90
6" Vinyl Cove Base LF S 1.68 20% $ 1.40
4" Vinyl Millwork Base LF S 312 20% $ 2.60
6" Vinyl Millwork Base LF S 468 20% $ 3.90
8" Vinyl Millwork Base LF S 6.60 20% $ 5.50
Carpet Tile Adhesive - 4 gallon EA $ 132.00] 20% |$ 110.00
Cork SY S 90.00 20% $ 75.00
Dumpster 30 yd EA $ 960.00 20% | $ 800.00
Epoxy Coating SF S 072 20% |$ 0.60
Feather Finish - 10 Ibs. EA S 24.00 20% $ 20.00
Fiberglass Reinforcement SF S 1.50 20% $ 1.25
Floor wax Gallon S 156.00 20% $ 130.00
Grout Bag NA

Latex Underlayment - 25 lbs. EA NA

LVT Spray Adhesive EA $ 54.00 20% | $ 45.00




Net Effective Bid

Description Unit Of Measure | List Price | Discount Price Comment
Marble floor saddles - 2" LF NA
Marble floor saddles - 4" LF NA
Marble floor saddles - 6" LF NA
Marble Saddle Custom LF NA
Marble/Granite Slab SF NA
Marmoleum roll goods SY S 31.20 20% $ 26.00
Marmoleum Tile SF S 5.28 20% $ 4.40
Mastic SF NA
Metal door saddle LF S 48.00 20% $ 40.00
Metal reducer/transition strips LF S 24.00 20% $ 20.00
Metal stair nosing LF S 30.00 20% $ 25.00
Metal Stair tread LF NA
Pins SF S 0.12 20% $ 0.10
Polyurethane - oil based EA S 528.00 20% $ 440.00
Polyurethane - water based EA S 588.00 20% $ 490.00
Quarter Round (Vinyl or Wood) LF S 3.00 20% $ 2.50
Resinous 20 mil urethane top coat SF S 1.08 20% $ 0.90
Risers LF S 1.80 20% $ 1.50
Rubber Reducer LF S 1.44 20% $ 1.20
Rubber stair nosing LF S 6.00 20% $ 5.00
Self-level - 50 Ib. bag EA S 42.00 20% $ 35.00
Sluder Strips LF S 21.60 20% $ 18.00
Stair tread w/integrated riser LF S 26.40 20% $ 22.00
Stair treads LF S 19.20 20% $ 16.00
Stone Slab - custom finish edge LF NA
Stringers LF S 7.20 20% $ 6.00
Tredmor Padding SYy S 11.40 20% $ 9.50
Vapor Barrier Plastic 10 Mil SF S 018 20% $ 0.15
VCT Adhesive - 4 gallon EA S 72.00 20% $ 60.00
Versa Shield - v560 (720 sf) EA NA
Versa Shield - V560 MBX (720 sf) EA NA
Versa Shield - VSM tape 2" - 180 LF EA NA
Versa Shield BSM tape 4" - 100 If EA NA
Versashield - vapor barrier/waterproof membrane SF NA
Vinyl Reducer LF S 1.32 20% $ 1.10

Other Support Services Offered




Description

Unit Of Measure

List Price

Discount

Net Effective Bid
Price

Comment




Part F.4 - State Multiplier & Labor Rates

AEPA IFB #020-B Carpet and Resilient Flooring

The Gillespie Group, Inc.

INSTRUCTIONS: For each of the states listed below provide your multiplier/factor (wage and transportation) to be applied to the Net Effective Bid Pricing (shown
in F.1) provided to arrive at the individual AEPA state price for each item. Complete all tables on this form, including all cost factors and service rates for
installation services, if provided.

T —
Association of Educational

PURCHASING AGENCIES

Bidding Company Name:

Part F.4 is a REQUIRED FORM

Wages - Percentage added to the Catalog
CA State
Multiplier
0.00%

IA State
Multiplier
0.00%

IL State
Multiplier
0.00%

KS State
Multiplier
0.00%

KY State
Multiplier
0.00%

MA State
Multiplier
0.00%

MI State
Multiplier
0.00%

MN State
Multiplier
0.00%

MO State
Multiplier
0.00%

CO State
Multiplier
0.00%

CT State
Multiplier
0.00%

FL State
Multiplier
0.00%

GA State
Multiplier

0.00%

. IN State Multiplier
Project types

0.00%

Non-prevailing wage project: 15.00%
Prevailing wage project: 15.00%
Davis Bacon wage project: 15

OH State
Multiplier
0.00%

OR State
Multiplier
0.00%

PA State
Multiplier
0.00%

TX State
Multiplier
0.00%

VA State
Multiplier
0.00%

WA State
Multiplier
0.00%

WV State
Multiplier
0.00%

WI State
Multiplier
0.00%

WY State
Multiplier
0.00%

MT State
Multiplier

NE State
Multiplier
0.00%

NJ State
Multiplier
0.00%

NM State
Multiplier
0.00%

ND State
Multiplier
0.00%

Project types
0.00%

Non-prevailing wage project: 15.00% 15.00% 15.00%
Prevailing wage project: 15.00% 15.00% 15.00%
Davis Bacon wage project: 15 15 15

Product Description Unit of Measure Bid Price Comments
Description of Cost Factors
Per diem rate - meals and lodging per 24 hour period Per Day $ 300.00
Performance and payment bond - bonding rate (percent of project) Percent 3%
Bonding capacity - total amount of capacity available Dollar Amount $  23,329,648.00
Unit of Measure Bid Price 2nd Shift Overtime Time & 1/2 Overtime Comments

Pickup of Existing Flooring
1/4" Plywood SF $ 150 | $ 175 | $ 2.25
1/2" Plywood SF $ 250 [ ¢ 3.00 [ ¢ 3.50
3/4" Plywood SF $ 290 | $ 340 | $ 4.50
Carpet on VAT SY $ 8.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 12.00
Carpet Tile Urethane Cushion Back SY $ 4.00 [ § 5.00]$ 6.00
Cement Backer Board SF $ 350 $ 4.00 [ $ 6.00
Ceramic & Porcelain tile SF $ 3251 % 3751 8% 4.50
Ceramic Wall Base LF $ 3.00 | $ 4.00 [ $ 6.00
Ceramic Wall tile SF $ 3251 $ 3751 8% 4.50
Cove Base 4", 6" & carpet base LF $ 025 | $ 035 | $ 0.55
Cushion backed carpet roll SY $ 650 | $ 8251 % 10.00
Double Glue Down Carpet & Pad SY $ 7.00 | $ 850 | $ 11.00
Glue Down Action Bac & Carpet Tile (Vinyl Back) SY $ 4.00 [ § 5.00]$ 6.00
Hardwood Floors SF $ 3.00 | $ 330 $ 3.90
Remove cut back adhesive with solvent SF $ 200 ] $ 2501 $ 3.25
Remove Epoxy Flooring SF $ 4.00 [ § 5.00]$ 6.00
Removal of Mastic - Dry Scrape SF $ 200 $ 2501 $ 3.00
Removal of Mastic - Wet Scrape SF $ 250 $ 3.00 | $ 3.50




Removal of Pins SF $ 0751 $ 1.00 | $ 1.25
Rubber tile SF $ 2.00 | $ 250 | $ 3.00
Solid vinyl tile SF $ 125 [ $ 150 [ $ 2.00
Stair Nosing LF $ 075 ] $ 1.00 | $ 1.25
Stringers LF $ 125 [ $ 150 [ $ 2.00
Tack & Pad SY $ 475 ] $ 550 | $ 6.00
Terazzo Tile 1/8" & 3/16" SF $ 250 | $ 3.00 | $ 3.50
Treads LF $ 6.00 | $ 7.00 | $ 8.00
VAT friable removal SF $ 15.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 25.00
VAT non-friable removal SF $ 550 | $ 6.00 | $ 7.00
VCT SF $ 075 | $ 1.00 | $ 1.25
VCT/Sheet Vinyl (Per Layer) SF $ 1.20 | $ 150 [ $ 2.00
Labor rate to perform work not covered by price list above HR $ 135.00 | $ 165.00 | $ 200.00
Disposal of Existing Flooring
1/4" Plywood SF $ 1.00 | $ 125 | $ 1.50
1/2" Plywood SF $ 1.20 | $ 1.60 | $ 2.00
3/4" Plywood SF $ 140 | $ 1.80 | $ 2.50
Carpet on VAT SY $ 1.75 [ NA NA
Carpet Tile Urethane Cushion Back SY $ 2.00 | $ 250 | $ 3.00
Ceramic & porcelain tile SF $ 1.00 | $ 150 [ $ 2.00
Ceramic cove base LF $ 0251 $ 050 | $ 1.00
Ceramic wall tile SF $ 1.00 | $ 150 | $ 2.00
Cove Base 4", 6" & carpet base LF $ 050 | $ 075 | $ 1.00
Cut back adhesive SF $ 0.75 | NA NA
Double Glue Down Carpet & Pad SY $ 2.50 | $ 3.00 | $ 4.00
Glue Down Action Bac & Carpet Tile (Vinyl Back) SY $ 1.00 | $ 150 [ $ 2.00
Hardwood SF $ 1.00 | $ 150 | $ 2.00
Mastic SF $ 0.75 [ NA NA
Recycling SF $ 0.75 | NA NA
Risers LF $ 015 ] $ 0.20 | $ 0.30
Stair Nosing LF $ 045 | $ 0.60 | $ 0.90
Stringers LF $ 015 ] $ 020 ] $ 0.30
Tack & Pad SY $ 2.50 | $ 3.00 | $ 4.00
Treads LF $ 150 | $ 1751 $ 2.25
VCT, rubber, Fritz & solid vinyl (Per Layer) SF $ 0751 $ 1.00 | $ 1.50
Labor rate to perform work not covered by price list above HR $ 135.00 | $ 165.00 | $ 200.00
Furniture Moving
Book Packing/Reloading- per L.F. shelving (inc. boxes) LF $ 8.80 | $ 10.25 | § 13.20
Cost to move fully loaded starter add-on metal type shelving LF $ 250.00 | $ 375.00 | $ 500.00
Cubicle PER UNIT $ 500.00 | $ 750.00 | $ 1,000.00
Dismantle and Reassemble Furniture HR $ 150.00 | $ 180.00 | $ 210.00
Freestanding SY $ 12.00 | $ 16.00 | $ 20.00
Install Theater Seating - per seat EA $ 90.00 | $ 120.00 | $ 150.00
Remove Theater Seating - per seat EA $ 40.00 | $ 60.00 | $ 80.00
Retro-fit under systems SY $ 20.00 | $ 25.00 | $ 30.00
Labor rate to perform work not covered by price list above HR $ 135.00 | $ 165.00 | $ 200.00
Floor Prep & Related Services
Anti-microbial treatment SF $ 0751 $ 1.00 | $ 1.25
Concrete Grinding SF $ 315 ] $ 365] % 4.75
Cross Scarification SF $ 4.00 [ § 5.00]$ 6.00
Fiberglass Reinforcement SF $ 840 | $ 9.66 | $ 12.60
Moisture sealer SF $ 315 ] $ 3751 8% 4.50




Moisture Testing PER TEST $ 150.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 150.00
Mud job NO BID NA NA NA

Priming floor for improved bonding SF $ 0.50 | $ 0751 $ 1.00
Self-leveling 1/8" - 1/4" SF $ 250 | $ 310 | $ 4.00
Self-leveling 1/4" - 1/2" SF $ 4251 $ 5.00 | $ 6.00
Shotblast-Per Layer* (1/16" - 1/8") *Excludes lead paint removal@ SF $ 215 ] $ 2.65 ] $ 3.10
Skim Coat Per Coat SF $ 1251 $ 1751 $ 2.25
Labor rate to perform work not covered by price list above HR $ 135.00 | $ 165.00 | $ 200.00

Floor Maintenance

Apply wax per coat (includes wax) SF $ 1.50 [ $ 2.00 | $ 2.50
Dry cleaning method (carpet) SF $ 040 | $ 0.50 | $ 0.60
Grout and tile cleaning (ceramic & porcelain) SF $ 2.00 | $ 250 | $ 3.00
Grout Sealing SF $ 2.00 | $ 250 $ 3.00
Hot water extraction (carpet) SF $ 035 ] $ 040 | $ 0.50
Restorative Cleaning(includes pile lifting,spot removal,hot water extraction) NO BID NA NA NA

Strip wax SF $ 1.00 | $ 125 [ $ 1.50
Labor rate to perform work not covered by price list above HR $ 135.00 | $ 165.00 | $ 200.00

Installation

1/4" Cement Board NO BID NA NA NA

1/2" Cement Board NO BID NA NA NA

1/4" Plywood SF $ 2.80 | $ 320 | $ 4.00
1/2" Plywood SF $ 330 | $ 3.80 | $ 4.75
3/4" Plywood SF $ 3751 $ 425 1] $ 5.50
Floating Plywood Subfloor SF $ 9.60 | $ 990 | $ 10.50
Pinned Plywood Subfloor SF $ 10.20 | $ 10.50 | $ 11.10
3/16" Terrazzo tile SF $ 6.00 | $ 8.00 | $ 11.00
3/16" Terrazzo tile - 4" base LF $ 2.00 | $ 4.00 | $ 6.00
3/16" Terrazzo tile - Border Labor LF $ 4.00 | § 6.00 | $ 8.00
Epoxy Terrazzo NO BID NA NA NA

Terrazzo Polishing SF $ 1130 | $ 1350 | $ 15.66
4" cove base LF $ 115 | $ 132 ] $ 1.72
6" cove base LF $ 150 | $ 1751 $ 2.00
Resinous Cove - 4" LF $ 1575 | $ 18.11 | § 23.63
Resinous Cove - 6" LF $ 1890 | $ 2174 | $ 28.35
Integral Cove Base - Inside Corner EA $ 25.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 40.00
Integral Cove Base - Outside Corner EA $ 45.00 | $ 50.00 | $ 65.00
Integral Cove Base With Vinyl Cap LF $ 12.00 | $ 14.00 | $ 16.00
Vented Cove Base LF $ 750 | $ 850 | $ 9.50
4" Vinyl Base LF $ 1.15 [ $ 132 | $ 1.72
6 " Vinyl Base LF $ 1.50 | $ 175 [ $ 2.00
Solid Vinyl Base NO BID NA NA NA

ADA Compliant Rubber ramp Transition LF $ 54.00 | $ 75.00 | $ 100.00
BBT SF $ 2251 $ 285 ] $ 3.50
Binding LF $ 3.00 | $ 4.00 | § 5.00
Action Bac Broadloom Carpet SY $ 12.00 | § 14.00 | § 16.00
Carpet (Tile, Broadloom, 6' & DOW) - CUSTOM SY $ 12.00 | $ 14.00 | $ 16.00
Carpet (Tile, Broadloom, 6' & DOW) - no pattern SY $ 9.00 | $ 11.00 | § 14.00
Carpet Base (Capped or Bound) LF $ 3.00 | $ 4.00 | $ 4.50
Carpet Border Work LF $ 5251 $ 650 | $ 8.75
Carpet Broadloom Glue Down SY $ 10.00 | § 12.00 | § 15.00
Carpet Broadloom Tack and Pad SY $ 12.00 | § 14.00 | § 16.00
Carpet on walls SF $ 3.00 | $ 5.00 | $ 7.00




Ceramic/Porcelain - Floor Base NO BID NA NA NA

Ceramic/Porcelain - floor tile - Custom NO BID NA NA NA

Ceramic/Porcelain - floor tile - no pattern NO BID NA NA NA

Ceramic/Porcelain - Wall base NO BID NA NA NA

Ceramic/Porcelain - Wall Tile - custom NO BID NA NA NA

Ceramic/Porcelain - Wall Tile - no pattern NO BID NA NA NA

Ceramic/Porcelain slab NO BID NA NA NA

Click & Lock Flooring SF $ 2751 $ 3251 $ 4.50
Concrete Floor Shaving SF $ 4.00 | $ 5.00 | $ 6.00
Concrete Sealer SF $ 2.00 | $ 3.00 | $ 4.00
Coor Drill SF $ 1,200.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 1,750.00
Cork SY $ 50.00 | $ 75.00 | $ 100.00
Cut around bookcases & built-ins LF $ 3.00 | $ 4.00 | $ 5.00
Cutting up to existing library bookcases LF $ 3.00 | $ 4.00 [ $ 5.00
Drain cut out EA $ 2,500.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 3,500.00
Dumpster EA $ 800.00 | NA NA

Epoxy Coating SF $ 945 | $ 10.87 | $ 14.18
Flexible Membrane Floors SF $ 840 | $ 9.66 | $ 12.60
Floor Polishing SF $ 250 $ 3.00 | $ 3.50
Floor Sealing SF $ 2.00 | $ 3.00 | $ 4.00
Urethane Concrete Flooring SF $ 13.10 | $ 15.00 | $ 19.60
Fritz Tile SF $ 6.00 | $ 8.00 | $ 11.00
Generator Rental - Per Day EA $ 800.00 | NA NA

Glue Down Padding for double stick SY $ 6.00 | $ 8.00 | $ 10.00
Tack & Pad SY $ 6.00 | $ 8.00 | $ 10.00
Tredmor Pad SY $ 12.00 | $ 14.00 | $ 16.00
Hardwood SF $ 4.00 | § 5.00 | $ 6.00
Recoating Polyeurethane oil/water based SF $ 0.65 | $ 0.90 | $ 1.20
Refinish Hardwood SF $ 3.50 | $ 4.00 | $ 4.50
Sanding Hardwood - per pass SF $ 2.50 | $ 3.00 | $ 3.50
Sand & Finish Wood Floors SF $ 3.50 | $ 4.00 | $ 4.50
Screen & Finish Wood Floors SF $ 075 | $ 1.00 | $ 1.25
Screening Polyeurethane oil /water based SF $ 0.65 | $ 0.90 | $ 1.20
Heat Weld Seams LF $ 4.00 | § 5.00 | $ 6.00
LVT/ELVT SF $ 2.50 | $ 3.00 | $ 3.50
LVT/SVT - custom SF $ 2.50 | $ 3.00 | $ 3.50
LVT/SVT - no pattern SF $ 250 $ 3.00 | $ 3.50
LVT/SVT - borders SF $ 2.50 | $ 3.00 | $ 3.50
Marble Floor Saddles - 2" NO BID NA NA NA

Marble Floor Saddles - 4" NO BID NA NA NA

Marble Floor Saddles - 6" NO BID NA NA NA

Marble/Granite Slab NO BID NA NA NA

Mastic NO BID NA NA NA

Metal Saddles EA $ 95.00 | § 110.00 | $ 125.00
Metal Stair Nosing LF $ 12.00 | $ 14.00 | $ 18.00
Metal Transitions EA $ 90.00 | $ 105.00 | $ 120.00
Millwork Base LF $ 3.50 | $ 4.00 | $ 4.50
1" Mud Base NO BID NA NA NA

Pins (Per Pin) EA $ 042 | $ 0.50 | $ 0.66
Polishable overlays SF $ 30.00 | $ 40.00 | $ 50.00
Polished Concrete 400 SF $ 6.50 | $ 8.50 | $ 10.50
Polished Concrete 800 SF $ 8.50 | $ 1050 | $ 12.50
Polished Concrete 1500 SF $ 1050 | $ 1250 | $ 14.50




Polished Concrete Hardener/Densifier Application SF $ 8.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 12.00
Polished Concrete Pigment Application SF $ 10.00 | $ 12.00 | $ 14.00
Polished Concrete - Sealer with burnishing SF $ 350 | $ 4.00 | $ 5.00
Polished Concrete Surface Grinding NO BID NA NA NA

Polished Concrete Surface Polishing NO BID NA NA NA

Pouring of underlayment NO BID NA NA NA

Quarter Round (Vinyl or Wood) LF $ 3.00 | $ 450 | $ 6.00
Quartz Broadcast Floors SF $ 11.00 | $ 12.60 | $ 16.50
Quartz Slab NO BID NA NA NA

Quartz Tile SF $ 2.50 | $ 3.00 | $ 3.75
Resinous Flooring - 20 mil Urethane Top Coat SF $ 850 | $ 10.00 | $ 12.00
Resinous Flooring - 4" Integral Base LF $ 1575 | $ 1811 | $ 23.63
Resinous Flooring - 6" Integral Base LF $ 1890 | $ 2174 | $ 23.35
Resinous Flooring - AcryliCon - Minimum Jobs EA $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00
Resinous Flooring - Crack Repair LF $ 840 | $ 9.66 | $ 12.60
Resinous Flooring - Cutting and Filling Joints LF $ 1575 | $ 1811 | $ 23.63
Resinous Flooring - Double Broadcast SF $ 15.00 | $ 1750 | $ 22.50
Resinous Flooring - Fiberglass SF $ 840 | $ 9.66 | $ 12.60
Resinous Flooring - Flake Broadcast SF $ 11.00 | $ 1275 | $ 16.50
Resinous Flooring - Joint Caulk LF $ 840 | $ 9.66 | $ 12.60
Resinous Flooring - Pattern Work SF $ 10.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 20.00
Resinous Flooring - Pigmented Coating SF $ 945 | $ 1085 | $ 14.10
Resinous Flooring - Single Broadcast SF $ 11.00 | $ 1260 | $ 16.50
Resinous Flooring - Quartz Broadcast SF $ 11.00 | $ 1260 | $ 16.50
Resinous Flooring - Trowel Down SF $ 13.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 19.60
Resinous Flooring - Troweled Mortar SF $ 13.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 19.60
Risers LF $ 3.00 | $ 5.00 | $ 7.00
One Piece Stair Tread/Riser LF $ 12.50 | $ 15.00 | $ 20.00
Stair Treads LF $ 12.00 | $ 14.50 | $ 18.00
Stair tread with integrated riser LF $ 1250 | $ 15.00 | $ 20.00
Step Upholstery LF $ 10.00 | $ 12.00 | $ 14.00
Stringers LF $ 10.00 | $ 12.00 | $ 14.00
Runner on stairs EA $ 500.00 | $ 500.00 | $ 500.00
Interlocking Rubber Tile SF $ 350 | $ 4.00 [ $ 5.25
Rubber Roll SF $ 3.50 | $ 4.00 | § 5.25
2 Ply Rolled Rubber Sports Floor SF $ 8.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 12.00
Rubber Tile 1/8" Thick SF $ 2.50 | $ 3.00 | $ 3.50
Rubber Tile/Sheet - Less than 3/8" SF $ 3.00 | $ 3451 % 4.50
Rubber Tile Thicker than 1/8" SF $ 3.60 | $ 420 [ $ 5.50
Rubber Tile (weight room) SF $ 350 ] $ 4.00 [ $ 5.25
Serging LF $ 6.00 | $ 6.00 | $ 6.00
Schluter Strips LF $ 15.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 25.00
Stone Slab - custom finish edge NO BID NA NA NA

Border work sheet vinyl, rubber & marmoleum LF $ 500 | $ 7.00 | $ 10.00
Cushion Backed Sheet Vinyl SY $ 22.00 | $ 28.00 | $ 35.00
Sheet Vinyl & Sheet Linoleum SY $ 20.00 | $ 25.00 | $ 30.00
Stair Nosing Vinyl LF $ 7.50 | $ 10.00 | $ 12.00
Vinyl Reducers LF $ 350 | $ 550 $ 8.00
Luxury Vinyl Tile SF $ 250 | $ 3.00 | $ 3.75
Slip Resistant Vinyl Tile SF $ 250 $ 3.00 | $ 3.75
Solid Vinyl Tile SF $ 250 | $ 3.00 | $ 3.75
Transition LF $ 350 | $ 550 $ 8.00
VCT - no pattern SF $ 120 | $ 1751 $ 1.90
VCT - custom SF $ 2.00 | $ 3.00 | $ 5.00




Versashield - vapor barrier/waterproof membrane NO BID NA NA NA
Wall Cladding SF $ 31.00 | $ 36.00 | $ 40.00
Wire Lath NO BID NA NA NA
Delivery of material EA $ 250.00 | $ 350.00 | $ 500.00
Labor rate to perform work not covered by price list above HR $ 165.00 | $ 200.00
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