
Part F - Pricing Schedule - Interface Americas, Inc..xls/F.1 Catalog Discounts 11/27/2019

Bidding Company Name:

Name of Catalog:
(This must be the catalog in effect as of the bid date)

Part F.1 is a REQUIRED FORM

No. Grouping of Discount  Discount Offered for This Grouping Comments

1 Interface Carbon Neutral Modular Carpet - Line Item Pricing Varies by Style Line-Item Pricing offered. 
Freight Terms:  FOB Destination, Prepay and add to invoice.  

2 Interface Carbon Neutral LVT (Resilient Flooring) - Line Item Pricing Varies by Style Line-Item Pricing offered. 
Freight Terms:  FOB Destination, Prepay and add to invoice.  

3 Interface Carbon Neutral Rubber  (Resilient Flooring) - Line Item Pricing Varies by Style Line-Item Pricing offered. 
Freight Terms:  FOB Destination, Prepay and add to invoice.  
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Note: Groupings to be defined by Bidder and can be by sub-category, manufacturer, etc.

Interface Americas, Inc.

Interface Carbon Neutral Flooring 9/16/2019 to 12/31/2020

Part F.1 – Catalog Discount for Items in a 
Commercially Available Catalog

AEPA #020-B  Carpet and Resilient Flooring



Part F - Pricing Schedule - Interface Americas, Inc./F.2A CarpetProductPricing 11/27/2019

No.  Catalog/Price List Catalog/Price List Date Manufacturer 
SKU

Vendor SKU 
(if applicable)

Unit of 
Measure

 Catalog 
List Price 

Bid Discount 
Percentage

 Net Effective 
Bid Price  Comments No.

1 Interface Carbon Neutral Modular Carpet 9/16/2019 to 
12/31/2020

Freight Terms:  FOB Destination, Prepay and 
add to invoice.  Vendor Partner shall retain title 
and control of all goods until they are delivered 
and received.

1 A Peeling (50cm x 50cm) Modular Carpet Tile 1264502500 SY  $        93.26 58% 38.83$           1

2 Above Board (50cm x 50cm) Modular Carpet Tile 1236402500 SY  $        65.64 59% 27.02$           2

3 Above Board   (P) (25cm x 1m) Modular Carpet Tile 123640AK00 SY  $        68.23 54% 31.32$           3

4 Accent Flannel (50cm x 50cm) Modular Carpet Tile 1371102500 SY  $        66.09 58% 27.66$           4

5 AE310 (50cm x 50cm) Modular Carpet Tile 1388202500 SY  $        52.80 63% 19.57$           5

6 AE311 (25cm x 1m) Modular Carpet Tile 138830AK00 SY  $        52.80 63% 19.57$           6

7 AE312 (50cm x 50cm) Modular Carpet Tile 1389102500 SY  $        52.80 63% 19.57$           7

8 AE313 (25cm x 1m) Modular Carpet Tile 163110AK00 SY  $        52.80 63% 19.57$           8

9 AE315 (25cm x 1m) Modular Carpet Tile 163230AK00 SY  $        52.80 63% 19.57$           9

10 AE317 (25cm x 1m) Modular Carpet Tile 163270AK00 SY  $        52.80 63% 19.57$           10

11 Afternoon Light (25cm x 1m) Modular Carpet Tile 138980AK00 SY  $        57.12 64% 20.55$           11

12 Alliteration   (50cm x 50cm) Modular Carpet Tile 1391202500 SY  $        66.96 62% 25.42$           12

13 Alliteration (P) (50cm x 1m) Modular Carpet Tile 139120AB00 SY  $        74.32 59% 30.31$           13

14 B601 (50cm x 50cm) Modular Carpet Tile 126650250H SY  $      105.76 62% 39.78$           14

15 B602 (50cm x 50cm) Modular Carpet Tile 126670250H SY  $      101.00 63% 37.61$           15

16 B603 (50cm x 50cm) Modular Carpet Tile 126680250H SY  $        86.83 63% 32.33$           16

17 B701 (25cm x 1m) Modular Carpet Tile 126560AK0H SY  $        76.52 59% 31.68$           17

18 B702 (25cm x 1m) Modular Carpet Tile 126620AK0H SY  $        69.72 59% 28.55$           18

19 B703 (25cm x 1m) Modular Carpet Tile 124970AK00 SY  $        59.11 54% 27.43$           19

20 Bee's Knees (50cm x 50cm) Modular Carpet Tile 1427402500 SY  $      103.60 65% 36.77$           20

21 Berlin (50cm x 50cm) Modular Carpet Tile 1242202500 SY  $        63.42 58% 26.63$           21

22 Bertola (50cm x 50cm) Modular Carpet Tile 1231702500 SY  $        67.67 59% 27.98$           22

23 Blended (50cm x 50cm) Modular Carpet Tile 1248102500 SY  $        60.28 58% 25.39$           23

24 BP410 (25cm x 1m) Modular Carpet Tile 146850AK00 SY  $        53.76 64% 19.47$           24

25 BP411 (25cm x 1m) Modular Carpet Tile 146860AK00 SY  $        53.76 64% 19.47$           25

26 Brescia (50cm x 50cm) Modular Carpet Tile 146670250H SY  $        72.87 63% 27.13$           26

27 Broadleaf   (50cm x 50cm) Modular Carpet Tile 1234702500 SY  $        66.45 59% 27.42$           27

28 Broadleaf Loop (50cm x 50cm) Modular Carpet Tile 1471602500 SY  $        59.50 58% 24.79$           28

29 Broomed (50cm x 50cm) Modular Carpet Tile 1247902500 SY  $        60.38 58% 25.43$           29

30 Brownstone (P) (25cm x 1m) Modular Carpet Tile 139230AK00 SY  $        72.96 62% 27.81$           30

31 Brushed (50cm x 50cm) Modular Carpet Tile 1247802500 SY  $        60.38 58% 25.43$           31

32 Cambria (50cm x 50cm) Modular Carpet Tile 1264202500 SY  $        89.67 58% 37.61$           32

33 CE171 (25cm x 1m) Modular Carpet Tile 127950AK00 SY  $        58.52 58% 24.68$           33

34 CE172 (25cm x 1m) Modular Carpet Tile 138880AK00 SY  $        67.61 55% 30.44$           34

35 CE173 (25cm x 1m) Modular Carpet Tile 127960AK00 SY  $        75.79 55% 34.27$           35
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Part F.2A – Price Schedule                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                            
AEPA #020-B   Carpet

INSTRUCTIONS: Download the Net Effective Bid Price and respective information for all line items in 
the entire catalog.  Bidders may add additional lines as needed. Major manufacturers are listed. 
Additional carpet lines may be listed added. Please write "NO BID" in lines you are not responding to.  
No labor charges are to be included in this sheet. Please be sure to set the 'Print Area' PRIOR to 
submitting your bid response.

NOTE: The Net Effective Price MUST be consistent 
with the percentage discounts listed on the F.1 tab.  
Failure to have price correspond may be cause for 
rejection of your offer.

Part F.2A is a REQUIRED FORM

Bidding Company Name: Interface Americas, Inc. Catalog Name: Interface Carbon Neutral Flooring
9/16/2019 to 12/31/2020

Interface Americas, Inc.
Interface Americas, Inc.

Manufacturer
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Part F - Pricing Schedule - Interface Americas, Inc./F.2A CarpetProductPricing 11/27/2019

No.  Catalog/Price List Catalog/Price List Date Manufacturer 
SKU

Vendor SKU 
(if applicable)

Unit of 
Measure

 Catalog 
List Price 

Bid Discount 
Percentage

 Net Effective 
Bid Price  Comments No.Manufacturer

36 Chenille Warp (50cm x 50cm) Modular Carpet Tile 1462902500 SY  $        51.30 55% 23.12$           36

37 Circuit Board (25cm x 1m) Modular Carpet Tile 139300AK00 SY  $        84.47 62% 32.45$           37

38 Classic Seven (50cm x 50cm) Modular Carpet Tile 1394102500 SY  $        83.20 67% 27.81$           38

Interface Americas, Inc.
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Part F - Pricing Schedule - Interface Americas, Inc./ F.2B ResilientFlooringPricing 11/27/2019

No.  Catalog/Price List Catalog/Price 
List Date Manufacturer SKU Vendor SKU 

(if applicable)
Unit of 

Measure
 Catalog List 

Price 
Bid Discount 
Percentage

 Net Effective Bid 
Price  Comments No.

Interface Carbon Neutral LVT (Resilient Flooring) - Line Item Pricing 9/16/2019 to 
12/31/2020

Freight Terms:  FOB Destination, Prepay 
and add to invoice.  Vendor Partner shall 
retain title and control of all goods until 
they are delivered and received.

1 Steady Stride Woodgrains 3mm (25cm x 1m) Luxury Vinyl Tile B001 SF  $               4.60 60% 1.85$                  1

2 Steady Stride Concrete 3mm (50cm x 50cm) Luxury Vinyl Tile B002 SF  $               4.60 60% 1.85$                  2

3 Natural Stones 4.5mm (50cm x 50cm) Luxury Vinyl Tile A001 SF  $               7.20 60% 2.90$                  3

4 Natural Woodgrains 4.5mm (25cm x 1m) Luxury Vinyl Tile A002 SF  $               7.20 60% 2.90$                  4

5 Textured Stones 4.5mm (50cm x 50cm) Luxury Vinyl Tile A003 SF  $               7.20 60% 2.90$                  5

6 Textured Woodgrains 4.5mm (25cm x 1m) Luxury Vinyl Tile A004 SF  $               7.20 60% 2.90$                  6

7 Boundary Metallic 4.5mm (25cm x 1m) Luxury Vinyl Tile A006 SF  $               7.20 60% 2.90$                  7

8 Studio Set 4.5mm (25cm x 1m) Luxury Vinyl Tile A007 SF  $               7.20 60% 2.90$                  8

9 Native Fabric 4.5mm (50cm x 50cm) Luxury Vinyl Tile A008 SF  $               7.20 60% 2.90$                  9

10 Drawn Lines 4.5mm (25cm x 1m) Luxury Vinyl Tile A009 SF  $               7.20 60% 2.90$                  10

11 Walk Of Life 4.5mm (50cm x 50cm) Luxury Vinyl Tile A012 SF  $               7.20 60% 2.90$                  11

12 Walk The Aisle 4.5mm (50cm x 50cm) Luxury Vinyl Tile A013 SF  $               7.20 60% 2.90$                  12

13 Walk About 4.5mm (50cm x 50cm) Luxury Vinyl Tile A014 SF  $               7.20 60% 2.90$                  13

14 Walk On By 4.5mm (50cm x 50cm) Luxury Vinyl Tile A015 SF  $               7.20 60% 2.90$                  14

Interface Carbon Neutral Rubber (Resilient Flooring) - Line Item Pricing 9/16/2019 to 
12/31/2020

Freight Terms:  FOB Destination, Prepay 
and add to invoice.  Vendor Partner shall 
retain title and control of all goods until 
they are delivered and received.

1 825 round 3.2 mm, 20" x 20"  Rubber Tile 405-1902 
(5050101) SF  $               7.59 26% 5.62$                  1

2 926 round 4.0 mm, 40” x 40” Rubber Tile 401-0354 SF  $               8.38 26% 6.21$                  2

3 arago 3.5 mm, 40'' x 20'' Rubber Tile 787-3118 
(5059668) SF  $             12.46 26% 9.23$                  3

4 grano 3.5 mm , 40" x 40" Rubber Tile 595-1880 
(5050181) SF  $             10.41 26% 7.71$                  4

5 grano 3.5 mm hammered, 25" x 25" Rubber Tile for Raised Access Flooring 595-1912 SF  $             15.50 26% 11.48$                5

6 hammered 2.7 mm, 20" x 20"  Rubber Tile 405-1910 
(5059378) SF  $               7.59 26% 5.62$                  6

7 satura 3.5 mm, 40" x 40" Rubber Tile 547-1880 
(5059445) SF  $             10.41 26% 7.71$                  7

8 xp 3.5 mm, 40" x 40" Rubber Tile 529-1880 
(5059494) SF  $             11.19 26% 8.29$                  8

9 xp trac 3.5 mm, 40" x 40" Rubber Tile 530-325 SF  $             12.79 26% 9.48$                  9

10 arago nTx 3.5 mm, 40'' x 20'' Rubber Tile (Min. Order Qty Required) 789-3122 
(5059673) SF  $             14.27 26% 10.57$                10

11 grano nTx 3.5 mm, 40" x 40" Rubber Tile (Min. Order Qty Required) 437-3111 
(5059640) SF  $             12.22 26% 9.05$                  11

12 satura nTx 3.5 mm, 40" x 40" Rubber Tile (Min. Order Qty Required) 438-3111 
(5059642) SF  $             13.07 26% 9.68$                  12

13 xp nTx 3.5 mm, 40" x 40" Rubber Tile (Min. Order Qty Required) 442-3111 
(5059662) SF  $             13.02 26% 9.64$                  13

14 xp trac nTx 3.5 mm, 40" x 40" Rubber Tile (Min. Order Qty Required) 444-3134 SF  $             13.97 26% 10.35$                14

15 920 4.0 mm high fire-retardant properties, 40" x 40" Speciality Rubber Tile 860-0354 
(5050112) SF  $             14.57 26% 10.79$                15

16 992 9.0 mm Extreme Wear Resistance, 40" x 40" Speciality Rubber Tile 868-1955 
(5050113) SF  $             14.89 26% 11.03$                16

17 992 grano 9.0 mm Extreme Wear Resistance, 40" x 40" Speciality Rubber Tile 418-1955 
(5050109) SF  $             16.31 26% 12.08$                17

18 grano ed 3.5 mm, 40" x 40" Speciality Rubber Tile 409-1880 
(5050184) SF  $             16.52 26% 12.24$                18

19 grano ed 3.5 mm hammered, 25" x 25" Rubber Tile for Raised Access Flooring 409-1912 SF  $             16.13 26% 11.95$                19

20 eco 2.0 mm, 49' x 48" Rubber Sheet Goods 446-1490 
(5050115) SF  $               4.73 26% 3.50$                  20

21 environcare™ 2.0 mm, 49' x 48" Rubber Sheet Goods 691-1462 
(5050128) SF  $               6.30 26% 4.67$                  21
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Manufacturer

Part F.2B – Price Schedule                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                            
AEPA #020-B   Resilient Flooring

INSTRUCTIONS: Download the Net Effective Bid Price and respective information for all line items in the entire catalog.  Bidders may add 
additional lines as needed. Major manufacturers are listed. Additional resilient flooring lines may be added. Please write "NO BID" in 
lines you are not responding to.  No labor charges are to be included in this sheet. Please be sure to set the 'Print Area' PRIOR to 
submitting your bid response.

NOTE: The Net Effective Price MUST be consistent 
with the percentage discounts listed on the F.1 tab.  
Failure to have price correspond may be cause for 
rejection of your offer.

Part F.2B is a REQUIRED FORM

Bidding Company Name: Interface Americas, Inc. Catalog Name: Interface Carbon Neutral Flooring
9/16/2019 to 12/31/2020



Bidding Company Name:

Part F.3 is a REQUIRED FORM

Description Unit Of 
Measure  List Price Discount  Net Effective 

Bid Price Comment

nora 4" Rubber Cove Base (material only) LF 0.94$        24% 0.71$                 nora by Interface Wall Base 4" cove or straight, 120 LF per roll

nora 6" Rubber Cove Base (material only) LF 1.43$        24% 1.08$                 nora by Interface Wall Base 6" cove or straight, 120 LF per roll

nora rubber stair nosing LF 12.66$      24% 9.59$                 nora by Interface stair nosing 

nora Stair treads LF 18.61$      24% 14.10$               nora by Interface stair treads (Priced per LF - Sold in 4', 5', or 6' lengths)

Other Support Services Offered

Carpet Tile Non-Wet Adhesive - TacTiles® 1 Roll EA 120.00$    33% 80.00$               111486 -  TacTiles® Non-wet Adhesive (1 Roll) for Interface Modular Carpet with GlasBac®; GlasBac® RE Backings

Carpet Tile Non-Wet Adhesive - TacTiles® 1 Roll EA 120.00$    33% 80.00$               643249 -  TacTiles® Non-wet Adhesive (1 Roll) for Interface Modular Carpet with Graphlar®; Graphlex® Backings

Carpet Tile Non-Wet Adhesive - TacTiles® 1 Roll EA 142.50$    33% 95.00$               1001417 -  Interface 2000 Plus (4 Gallon) for Interface Modular Carpet

Carpet Tile Non-Wet Adhesive - TacTiles® 1 Roll EA 142.50$    33% 95.00$               1001417 -  Interface 2000 Plus (4 Gallon) for Interface LVT 

Rubber Flooring Adhesive - Dryfix 750 EA 500.63$    26% 370.84$             687-6556 (5059008) - Dryfix 750 Tape Adhesive. 30m x 75cm Roll for nora rubber flooring and accessories

Rubber Flooring Adhesive - Profix 50 EA 70.13$      26% 51.95$               687-992 (5059009) - Profix 50 Tape Adhesive, 50mm x 50m Roll for nora rubber flooring and accessories

Rubber Flooring Adhesive - Profix 90 EA 122.34$    26% 90.62$               687-993 (5059010) - Profix 90 Tape Adhesive, 90mm x 50m Roll for nora rubber flooring and accessories

Rubber Flooring Adhesive - Profix 145 EA 215.26$    26% 159.45$             687-6650 (5059011) - Profix 145 Tape Adhesive, 145mm x 50m Roll for nora rubber flooring and accessories

Rubber Flooring Adhesive - PU 102 EA 208.28$    26% 154.28$             685-6696 - PU 102 Adhesive 1.43 gal for nora rubber flooring and accessories

Rubber Flooring Adhesive - AC 100 EA 155.16$    26% 114.93$             790-6694 - AC 100 Adhesive 3.08 gal for nora rubber flooring and accessories

Rubber Flooring Adhesive - ED 120 EA 396.07$    26% 293.39$             685-6695 - ED 120 Adhesive 3.08 gal for nora rubber flooring and accessories

Rubber Flooring Adhesive - nTx 020 bond enhancer EA 565.84$    26% 419.14$             682-6614 (5070015) - nTx 020 bond enhancer Bucket, 2.6 gal for nora rubber flooring and accessories

Rubber Stair Tread Adhesive - Stepfix Tape EA 274.67$    26% 203.46$             687-907 (5059007) - Stepfix Tape Adhesive, 240mm x 50m Roll

PRODUCT AND SERVICE PROVIDERS:                             InterfaceSERVICES, Inc. 
                                                                                                          ("Vendor Partner" Turn-key Division)  
                                                                                                         106 Northpoint Parkway, Suite 300  
                                                                                                         Acworth, GA 30102
                                                                                                         T: (800) 909-7757   
                                                                                                         E: Contract.Services@Interface.com 

Part F.3 – Support Product Price Schedule

AEPA #020-B   Carpet and Resilient Flooring
Interface Americas, Inc.



Project types CA State Multiplier CO State Multiplier CT State Multiplier FL State Multiplier GA State Multiplier IN State Multiplier IA State Multiplier IL State Multiplier KS State Multiplier KY State Multiplier MA State Multiplier MI State Multiplier MN State Multiplier MO State Multiplier

Non-prevailing wage project:      

Prevailing wage project:       

Davis Bacon wage project:   

Project types MT State Multiplier NE State Multiplier NJ State Multiplier NM State Multiplier ND State Multiplier OH State Multiplier  OR State Multiplier PA State Multiplier TX State Multiplier VA State Multiplier WA State Multiplier WV State Multiplier WI State Multiplier WY State Multiplier

Non-prevailing wage project:      

Prevailing wage project:       

Davis Bacon wage project:   

Product Description Unit of Measure Bid Price Comments

N/A

1% - 2%

2,000,000.00$                

Removal - Carpet Tile (labor only)

Removal - Luxury Vinyl Tile (labor only)

Removal - Rubber Tile (labor only)

Removal - Rubber Sheet Goods (labor only)

Removal - Rubber Sheet Goods (Stairs application) (labor only)

Removal - VCT (labor only)

Removal - Broadloom direct glue down (labor only)

Removal - Double Stick Installation (labor only)

Removal - Sheet Vinyl (labor only)

Removal - Existing Cove Base (labor only)

Removal - Existing Stair Tread

Removal - Existing Coating, Glue, and Mastic  

Conventional Furniture Moving (Light)

1.49$                                                                        1.38$                                                                        1.10$                                                                        Sq. Ft.

1.49$                                                                        1.38$                                                                        1.10$                                                                        Sq. Ft.

3.92$                                                                        3.63$                                                                        2.90$                                                                        Sq. Yd. (Not to exceed rates) Non-prevailing wage 

(Not to exceed rates) Non-prevailing wage 

(Not to exceed rates) Non-prevailing wage 

(Not to exceed rates) Non-prevailing wage 

(Not to exceed rates) Non-prevailing wage 

(Not to exceed rates) Non-prevailing wage 

(Not to exceed rates) Non-prevailing wage 

(Not to exceed rates) Non-prevailing wage 

(Not to exceed rates) Non-prevailing wage 

(Not to exceed rates) Non-prevailing wage 

(Not to exceed rates) Non-prevailing wage 

(Not to exceed rates) Non-prevailing wage 

REMOVAL

Description Unit of Measure Bid Price 2nd Shift Overtime Time & 1/2 Overtime Comments

Sq. Yd. 3.75$                                                                        4.69$                                                                        5.06$                                                                        

Sq. Ft. 1.10$                                                                        1.38$                                                                        1.49$                                                                        

Sq. Ft. 1.10$                                                                        1.38$                                                                        1.49$                                                                        

Sq. Ft. 1.85$                                                                        2.31$                                                                        2.50$                                                                        

Sq. Ft. 1.10$                                                                        1.38$                                                                        1.49$                                                                        

Ln. Ft. 3.50$                                                                        4.38$                                                                        4.73$                                                                        

Ln. Ft. 0.48$                                                                        0.60$                                                                        

Performance and payment bond - bonding rate (percent of project) Percent $10 / $1,000 for supply amd $15 / $1,000 for supply and install

Bonding capacity - total amount of capacity available Dollar Amount $2,000,000 single / $10,000,000 aggregate

Wages - Percentage added to the Catalog 

Description of Cost Factors 
Per diem rate - meals and lodging per 24 hour period Per Day

Part F.4 – State Multiplier & Labor Rates
AEPA IFB #020-B Carpet and Resilient Flooring 

Bidding Company Name: Interface Americas, Inc.

INSTRUCTIONS: For each of the states listed below provide your multiplier/factor (wage and transportation) to be applied to the Net Effective Bid Pricing (shown in F.1)  provided to arrive at the individual AEPA state price for each item.  Complete all tables on 
this form, including all cost factors and service rates for installation services, if provided. Part F.4 is a REQUIRED FORM

Quote Required - Varies 
by Project 

* See Interface Labor 
Matrix Tab 

for Rates per State.

Quote Required - Varies 
by Project 

* See Interface Labor 
Matrix Tab 

for Rates per State.

Quote Required - Varies 
by Project 

* See Interface Labor 
Matrix Tab 

for Rates per State.

Quote Required - Varies by 
Project 

* See Interface Labor 
Matrix Tab 

for Rates per State.

Quote Required - Varies 
by Project 

* See Interface Labor 
Matrix Tab 

for Rates per State.

Quote Required - Varies 
by Project 

* See Interface Labor 
Matrix Tab 

for Rates per State.

Quote Required - Varies 
by Project 

* See Interface Labor 
Matrix Tab 

for Rates per State.

Quote Required - Varies 
by Project 

* See Interface Labor 
Matrix Tab 

for Rates per State.

Quote Required - Varies 
by Project 

* See Interface Labor 
Matrix Tab 

for Rates per State.

Quote Required - Varies 
by Project 

* See Interface Labor 
Matrix Tab 

for Rates per State.

Quote Required - Varies 
by Project 

* See Interface Labor 
Matrix Tab 

for Rates per State.

Quote Required - Varies 
by Project 

* See Interface Labor 
Matrix Tab 

for Rates per State.

Quote Required - Varies 
by Project 

* See Interface Labor 
Matrix Tab 

for Rates per State.

Quote Required - Varies 
by Project 

* See Interface Labor 
Matrix Tab 

for Rates per State.

Quote Required - Varies 
by Project 

* See Interface Labor 
Matrix Tab 

for Rates per State.

Quote Required - Varies 
by Project 

* See Interface Labor 
Matrix Tab 

for Rates per State.

Quote Required - Varies 
by Project 

* See Interface Labor 
Matrix Tab 

for Rates per State.

Quote Required - Varies by 
Project 

* See Interface Labor 
Matrix Tab 

for Rates per State.

Quote Required - Varies 
by Project 

* See Interface Labor 
Matrix Tab 

for Rates per State.

Quote Required - Varies 
by Project 

* See Interface Labor 
Matrix Tab 

for Rates per State.

Quote Required - Varies 
by Project 

* See Interface Labor 
Matrix Tab 

for Rates per State.

Quote Required - Varies 
by Project 

* See Interface Labor 
Matrix Tab 

for Rates per State.

Quote Required - Varies 
by Project 

* See Interface Labor 
Matrix Tab 

for Rates per State.

Quote Required - Varies 
by Project 

* See Interface Labor 
Matrix Tab 

for Rates per State.

Quote Required - Varies 
by Project 

* See Interface Labor 
Matrix Tab 

for Rates per State.

Quote Required - Varies 
by Project 

* See Interface Labor 
Matrix Tab 

for Rates per State.

Quote Required - Varies 
by Project 

* See Interface Labor 
Matrix Tab 

for Rates per State.

Quote Required - Varies 
by Project 

* See Interface Labor 
Matrix Tab 

for Rates per State.

0.65$                                                                        

Sq. Ft. 1.10$                                                                        1.38$                                                                        1.49$                                                                        

Sq. Yd. 5.80$                                                                        7.25$                                                                        7.83$                                                                        

Reclamation Processing Fee - (Non-recyclable) Resilient Flooring Waste to Energy 
*Freight not included

Sq. Yd. 0.55$                                                                        0.69$                                                                        0.74$                                                                        Reclamation Processing Fee - (Non-recyclable) Carpet Waste to Energy  
*Freight not included

Sq. Yd. 0.90$                                                                        1.13$                                                                        1.22$                                                                        Reclamation Processing Fee - (Recyclable) Carpet  
*Freight not included

Sq. Yd. Free Free FreeReclamation Processing Fee - (Interface Brand) Carpet  
*Freight not included

0.26$                                                                        0.33$                                                                        0.35$                                                                        

Sq. Yd. 2.40$                                                                        3.00$                                                                        3.24$                                                                        (Not to exceed rates) Non-prevailing wage 

(Not to exceed rates) Non-prevailing wage 

(Not to exceed rates) Non-prevailing wage 

(Not to exceed rates) Non-prevailing wage 

Reclamation Prep - Palletize/Shrink Wrap (Recyclable) Carpet for Recycling

Reclamation Prep - Palletize/Shrink Wrap (Recyclable) Resilient Flooring for Recycling

DISPOSAL OR RECYCLING

Sq. Ft.

Sq. Ft.

0.15$                                                                        0.19$                                                                        0.20$                                                                        Freight Fees to Reclamation Facility - (Non-recyclable) Resilient Flooring Waste to Energy 
*Reclamation Processing Fee not included

0.50$                                                                        0.63$                                                                        0.68$                                                                        Freight Fees to Reclamation Facility - (Non-recyclable) Carpet Waste to Energy 
*Reclamation Processing Fee not included

0.90$                                                                        1.13$                                                                        1.22$                                                                        Freight Fees to Reclamation Facility - (Recyclable) Carpet  
*Reclamation Processing Fee not included

0.50$                                                                        0.63$                                                                        0.68$                                                                        Freight Fees to Reclamation Facility - Less Than Truck Load (Interface Brand) Carpet 
*Reclamation Processing Fee not included

Sq. Yd. Free Free FreeFreight Fees to Reclamation Facility - Full Truck Loads (Interface Brand) Carpet 
*Reclamation Processing Fee not included

0.10$                                                                        0.13$                                                                        0.14$                                                                        (Not to exceed rates) Non-prevailing wage 

(Not to exceed rates) Non-prevailing wage 

(Not to exceed rates) Non-prevailing wage 

(Not to exceed rates) Non-prevailing wage 

(Not to exceed rates) Non-prevailing wage 

Sq. Yd. 5.50$                                                                        6.88$                                                                        7.43$                                                                        (Not to exceed rates) Non-prevailing wage 

Sq. Yd.

Sq. Yd.

Sq. Yd.

Sq. Ft.

FURNITURE MOVING



Conventional Furniture Moving (Medium)

Conventional Furniture Moving (Heavy)

Anti-microbial treatment

Floor Prep - (Minor) Skim Coating to 1/8 inch (Material & Labor)

Floor Prep - Self leveling to 1/8 to 1/4 inch (Material & Labor)

Floor Prep - Self leveling to 1/4 to 1/2 inch (Material & Labor)

Floor Prep - (Extreme) Concrete Grinding to receive flooring. (Material & Labor)

Floor Prep - Moisture Mitigator / Self Level / Grinding. (Material & Labor)

Moisture Testing Each

Installation - Interface Carpet Tile (Labor Only)

Installation - L I F T System Interface Carpet Tile Projects (labor only)

Installation - Interface Luxury Vinyl Tile (labor only)

Installation - Nora by Interface Rubber Tile (labor only)

Installation - Nora by Interface Rubber Sheet Goods (labor only)

Installation - Nora by Interface Heat Welding Rubber Flooring (Labor only)

Installation - Nora by Interface Flash Coving Rubber Flooring (Labor only)

Installation - Nora by Interface Rubber Dissipative Flooring (Labor Only)

Installation - Nora by Interface Resilient Wall Base (labor only)

Installation - Nora by Interface Stair treads (labor only)

Installation - Nora by Interface Stair nosing (labor only)

Installation - VCT (Armstrong) (labor only)

Furnish / Install - Resilient 4" Base (standard styles)

Furnish / Install - Resilient 6" Base (standard styles)

Furnish / Install - Transition Strips

Furnish / Install - Carpet to Tile Reducer (Mercer 165 or Similar)

Furnish / Install - Stair Tread (standard styles)

Furnish / Install - Stair Nosing (standard styles)

Furnish / Install - Risers 8" (standard styles)

Furnish / Install - Risers 9"(standard styles)

Sq. Yd. 15.00$                                                                      18.75$                                                                      20.25$                                                                      

Sq. Yd. 7.60$                                                                        9.50$                                                                        10.26$                                                                      (Not to exceed rates) Non-prevailing wage 

(Not to exceed rates) Non-prevailing wage 

(Not to exceed rates) Non-prevailing wage 

Anti-microbial treatment is incorporated into the struct      

Ln. Ft. 7.75$                                                                        

3.15$                                                                        3.94$                                                                        4.25$                                                                        

1.90$                                                                        2.38$                                                                        2.57$                                                                        

1.80$                                                                        2.25$                                                                        2.43$                                                                        

1.80$                                                                        2.25$                                                                        2.43$                                                                        

0.75$                                                                        0.94$                                                                        1.01$                                                                        

110.00$                                                                    110.00$                                                                    110.00$                                                                    

Sq. Yd.

(Not to exceed rates) Non-prevailing wage 

(Not to exceed rates) Non-prevailing wage 

(Not to exceed rates) Non-prevailing wage 

(Not to exceed rates) Non-prevailing wage Sq. Yd.

Sq. Yd.

31.00$                                                                      

FLOOR PREP AND RELATED SERVICES

Free Free Free

10.38$                                                                      11.21$                                                                      

19.06$                                                                      20.59$                                                                      

3.44$                                                                        3.71$                                                                        

5.25$                                                                        5.67$                                                                        

(Not to exceed rates) Non-prevailing wage 

(Not to exceed rates) Non-prevailing wage 

(Not to exceed rates) Non-prevailing wage 

(Not to exceed rates) Non-prevailing wage 

(Not to exceed rates) Non-prevailing wage 

(Not to exceed rates) Non-prevailing wage 

(Not to exceed rates) Non-prevailing wage 

(Not to exceed rates) Non-prevailing wage 

(Not to exceed rates) Non-prevailing wage 

(Not to exceed rates) Non-prevailing wage 

(Not to exceed rates) Non-prevailing wage 

(Not to exceed rates) Non-prevailing wage 

(Not to exceed rates) Non-prevailing wage 

(Not to exceed rates) Non-prevailing wage 

(Not to exceed rates) Non-prevailing wage 

(Not to exceed rates) Non-prevailing wage 

(Not to exceed rates) Non-prevailing wage 

(Not to exceed rates) Non-prevailing wage 

Sq. Yd.

7.75$                                                                        

Sq. Yd.

5.00$                                                                        

(Not to exceed rates) Non-prevailing wage 

(Not to exceed rates) Non-prevailing wage 

Sq. Ft. 4.20$                                                                        

26.25$                                                                      28.35$                                                                      

Sq. Ft. 4.20$                                                                        

1.88$                                                                        2.03$                                                                        

Sq. Ft. 2.75$                                                                        

5.25$                                                                        5.67$                                                                        

Sq. Yd. 15.25$                                                                      

7.88$                                                                        8.51$                                                                        

5.25$                                                                        5.67$                                                                        

Ln. Ft. 14.70$                                                                      

6.25$                                                                        6.75$                                                                        

Ln. Ft.

Dry cleaning method (carpet) No Bid -$                                                                          -$                                                                          -$                                                                          

FLOOR MAINTENANCE

Apply wax per coat (includes wax) No Bid -$                                                                          -$                                                                          -$                                                                          

Sq. Yd.

Grout and tile cleaning (ceramic & porcelain) No Bid -$                                                                          -$                                                                          -$                                                                          

Grout Sealing No Bid -$                                                                          -$                                                                          -$                                                                          

Hot water extraction (carpet) No Bid -$                                                                          -$                                                                          -$                                                                          

Restorative Cleaning(includes pile lifting,spot removal,hot water extraction) No Bid -$                                                                          -$                                                                          -$                                                                          

Strip wax No Bid -$                                                                          -$                                                                          -$                                                                          

5.25$                                                                        5.67$                                                                        

INSTALLATION

Sq. Yd. 8.30$                                                                        

Ln. Ft.

Ln. Ft.

21.00$                                                                      

6.25$                                                                        6.75$                                                                        

Ln. Ft. 1.50$                                                                        

3.31$                                                                        3.58$                                                                        

Sq. Ft. 4.20$                                                                        

2.81$                                                                        3.04$                                                                        

Sq. Ft. 6.30$                                                                        

1.75$                                                                        1.89$                                                                        

Sq. Ft. 4.20$                                                                        

18.38$                                                                      19.85$                                                                      

Ln. Ft.

Ln. Ft. 5.00$                                                                        

Ln. Ft. 5.00$                                                                        

9.69$                                                                        10.46$                                                                      

Ln. Ft. 2.65$                                                                        

9.69$                                                                        10.46$                                                                      

Ln. Ft. 2.25$                                                                        

6.25$                                                                        6.75$                                                                        

Sq. Ft. 1.40$                                                                        

38.75$                                                                      41.85$                                                                      



INSTALLATION AND SUNDRY ITEMS UOM Non Union Rate
Union Wage 

Rate
Non Union Rate

Union Wage 
Rate

Non Union Rate
Union Wage 

Rate
Non Union Rate

Union Wage 
Rate

Non Union Rate
Union Wage 

Rate
Non Union Rate

Union Wage 
Rate

Non Union Rate
Union Wage 

Rate

Installation - Monday - Friday Standard 8 Hour Shift

Installation - Monday - Friday Overtime (ADD ON) % Added 25% 50% 25% 50% 25% 50% 25% 50% 25% 50% 25% 50% 25% 50%

Installation - Saturday (ADD ON) % Added 25% 50% 25% 50% 25% 50% 25% 50% 25% 50% 25% 50% 25% 50%

Installation - Sunday & Holidays (ADD ON) % Added 35% 100% 35% 100% 35% 100% 35% 100% 35% 100% 35% 100% 35% 100%

INSTALLATION
Installation - Interface Carpet Tile (Labor Only) Sq. Yd. $8.30 $11.62 $6.00 $8.40 $6.50 $9.10 $5.75 $8.05 $6.00 $8.40 $6.50 $9.10 $8.30 $9.71

Installation - L I F T System Interface Carpet Tile Projects (labor only) Sq. Yd. $15.25 $21.35 $13.40 $18.76 $14.40 $20.16 $13.40 $18.76 $13.40 $18.76 $13.40 $18.76 $15.25 $21.35

Installation - Interface Luxury Vinyl Tile (labor only) Sq. Ft. $2.75 $3.85 $1.60 $2.24 $1.80 $2.52 $2.35 $3.29 $1.60 $2.24 $2.35 $3.29 $2.75 $4.56

Installation - Nora by Interface Rubber Tile (labor only) Sq. Ft. $4.20 $5.88 $3.80 $5.32 $4.20 $5.88 $4.20 $5.88 $4.20 $5.88 $4.20 $5.88 $4.20 $5.88

Installation - Nora by Interface Rubber Sheet Goods (labor only) Sq. Ft. $4.20 $5.88 $3.80 $5.32 $4.20 $5.88 $4.20 $5.88 $4.20 $5.88 $4.20 $5.88 $4.20 $5.88

 Installation - Nora by Interface Heat Welding Rubber Flooring (Labor only) Sq. Ft. $4.20 $5.88 $3.80 $5.32 $4.20 $5.88 $4.20 $5.88 $4.20 $5.88 $4.20 $5.88 $4.20 $5.88

 Installation - Nora by Interface Flash Coving Rubber Flooring (Labor only) Sq. Ft. $6.30 $8.82 $5.75 $8.05 $6.30 $8.82 $6.30 $8.82 $6.30 $8.82 $6.30 $8.82 $6.30 $8.82

 Installation - Nora by Interface Rubber Dissipative Flooring (Labor Only) Sq. Ft. $4.20 $5.88 $3.80 $5.32 $4.20 $5.88 $4.20 $5.88 $4.20 $5.88 $4.20 $5.88 $4.20 $5.88

Installation - Nora by Interface Resilient Wall Base (labor only) Ln. Ft. $1.50 $2.10 $1.40 $1.96 $1.20 $1.68 $1.20 $1.68 $1.20 $1.68 $1.20 $1.68 $1.50 $2.10

Installation - Nora by Interface Stair treads (labor only) Ln. Ft. $21.00 $29.40 $19.10 $26.74 $19.10 $26.74 $19.10 $26.74 $19.10 $26.74 $19.10 $26.74 $21.00 $29.40

Installation - Nora by Interface Stair nosing (labor only) Ln. Ft. $14.70 $20.58 $13.40 $18.76 $13.40 $18.76 $13.40 $18.76 $13.40 $18.76 $13.40 $18.76 $14.70 $20.58

Installation - VCT (Armstrong) (labor only) Sq. Ft. $1.40 $1.96 $1.20 $1.68 $1.20 $1.68 $1.20 $1.68 $1.20 $1.68 $1.20 $1.68 $1.40 $1.96

Furnish / Install - Resilient 4" Base (standard styles) Ln. Ft. $2.25 $3.15 $2.25 $3.15 $2.25 $3.15 $2.25 $3.15 $2.25 $3.15 $2.25 $3.15 $2.25 $4.44

Furnish / Install - Resilient 6" Base (standard styles) Ln. Ft. $2.65 $3.71 $2.65 $3.71 $2.65 $3.71 $2.65 $3.71 $2.65 $3.71 $2.65 $3.71 $2.65 $4.48

Furnish / Install - Transition Strips Ln. Ft. $5.00 $7.00 $5.00 $7.00 $5.00 $7.00 $5.00 $7.00 $5.00 $7.00 $5.00 $7.00 $5.00 $7.00

Furnish / Install - Carpet to Tile Reducer (Mercer 165 or Similar) Ln. Ft. $5.00 $7.00 $5.00 $7.00 $5.00 $7.00 $5.00 $7.00 $5.00 $7.00 $5.00 $7.00 $5.00 $7.00

Furnish / Install - Stair Tread (standard styles) Ln. Ft. $31.00 $43.40 $31.00 $43.40 $31.00 $43.40 $31.00 $43.40 $31.00 $43.40 $31.00 $43.40 $31.00 $43.40

Furnish / Install - Stair Nosing (standard styles) Ln. Ft. $5.00 $7.00 $5.00 $7.00 $5.00 $7.00 $5.00 $7.00 $5.00 $7.00 $5.00 $7.00 $5.00 $7.00

Furnish / Install - Risers 8" (standard styles) Ln. Ft. $7.75 $10.85 $7.75 $10.85 $7.75 $10.85 $7.75 $10.85 $7.75 $10.85 $7.75 $10.85 $7.75 $10.85

Furnish / Install - Risers 9"(standard styles) Ln. Ft. $7.75 $10.85 $7.75 $10.85 $7.75 $10.85 $7.75 $10.85 $7.75 $10.85 $7.75 $10.85 $7.75 $10.85

Removal of Existing Flooring

Removal - Carpet Tile (labor only) Sq. Yd. $2.10 $2.94 $1.90 $2.66 $2.90 $4.06 $1.90 $2.66 $1.90 $2.66 $2.10 $2.94 $2.10 $5.59

Removal - Luxury Vinyl Tile (labor only) Sq. Ft. $1.10 $1.54 $0.65 $0.91 $0.65 $0.91 $0.65 $0.91 $0.65 $0.91 $0.65 $0.91 $1.10 $1.38

Removal - Rubber Tile (labor only) Sq. Ft. $1.10 $1.54 $0.65 $0.91 $0.65 $0.91 $0.65 $0.91 $0.65 $0.91 $0.65 $0.91 $1.10 $1.54

Removal - Rubber Sheet Goods (labor only) Sq. Ft. $1.85 $2.59 $1.30 $1.82 $1.30 $1.82 $1.30 $1.82 $1.30 $1.82 $1.30 $1.82 $1.85 $2.59

Removal - Rubber Sheet Goods (Stairs application) (labor only) Sq. Ft. $1.10 $1.54 $1.10 $1.54 $1.10 $1.54 $1.10 $1.54 $1.10 $1.54 $1.10 $1.54 $1.10 $1.54

Removal - VCT (labor only) Sq. Ft. $1.10 $1.54 $0.50 $0.70 $0.40 $0.56 $0.50 $0.70 $0.50 $0.70 $0.50 $0.70 $1.10 $1.54

Removal - Broadloom direct glue down (labor only) Sq. Yd. $3.75 $5.25 $2.78 $3.89 $2.78 $3.89 $2.78 $3.89 $2.78 $3.89 $2.78 $3.89 $3.75 $5.25

Removal - Double Stick Installation (labor only) Sq. Yd. $4.20 $5.88 $3.80 $5.32 $5.80 $8.12 $3.80 $5.32 $3.80 $5.32 $3.80 $5.32 $4.20 $5.88

Removal - Sheet Vinyl (labor only) Sq. Ft. $1.10 $1.54 $0.75 $1.05 $0.75 $1.05 $0.75 $1.05 $0.75 $1.05 $0.75 $1.05 $1.10 $1.54

Removal - Existing Cove Base (labor only) Ln. Ft. $0.48 $0.67 $0.48 $0.67 $0.48 $0.67 $0.48 $0.67 $0.48 $0.67 $0.48 $0.67 $0.48 $0.67

See Grid See Grid

PRODUCT AND SERVICE PROVIDERS:        InterfaceSERVICES, Inc. 
                                                                            ("Vendor Partner" Turn-key Division) 
                                                                                                           106 Northpoint Parkway, Suite 300  
                                                                                                           Acworth, GA 30102                                                                                                 
                                                                                                           T: (800) 909-7757   
                                                                                                           E: Contract.Services@Interface.com 
                 or Local Dealers

Northeast 
Region:

 ME, VT, NH, 
MA, RI, CT, 
NJ, PA, DE

Mid-West 
Region:

 MD, VA, 
WV, KY, 

IN, OH, MI

Southeast 
Region:

NC,TN, 
MS, AL, 

GA, SC, FL

South Central
Region:

AR, OK, 
TX, LA

North Central
Region:

IL, MO, KS, 
NE, IA, WI, 
MN, SD, ND

See Grid See Grid See Grid See Grid See Grid

Rockies:

NM, AZ, 
NV, UT, 
CO, WY

West Coast 
Region:

CA, OR, 
WA, ID, 

MT



INSTALLATION AND SUNDRY ITEMS UOM Non Union Rate
Union Wage 

Rate
Non Union Rate

Union Wage 
Rate

Non Union Rate
Union Wage 

Rate
Non Union Rate

Union Wage 
Rate

Non Union Rate
Union Wage 

Rate
Non Union Rate

Union Wage 
Rate

Non Union Rate
Union Wage 

Rate

PRODUCT AND SERVICE PROVIDERS:        InterfaceSERVICES, Inc. 
                                                                            ("Vendor Partner" Turn-key Division) 
                                                                                                           106 Northpoint Parkway, Suite 300  
                                                                                                           Acworth, GA 30102                                                                                                 
                                                                                                           T: (800) 909-7757   
                                                                                                           E: Contract.Services@Interface.com 
                 or Local Dealers

Northeast 
Region:

 ME, VT, NH, 
MA, RI, CT, 
NJ, PA, DE

Mid-West 
Region:

 MD, VA, 
WV, KY, 

IN, OH, MI

Southeast 
Region:

NC,TN, 
MS, AL, 

GA, SC, FL

South Central
Region:

AR, OK, 
TX, LA

North Central
Region:

IL, MO, KS, 
NE, IA, WI, 
MN, SD, ND

Rockies:

NM, AZ, 
NV, UT, 
CO, WY

West Coast 
Region:

CA, OR, 
WA, ID, 

MT

Removal - Existing Stair Tread Ln. Ft. $3.50 $4.90 $3.50 $4.90 $3.50 $4.90 $3.50 $4.90 $3.50 $4.90 $3.50 $4.90 $3.50 $4.90

Floor Prep and Related Services

Floor Prep - Removal of Existing Coating, Glue, and Mastic  Sq. Ft. $1.10 $1.54 $1.10 $1.54 $1.10 $1.54 $1.10 $1.54 $1.10 $1.54 $1.10 $1.54 $1.10 $1.05

Floor Prep - (Minor) Skim Coating to 1/8 inch (Material & Labor) Sq. Ft. $0.75 $1.05 $0.75 $1.05 $0.65 $0.91 $0.65 $0.91 $0.65 $0.91 $0.65 $0.91 $0.75 $1.25

Floor Prep - Self leveling to 1/4 inch (Material & Labor) Sq. Ft. $1.80 $2.52 $1.50 $2.10 $1.50 $2.10 $1.50 $2.10 $1.50 $2.10 $1.50 $2.10 $1.80 $2.52

Floor Prep - (Extreme) Grind floor to receive flooring. (Material & Labor) Sq. Ft. $1.90 $2.66 $1.90 $2.66 $1.90 $2.66 $1.90 $2.66 $1.90 $2.66 $1.90 $2.66 $1.90 $2.66

Floor Prep - Moisture Mitigator / Self Level / Grinding. (Material & Labor) Sq. Ft. $3.15 $4.41 $3.15 $4.41 $3.15 $4.41 $3.15 $4.41 $3.15 $4.41 $3.15 $4.41 $3.15 $4.41

Floor Prep - 1/4 Inch Luan (Material & Labor) Sq. Ft. $3.00 $4.20 $3.00 $4.20 $3.00 $4.20 $3.00 $4.20 $3.00 $4.20 $3.00 $4.20 $3.00 $4.20

Moisture Testing Each $110.00 $154.00 $110.00 $154.00 $110.00 $154.00 $110.00 $154.00 $110.00 $154.00 $110.00 $154.00 $110.00 $130.00

Moisture Mitigation Sq. Ft. $3.15 $4.41 $3.15 $4.41 $3.15 $4.41 $3.15 $4.41 $3.15 $4.41 $3.15 $4.41 $3.15 $4.41

Disposal or Recycling of Existing Flooring

Reclamation Prep - Palletize/Shrink Wrap (Recyclable) Carpet for Recycling Sq. Yd. $2.40 $3.36 $1.40 $1.96 $1.40 $1.96 $1.40 $1.96 $1.40 $1.96 $1.40 $1.96 $2.40 $2.29

Reclamation Prep - Palletize/Shrink Wrap (Recyclable) Resilient Flooring for Recycling Sq. Ft. $0.26 $0.36 $0.15 $0.21 $0.15 $0.21 $0.15 $0.21 $0.15 $0.21 $0.15 $0.21 $0.26 $0.36

Reclamation Processing Fee - (Interface Brand) Carpet 
*Freight not included Sq. Yd. $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Reclamation Processing Fee - (Recyclable) Carpet 
*Freight not included Sq. Yd. $0.90 $0.90 $0.90 $0.90 $0.90 $0.90 $0.90 $0.90 $0.90 $0.90 $0.90 $0.90 $0.90 $0.90

Reclamation Processing Fee - (Non-recyclable) Carpet Waste to Energy 
*Freight not included Sq. Yd. $0.55 $0.77 $0.55 $0.77 $0.55 $0.77 $0.55 $0.77 $0.55 $0.77 $0.55 $0.77 $0.55 $0.77

Reclamation Processing Fee - (Non-recyclable) Resilient Flooring Waste to Energy 
*Freight not included Sq. Ft. $0.10 $0.14 $0.10 $0.14 $0.10 $0.14 $0.10 $0.14 $0.10 $0.14 $0.10 $0.14 $0.10 $0.14

Freight Fees to Reclamation Facility - Full Truck Loads (Interface Brand) Carpet 
*Reclamation Processing Fee not included Sq. Yd. $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Freight Fees to Reclamation Facility - Less Than Truck Load (Interface Brand) Carpet *Reclamation 
Processing Fee not included Sq. Yd. $0.50 $0.50 $0.50 $0.50 $0.50 $0.50 $0.50 $0.50 $0.50 $0.50 $0.50 $0.50 $0.50 $0.50

Freight Fees to Reclamation Facility - (Recyclable) Carpet 
*Reclamation Processing Fee not included Sq. Yd. $0.90 $0.90 $0.90 $0.90 $0.90 $0.90 $0.90 $0.90 $0.90 $0.90 $0.90 $0.90 $0.90 $0.90

Freight Fees to Reclamation Facility - (Non-recyclable) Carpet Waste to Energy 
*Reclamation Processing Fee not included Sq. Yd. $0.50 $0.50 $0.50 $0.50 $0.50 $0.50 $0.50 $0.50 $0.50 $0.50 $0.50 $0.50 $0.50 $0.50

Freight Fees to Reclamation Facility - (Non-recyclable) Resilient Flooring Waste to Energy *Reclamation 
Processing Fee not included Sq. Ft. $0.15 $0.15 $0.15 $0.15 $0.15 $0.15 $0.15 $0.15 $0.15 $0.15 $0.15 $0.15 $0.15 $0.15

Disposal - Carpet (Non-recyclable) Sq. Yd. $2.06 $2.88 $2.06 $2.88 $2.06 $2.88 $2.06 $2.88 $2.06 $2.88 $2.06 $2.88 $2.06 $2.88

Disposal - Resilient Flooring (Non-recyclable) Sq. Ft. $0.25 $0.35 $0.25 $0.35 $0.25 $0.35 $0.25 $0.35 $0.25 $0.35 $0.25 $0.35 $0.25 $0.35

Furniture Moving

Conventional Furniture Moving (Light) Sq. Yd. $5.50 $7.70 $5.50 $7.70 $5.50 $7.70 $5.50 $7.70 $5.50 $7.70 $5.50 $7.70 $5.50 $7.70

Conventional Furniture Moving (Medium) Sq. Yd. $7.60 $10.64 $7.60 $10.64 $7.60 $10.64 $7.60 $10.64 $7.60 $10.64 $7.60 $10.64 $7.60 $10.64

Hourly Rate for Services Not Listed (non-overtime) Sq. Yd. $78.00 $109.20 $78.00 $109.20 $78.00 $109.20 $78.00 $109.20 $78.00 $109.20 $78.00 $109.20 $78.00 $109.20

Mark Up for Rental or Materials not listed (% ADD ON) 20% 28% 20% 28% 20% 28% 20% 28% 20% 28% 20% 28% 20% 28%



INSTALLATION AND SUNDRY ITEMS UOM Non Union Rate
Union Wage 

Rate
Non Union Rate

Union Wage 
Rate

Non Union Rate
Union Wage 

Rate
Non Union Rate

Union Wage 
Rate

Non Union Rate
Union Wage 

Rate
Non Union Rate

Union Wage 
Rate

Non Union Rate
Union Wage 

Rate

PRODUCT AND SERVICE PROVIDERS:        InterfaceSERVICES, Inc. 
                                                                            ("Vendor Partner" Turn-key Division) 
                                                                                                           106 Northpoint Parkway, Suite 300  
                                                                                                           Acworth, GA 30102                                                                                                 
                                                                                                           T: (800) 909-7757   
                                                                                                           E: Contract.Services@Interface.com 
                 or Local Dealers

Northeast 
Region:

 ME, VT, NH, 
MA, RI, CT, 
NJ, PA, DE

Mid-West 
Region:

 MD, VA, 
WV, KY, 

IN, OH, MI

Southeast 
Region:

NC,TN, 
MS, AL, 

GA, SC, FL

South Central
Region:

AR, OK, 
TX, LA

North Central
Region:

IL, MO, KS, 
NE, IA, WI, 
MN, SD, ND

Rockies:

NM, AZ, 
NV, UT, 
CO, WY

West Coast 
Region:

CA, OR, 
WA, ID, 

MT

Project Management Fee (Not to Exceed) % Added 20% 25% 20% 25% 20% 25% 20% 25% 20% 25% 20% 25% 20% 25%



Bidding Company Name:

Dollar Amount FROM Dollar Amount TO Catalog Name Additional Discount 
Offered (%)

Interface Carbon Neutral Flooring 
9/16/2019 to 12/31/2020 N/A

Part F.5 – Volume Discounts Schedule
AEPA #020-B Carpet & Resilient Flooring

Interface Americas, Inc.

Part F.5 is an OPTIONAL FORM
Additional Discount for One Time Purchase or a Group of Local Agencies in a Geographic Area Combining Requirements 
(Estimate Annual Spend):


	F.1 Catalog Discounts
	F.2A CarpetProductPricing
	 F.2B ResilientFlooringPricing
	F.3 Support Product Pricing
	F.4 State Multiplier Labor
	F.4 Interface Labor Matrix
	F.5 Volume Discounts

