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         NOTICE OF REGULAR MEETING OF THE 

TYLER INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT 
BOARD OF TRUSTEES 

 
 
 Notice is hereby given that on Monday, April 20, 2020, the Board of Trustees of the Tyler Independent 
School District will hold a regular meeting at (Executive Session at 5:00 p.m. and Regular Session at 7:00 p.m.) 
at the Jim Plyler Instructional Complex, 807 W. Glenwood, Tyler, Texas.  The subjects to be discussed are listed 
on the agenda which is attached to and made a part of this Notice. 
 Individuals with disabilities are entitled to have access to and participate in public meetings.  An 
individual requiring an accommodation for access to the meeting must notify the Tyler Independent School 
District by informing the district’s ADA coordinator, in writing 24 hours prior to the scheduled meeting of the 
necessity of an accommodation.  Upon receipt of this request, the district will furnish appropriate auxiliary aides 
and services when necessary to afford an individual with a disability an equal opportunity to participate in and 
enjoy the benefits of the board meeting as nonhandicapped individuals enjoy. 
 If, during the course of the meeting covered by this Notice, the Board of Trustees should determine that 
a closed or executive meeting or session of the Board of Trustees is required, then such closed or executive 
meeting or session as authorized by the Texas Open Meetings Act, Texas Government Code Section 551.001 et 
seq., will be held by the School Board at the date, hour, and place given in this Notice or as soon after the 
commencement of the meeting covered by this Notice as the School Board may conveniently meet in such 
closed or executive meeting or session concerning any and all purposes permitted by the Act. 
 
 Texas Government Code Section: 
  
 551.071 Private consultation with the board's attorney. 
 551.072 Discussing purchase, exchange, lease, or value of real property. 
 551.073 Discussing negotiated contracts for prospective gifts or donations. 
 551.074 Discussing personnel or to hear complaints against personnel. 
 551.076 Considering the deployment, specific occasions for, or implementation of, 
   security personnel or devices. 
 551.082 Considering discipline of a public school child, or complaint or charge  
   against personnel. 
 551.083 Considering the standards, guidelines, terms, or conditions the board will   
   follow, or will instruct its representatives to follow, in consultation with 
   representatives of employee groups. 
 551.084 Excluding witnesses from a hearing. 
 
 Should any final action, final decision, or final vote be required in the opinion of the School Board with 
regard to any matter considered in such closed or executive meeting, then the final action, final decision, or final 
vote shall be either: 
 
 (a) in the open meeting covered by the Notice upon the reconvening of the public 
   meeting; or  
  (b) at a subsequent public meeting of the School Board upon notice thereof; 
   as the School Board shall determine.  
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JIM PLYLER INSTRUCTIONAL COMPLEX 

807 W. GLENWOOD 
DR. JACK L. DAVIDSON CONFERENCE CENTER 

 
 

AGENDA  
 

I. Call to Order  

II. First Order of Business - Announcement by the Chairman as to the presence of a 
quorum, that the meeting has been duly called and that notice of the meeting has been 
posted in the time and manner required. 

 

III. Executive Session will be held for the purposes authorized by the Texas Open Meetings 
Act, Texas Government Code Section 551.071 et seq. concerning any and all purposes 
permitted by the Act. 

 

A. Texas Government Code Section 551.071 
For the purpose of a private consultation with the board's attorney on all subjects or 
matter authorized by law. 

 

I. When the governmental body seeks the advice of its attorney about pending or 
contemplated litigation or a settlement offer or 

 

II. On a matter in which the duty of the attorney to the governmental body under the 
Texas Disciplinary Rules of Professional Conduct of the State Bar of Texas clearly 
conflicts with this chapter. 

 

III. Consider legal advice regarding personnel and related action items.  

B. Texas Government Code Section 551.072  

I. Discussing purchase, exchange, lease, or value of real property  

C. Texas Government Code Section 551.074 
For the purpose of considering the appointment, employment, evaluation, 
reassignment, duties, discipline or dismissal of a public officer or employee. 

 

I. Consider hiring of professional personnel.  

a. Principal for Moore Middle School  

b. Principal for Hogg Middle School  

c. Principal for Austin Elementary School  



II. Consider renewals, non-renewals and terminations of contracts for professional 
personnel. (To deliberate the appointment, employment, evaluation, reassignment, 
duties, and contracts of employees.) 

 

III. Consider Appointment of School Board Trustee for Single Member District 3  

D. Texas Government Code Section 551.076  

I. Considering the deployment, specific occasions for, or implementation of, security 
personnel or devices. 

 

IV. Reconvene from Executive Session  

V. 7:00 p.m. Prayer and Pledge of Allegiance - Mr. Washmon  

VI. Consider action on items discussed in Executive Session  

A. Consider hiring of professional personnel. 6 

I. Principal for Moore Middle School  

II. Principal for Hogg Middle School  

III. Principal for Austin Elementary School  

B. Consider renewals, non-renewals and terminations of contracts for professional 
personnel. 

 

C. Consider Appointment of School Board Trustee for Single Member District 3 9 

VII. Public Participation  

VIII. Approval of Minutes  

A. Approve Minutes of Board Workshop - March 5, 2020 10 

B. Approve Minutes of Regular Meeting - March 23, 2020 12 

IX. Continuous Improvement/Student Outcomes  

A. Literacy and Professional Development Update 21 

X. Business/Legal/Finance/Consent Agenda  

A. Consider approval of 2019-2020 Amended Budget 22 

B. Consider approval of Resolutions for Sale of Property for Delinquent Taxes 26 

C. Consider approval of Paving Improvements to Various District Campuses 43 

D. Consider approval of Contract with School Moving Services for the Moving of 
Furniture, Curriculum and Equipment for John Tyler High School and Robert E. Lee 
High School 

44 

E. Consider approval of a Permanent Easement and Right-of-Way to Oncor Electric 
Delivery Company LLC for John Tyler High School 

45 

F. Consider approval of Head Start Supplemental Funding Application for 2020-2021 
School Year 

50 

XI. Curriculum/Instruction/Consent Agenda  

A. Consider approval of Resolution Regarding EIC (Local) - Class Ranking for the 2019-
2020 School Year 

52 

B. Consider approval of Memorandum of Understanding with Tyler Junior College for 
the  Dual Credit Program for the 2020-2021 School Year 

54 

C. Consider approval of Memorandum of Understanding with Tyler Junior College for the 
College Preparatory Mathematics and English Language Arts Courses (TSI) for the 
2020-2021 School Year 

86 

XII. Superintendent's/Staff Report  

A. High School Voter Registration Update 92 



B. Quarterly Financial Executive Summary 93 

C. Quarterly Investment Report 105 

XIII. Discussion  

A. School Board Member Training Report 132 

B. Local Policy DEA (First Reading) 134 

C. COVID-19 Update 137 

XIV. Future Business  

A. May 7, 2020 - Board Workshop  

B. May 18, 2020 - Regular Meeting  

XV. Adjournment  

 



Subject: Personnel Actions   
 

BACKGROUND INFORMATION 
    
Personnel actions are as indicated.  

 
ADMINISTRATION CONSIDERATION 

 
Personnel appointments recommended for confirmation have met the 
employment prerequisites of the Tyler Independent School District.  The 
candidates either hold valid certificates or such alternatives as specified by 
the Board. Proposed contract renewals for one year term contracts and one 
year non-certified contracts for administrators are also considered.  
 
Recommendations for new appointments are based on interviews, 
references, adequacy of preparation, performance records and the 
Superintendent’s approval.  
 
The appointments, resignations, retirements, and non-renewals are subject 
to the approval of the Board of Trustees.  
 
ADMINISTRATION RECOMMENDATION 
 
The confirmation of personnel actions as indicated, and the termination of 
two probationary contract employees in the best interests of the District. 
 
ACTION REQUIRED 

   
Board Approval   
 

  CONTACT PERSONS 
 
Ronald K. Jones  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
04-20-20  
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I. The Administration recommends Board approval of the renewal of the following 
one-year term administrative/professional contracts for the 2020-2021 school 
year: 

 
Barberee-Taylor, Sheri  
Bitter, Jarrod  
Bjork, Tosha L 
Blake, Christopher  
Bosley, Shelly  
Brown, Gary  
Burns, Stephanie 
Chapa, Cassandra 
Crain, Natasha  
Crawford, Daniel  
Cureton, James  
Davis, Julie  
Floyd, Dexter 
Frazier, Delsenna 
Hanson, Christy L.  
Hinton, Tara  
Hittle, Shauna  
Holmes, Vanessa 
Johnson, Tamara 
Jones, Georgeanna 

Jones, Jennifer 
Jones, Ronald K. 
Jones, Vernora 
Ladd, Steven  
Lane, Claude 
Markle, Bobby  
Moody, Bethany  
Nabi, Gretchen  
Naranjo, Mina 
Newton, Sandra  
Parker, Brooke 
Roach, Christy  
Saul, Joanne  
Segulin, Ana  
Shelby, Brett 
Sherman, Geoffrey 
Sherman, Rachel 
Ward, Johnita G.  
Young, Steven 

 
II. The Administration recommends Board approval of the renewal of the following 

noncertified administrative/professional contract for the 2020-2021 school year: 
 

Bagert, John  
Barber, Rachel  
Bogue, Kevin 
Coker, Jan  
Hines, Jennifer 
Jacks, Joseph  
Loper, Timothy W.  
Millslagle, Jeff 
Olivares, Victor M.  
Petrick, Sandra 
Priest, Greg 
Russell, Mary  
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III. The Administration recommends that the Board terminate the following 

probationary contracts in the best interests of the District, effective at the end 

of their current contract period. 

 

Dana Jackson   Austin Elementary School 

Lanesia Wheeler   Austin Elementary School 

 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
04-20-20 
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Subject:  Consider Appointment of Candidate to fill vacancy for Single Member 
District 3  

 
BACKGROUND INFORMATION 
 
A vacancy occurred for Single Member District 3 on February 20, 2020 
with the passing of School Board Trustee Freeman Sterling. 
 
ADMINISTRATIVE CONSIDERATION 
 
Pursuant to the Texas Education Code, the board may fill the vacancy by 
appointment until the next trustee election.    
 
ADMINISTRATIVE RECOMMENDATION 
 
The Board of Trustees consider appointing an individual to fill the vacancy 
and represent Single Member District 3 until the results of the May 1, 2021 
general election are canvassed.  
 
ACTION REQUIRED 
 
Board Approval 
 
CONTACT PERSON 
 
Marty Crawford, Ed. D. 

 
 
 
  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

04-20-20 
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MINUTES OF BOARD WORKSHOP MEETING  

 
The Board of Trustees of the Tyler Independent School District held a board 
workshop meeting on Thursday, March 5, 2020 at the Jim Plyler Instructional 
Complex.  The president called the meeting to order at 11:00 a.m., announced the 
presence of a quorum and that the meeting had been posted in the time and 
manner required. 
 
Members present were Wade Washmon, president; Rev. Orenthia Mason, vice 
president; Andy Bergfeld, Rev. Fritz Hager, and Aaron Martinez.  Dr. Patricia Nation 
was not present. 
  
Administrators present were Dr. Marty Crawford, superintendent; Jarrod Bitter, 
Kevin Bogue, Jan Coker, Dr. Julie Davis, Dr. Christy Hanson, Jennifer Hines, 
Vanessa Holmes, Joseph Jacks, Ron Jones, and Johnita Ward. 
 
John C. Hardy and John M. Hardy, school attorneys, were present. 
 
Mr. Washmon stated that no one had requested to speak to the board during public 
participation.   
 
Jarrod Bitter and Dr. Julie Davis, executive directors of school improvement, 
provided an update regarding the Early Subject Benchmark Scores.  Benchmarks 
are administered 6 to 8 weeks before the scheduled STAAR test.  Once the data is 
analyzed, teacher and administrators create flexible groups and Focused Reviews 
that are based on the students’ strengths and weaknesses.  They discussed the 
four proficiency levels:  Masters, Meets, Approaches or Not Met and reviewed the 
data for 4th grade Writing, 5th grade Reading, 5th grade Mathematics, 7th grade 
Writing, 8th grade Reading, 8th grade Mathematics, English I and English II. They 
also reviewed cohort data for 5th grade and 8th grade and then addressed questions 
from the board. 
 
Joseph Jacks, chief technology officer, provided a Cyber Security Update. With the 
passage of Senate Bill 820 in 2019, new requirements are mandated for school 
districts.  He discussed CQB Local Policy that requires the district develop a 
cybersecurity plan to secure the district’s cyberinfrastructure against cyberattack or 
any other cybersecurity incidents, determine cybersecurity risk and implement 
appropriate mitigation planning.  He reviewed the Information Security Plan and the 
Information Security Standards and Guidance that have been created and 
implemented.  He also discussed House Bill 3834 that requires annual training of 
all state and local government employees including board members.  He then 
addressed questions from the board. 
 
Dr. Crawford stated that the board would like to honor Freeman Sterling.  Mr. 
Washmon said that he was very active in his fraternity and their colors were gold 
and purple.  He also represented Single Member District 3; therefore, the #3 purple 
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and gold jersey along with his name will remain to honor him until such time as a 
replacement is named.  Mr. Washmon stated that he was a good man and he will 
be greatly missed. 
 
For Single Member Districts 2 and 4, February 14, 2020 was the filing deadline for 
a candidate seeking a position on the ballot for school board trustee.  Artis 
Newsome is unopposed in Single Member District 2 and Patricia A. Nation is 
unopposed in Single Member District 4.   
 
Rev. Mason made a motion to approve the Certification of Unopposed Candidate 
for Single Member Districts 2 and 4.  The motion was seconded by Rev. Hager and 
passed by a vote of 5-0. 
 
Rev. Hager made a motion to approve the Order of Cancellation of Election and 
certify the election of Artis Newsome as trustee for Single Member District 2 and 
Patricia A. Nation as trustee for Single Member District 4 for a term of three years 
expiring in May 2023.  The motion was seconded by Rev. Mason and passed by a 
vote of 5-0. 
                                  
Trustees adjourned to executive session at 11:33 a.m.  Mr. Washmon stated there 
would not be action to follow. 
  
Trustees reconvened in open session at 1:25 p.m. 
 
The meeting adjourned at 1:25 p.m. following a motion by Mr. Martinez, seconded 
by Mr. Bergfeld and a vote of 5-0. 
 
 
APPROVED:     /s/ Gina Orr      

      Gina Orr, Secretary  
 

 

      /s/ R. Wade Washmon    
      R. Wade Washmon, Board President  
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MINUTES OF REGULAR MEETING 
 

The Board of Trustees of the Tyler Independent School District met in regular 
session on Monday, March 23, 2020, at the Jim Plyler Instructional Complex.  The 
president called the meeting to order at 6:02 p.m., announced the presence of a 
quorum and that the meeting had been posted in the time and manner required. 
 
Members present were Wade Washmon, president; Rev. Orenthia Mason, vice 
president; Andy Bergfeld, Rev. Fritz Hager, Aaron Martinez, and Dr. Patricia 
Nation.   
 
Administrators present were Dr. Marty Crawford, superintendent; Kevin Bogue. 
 
As the district observes social distancing for COVID-19, administrators were 
watching by live stream in another room and were available  to provide updates or 
answer questions as needed.  Those present were Rachel Barber, Jarrod Bitter, 
Gary Brown, Danny Brown, Dr. Christy Hanson, Jennifer Hines, Shauna Hittle, Ron 
Jones, Tim Loper, and Jeff Millslagle. 
 
John M. Hardy, school attorney, was present.  
 
Trustees adjourned to executive session at 6:02 p.m.  Mr. Washmon stated there 
would be action to follow. 
  
Trustees reconvened in open session at 7:03 p.m. 
 
Dr. Nation offered prayer and led the Pledge of Allegiance.  
 
There was no action taken from executive session. 
 
Mr. Washmon stated that two people had requested to speak to the board during 
public participation.  Betty Mitchell and Bob Brewer addressed the board. 
   
Rev. Hager made a motion to approve the minutes of the board workshop on 
February 6, 2020 and the regular meeting on February 17, 2020.  The motion was 
seconded by Rev. Mason and passed by a vote of 6-0. 
                                  
Regarding Continuous Improvement/Student Outcomes, Gary Brown, executive 
director of college and career, provided an Advanced Placement and Dual Credit 
Update.  He reviewed the College, Career & Military Readiness Indicators and 
discussed the current Goal 2.  He then reviewed the Advance Placement Exam 
participation and performance, enrollment, and Advanced-Dual Credit Course 
completion rates (9-12) for Region 7 and the state.  He then addressed questions 
from the board. 
 
 

12



Regular Meeting 
March 23, 2020 
Page 2 of 9 
 
 

Regarding the Business/Legal/Finance/Consent agenda, the board pulled the 
following for individual consideration: 
 

 CONSIDERATION AND ACTION ON AN ORDER BY THE BOARD OF 
TRUSTEES OF THE TYLER INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT 
AUTHORIZING THE ISSUANCE OF AN AMOUNT NOT TO EXCEED 
$123,125,000 OF “TYLER INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT 
UNLIMITED TAX REFUNDING BONDS, TAXABLE SERIES 2020”; 
LEVYING A CONTINUING DIRECT ANNUAL AD VALOREM TAX FOR 
THE PAYMENT OF THE BONDS; PRESCRIBING THE FORM, TERMS, 
AND CONDITIONS, AND RESOLVING OTHER MATTERS INCIDENT 
AND RELATED TO THE ISSUANCE, SALE, AND DELIVERY OF THE 
BONDS, INCLUDING THE APPROVAL AND DISTRIBUTION OF AN 
OFFICIAL STATEMENT PERTAINING THERETO AND AUTHORIZING 
THE AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE TO APPROVE THE AMOUNT, 
THE INTEREST RATE, AND TERMS THEREOF AND CERTAIN OTHER 
PROCEDURES AND PROVISIONS RELATED THERETO; AUTHORIZING 
THE EXECUTION AND DELIVERY OF AN ESCROW AGREEMENT, A 
PAYING AGENT/REGISTRAR AGREEMENT AND A PURCHASE 
CONTRACT RELATING TO SAID BONDS; PROVIDING AN EFFECTIVE 
DATE; AND ENACTING OTHER PROVISIONS RELATING TO THE 
SUBJECT AND PURPOSES OF THIS ORDER; 

 Consider approval of Gifts and Donations; 

 Consider approval of Naming of the John Tyler High School Theatre and 
Moore Middle School Gymnasium; 

 Consider approval of Competitive Sealed Proposals for Concessions and 
Lighting for Selected Athletic Facilities. 

 
Rev. Mason made a motion, seconded by Mr. Martinez to approve the following: 

 Approval of 2019-2020 Amended Budget; 

 Approval of Renewal of Membership for Legal Services in Retainer Program 
with Walsh Gallegos Trevino Russo & Kyle P.C.; 

 Approval of Resolutions for Sale of Property for Delinquent Taxes; 

 Approval of Appointment to the Region 7 Education Service Center 
Regional Advisory Committee; 

 Approval of Painting Proposals with All Pro Services for Caldwell Arts 
Academy in the amount of $302,325.00 and Ramey Elementary School in 
the amount of $105,000.00; Watson Commercial for Jack Elementary 
School in the amount of $109,000.00, and Braswell Paint for Plyler-
Constituent Services in the amount of $8,850.00. 

 Approval of Phase III Asbestos Abatement Contract with Air Quality 
Associates for John Tyler High School in the amount of $46,063.50 with an 
additional $4,606.35 for owner’s contingency and $16,500.00 in 
professional fees for ERI for a project total of $67,169.85 and Robert E. Lee 
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High School in the amount of $283,307.00 with an additional $28,330.00 for 
owner’s contingency and $65,000.00 in professional fees for ERI for a 
project total of $376,637.00. 
 

The motion was approved by a vote of 6-0. 
 
Mr. Dusty Traylor, managing director of RBC Capital Markets, LLC presented a 
Preliminary Taxable Bond Refunding Analysis by video conference.  He reviewed 
the current economic conditions, provided a market update, and discussed the 
parameter resolution.  He then addressed questions from the board. 
 
Mr. Bergfeld made a motion to approve an ORDER BY THE BOARD OF 
TRUSTEES OF THE TYLER INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT 
AUTHORIZING THE ISSUANCE OF AN AMOUNT NOT TO EXCEED 
$123,125,000 OF “TYLER INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT UNLIMITED TAX 
REFUNDING BONDS, TAXABLE SERIES 2020”; LEVYING A CONTINUING 
DIRECT ANNUAL AD VALOREM TAX FOR THE PAYMENT OF THE BONDS; 
PRESCRIBING THE FORM, TERMS, AND CONDITIONS, AND RESOLVING 
OTHER MATTERS INCIDENT AND RELATED TO THE ISSUANCE, SALE, AND 
DELIVERY OF THE BONDS, INCLUDING THE APPROVAL AND DISTRIBUTION 
OF AN OFFICIAL STATEMENT PERTAINING THERETO AND AUTHORIZING 
THE AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE TO APPROVE THE AMOUNT, THE 
INTEREST RATE, AND TERMS THEREOF AND CERTAIN OTHER 
PROCEDURES AND PROVISIONS RELATED THERETO; AUTHORIZING THE 
EXECUTION AND DELIVERY OF AN ESCROW AGREEMENT, A PAYING 
AGENT/REGISTRAR AGREEMENT AND A PURCHASE CONTRACT 
RELATING TO SAID BONDS; PROVIDING AN EFFECTIVE DATE; AND 
ENACTING OTHER PROVISIONS RELATING TO THE SUBJECT AND 
PURPOSES OF THIS ORDER.  The motion was seconded by Rev. Hager and 
passed by a vote of 6-0. 
 
Dr. Crawford stated the district has received donations in the amount of $33,500.00 
from Cooperative Teacher Credit Union for TISD Communications, $7,842.76 from 
Tyler Lee Baseball Club for the Tyler Lee Baseball Team, and $5,000.00 from 
Adrien and Tiffany Harvey to John Tyler High School for The Alma Harvey Hope 
Scholarship.   Rev. Mason made a motion to approve the donations.  The motion 
was seconded by Dr. Nation and passed by a vote of 6-0. 
 
Dr. Crawford provided a brief bio for Dr. Martin L. Edwards and Al Harris.  He stated 
that the district is proud to provide the names two former district leaders to the 
board for consideration of naming the proposed facilities in honor of their work and 
dedication to the district and students of Tyler ISD. 
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Rev. Mason made a motion that the John Tyler High School Theatre be named in 
honor of Dr. Martin L. Edwards and known as the Dr. Martin L. Edwards Theatre.  
The motion was seconded by Dr. Nation and passed by a vote of 6-0. 
 
Mr. Bergfeld made a motion that the Moore Middle School Gymnasium be named 
in honor of Al Harris and known as the Al Harris Gymnasium.  The motion was 
seconded by Mr. Martinez and passed by a vote of 6-0. 
 
Mr. Loper discussed the competitive sealed proposals for the concessions and 
lighting at the middle school athletic facilities. He reviewed the committee 
members, the scoring process, and stated that the lowest bid of the completed bids 
had been selected.    
 
Dr. Nation made a motion to approve a contract with Garrett & Associates in the 
amount of $1,767,000 for concessions and lighting for the middle school athletic 
facilities with $211,266 for Thompson Architectural Group for a total cost of 
$1,978,266.  The motion was seconded by Rev. Hager and passed with a vote of 
6-0. 
 
Regarding Curriculum/Instruction/Consent Agenda, Mr. Martinez made a motion 
to approve the following: 

 Approval of Instructional Materials Allotment Annual Certification; 

 Approval of Project SEARCH at CHRISTUS Trinity Mother Frances Health 
System Tuition Agreement Between Tyler ISD and Participating Region VII 
School Districts. 

 
The motion was seconded by Mr. Bergfeld and passed by a vote of 6-0. 
 
Regarding Superintendent’s/Staff Reports, Dr. Crawford provided a Community 
Mitigation Period Update.  He stated that one principal said it best when he said, 
“Connection over Perfection; Grace over Pace.”  The district is currently monitoring 
staff and students. There are 20+ individuals in travel related self-quarantine until 
this Sunday night with 200+ students in the same category.  One staff member will 
be quarantined until April 5th.  He stated that the district has fed 5,000 students 
during week 1, but believes it needs to be 4-5,000 per day.  The Mentoring Alliance 
and the East Texas Food Bank are providing supplemental meals that are being 
handed out along side of the lunches.  Weekend food backpacks are provided on 
Friday.  Boulter Middle School, Three Lakes Middle School, Hubbard Middle 
School, Caldwell Arts Academy, Griffin Elementary School and Peete Elementary 
School (beginning Wednesday, March 23) are Food and Learning Packet 
Distribution Sites.  Distance Learning Program was energized today.  There are 
blended opportunities with e-learning and consumable products.  Campuses are 
disassembling tech carts to provide opportunity for students to check out a device 
to use at home.  Teachers and campuses are making contact with students and 
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families via phone, email, text and video conferencing.  The teachers are utilizing 
district video resources and/or popular media tools to produce general academic 
content videos.  Special Education students and some apartment complexes will 
see consumable deliveries beginning today.  As momentum builds and the district 
resources are staged and accumulated, the district will deploy food plus learning 
materials at more sites via transportation with the assistance of The Mentoring 
Alliance staff.  Essential staff at campuses and administration will continue to work 
and have regular office hours. Buildings are not open to the public.  Maintenance 
and custodial workers will see similar work situations to continue the upkeep of 
district facilities.  Dr. Crawford stated that we realize people are hurting and we 
owe it to our students and the community to continue to offer assistance and 
resources.  He asked some staff members to come one by one, observing social 
distancing, to provide a brief departmental update.   He then addressed questions 
from the board. 
 
Dr. Crawford stated that a resolution is being presented for consideration 
concerning school closures and payment to employees.  He stated that there is a 
need to address wage payments for employees who are idle, as well as those 
required to working during an emergency closures.  Continuing wage payments to 
all regular employees, contractual and non-contractual, salaried and non-salaried, 
who would otherwise suffer a loss in pay due to an emergency closing, serves the 
public purposes of maintaining morale, reducing employee turnover, and best 
ensuring continuity of District staffing when the District reopens to students.  The 
resolution also addresses premium pay for non-exempt employees and continued 
wage payments to any regular employees, contractual and non-contractual, 
salaried and non-salaried, who are instructed by the Administration not to report to 
work even beyond the re-opening of District facilities, for purposes of precautionary 
exclusion or reasons other reasonably related to the COVID-19 outbreak.  Dr. 
Crawford and Ron Jones, chief of staff, addressed questions from the board. 
 
Rev. Mason made a motion to approve a Resolution of the Board of Trustees of 
the Tyler Independent School District Concerning School Closures and Payment 
to Employees as attached in Exhibit “A”.  The motion was seconded by Rev. Hager 
and passed by a vote of 6-0. 
 
Regarding future business, Dr. Crawford reminded the board about the upcoming 
meetings.   
 
Mr. Washmon stated that it has been a month since the passing of Freeman 
Sterling and the #3 uniform at his board place is to honor him for his representation 
to the community of Single Member District 3 and the uniform colors represent his 
fraternity that he loved so much.  The uniform will remain until a replacement is 
named. 
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The meeting adjourned at 9:05 p.m. following a motion by Dr. Nation, seconded by 
Rev. Mason and a vote of 6-0. 
 
APPROVED:     /s/ Gina Orr      

      Gina Orr, Secretary  
 

    

      /s/ R. Wade Washmon    
      R. Wade Washmon, Board President 
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         Exhibit “A” 
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Subject: Literacy and Professional Development Update  
 
  BACKGROUND INFORMATION 
 

The Tyler ISD Literacy plan focuses on ensuring that students are reading 
at or above grade level when they leave their perspective grades.  In order 
to achieve this goal, the district emphasizes strong foundational reading 
skills in Pre K – 3rd grade.   

More than ever, Tyler ISD is committed to training teachers, administrators, 
and district personnel in the areas of Early Literacy, digital learning, and 
high yield practices. 

  ADMINISTRATIVE CONSIDERATION 

Tyler ISD is collaborating with the Voyager Sopris and Children’s Learning 
Institute.  Other professional development opportunities include the 
Reading Academies, digital platforms, and blended learning opportunities 
continue to be part of the future endeavors.    

 
  ACTION REQUIRED 
   

Information only 
 
  CONTACT PERSONS 
   

Christy L. Hanson, Ed.D. 
Shauna Hittle 

   
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

04-20-20 
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Subject: Resolutions for Sale of Property for Delinquent Taxes 
  
 BACKGROUND INFORMATION 
  
 The delinquent tax collection process results in parcels of property being 

offered for sale pursuant to foreclosure of tax liens as stipulated in 
Section 34.05 (a) of the State Property Tax Code. 

  
 ADMINISTRATIVE CONSIDERATION 
 

Attached are resolutions for sale of property and description of property.  
A representative from Perdue, Brandon, Fielder, Collins & Mott, L.L.P., 
the firm representing the district in tax related matters, will attend the 
meeting. 
 
ADMINISTRATIVE RECOMMENDATION 
 
The administration recommends that the Board approve the attached 
resolutions authorizing the execution of the deed by the Board President. 

  
 ACTION REQUIRED 
 
 Board Approval 
 
 CONTACT PERSON 
 

Tosha Bjork 
 

  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
  
 
 
 
 
 

04-20-20 
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Subject: Consider Approval of 2020 Paving Improvements to Various District 
Campuses 

 
BACKGROUND INFORMATION 
    
The results of the annual 2020 parking lot surveys have shown seal coating/ 
asphalt repairs and striping are necessary for several of the district parking 
lots.   
 
ADMINISTRATIVE CONSIDERATION 
 
As required, plans and specifications were prepared by a professional 
engineering company (The Brannon Corporation) and an advertisement for 
bids was published in the newspaper in a timely manner.  Those returning 
bids are as follows: 
 

CONTRACTOR SEAL COAT STRIPING 
CONCRETE 

JOINT MAINT. 

A+ Worley Striping No Bid $11,975.00 No Bid 
All Pro Services No Bid $38,800.00 $124,849.50 
Crown Civil Construction No Bid No Bid $91,506.75 
L&L Asphalt $144,990.60 $47,690.00 No Bid 

 
ADMINISTRATIVE RECOMMENDATION 
 
The Administration recommends the Board approve the contracts as 
follows: 

 A+ Worley Striping in the amount of $11,975.00 for the Striping 
 Crown Civil Construction in the amount of $91,506.75 for Concrete 

Joint Maintenance   
 L&L Asphalt in the amount of $144,990.60 for Seal Coating 

 
Including $ 32,045.00 for Brannon’s professional fees, the project total is 
$280,517.35.  These costs are within the budget with funding provided by 
the Preventive Maintenance Fund. 
   
ACTION REQUIRED 

   
  Board Approval 

 
  CONTACT PERSONS 

 
Tosha Bjork 
Tim Loper 
 
 
04-20-20 
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Subject: Consider Approval of Contract with School Moving Services for the Moving of 
Furniture, Curriculum and Equipment for John Tyler High School and Robert E. 
Lee High School 

 
BACKGROUND INFORMATION 
 
To expedite the next phases of our 2017 Bond projects, the administration 
sought out a proposal from School Moving Services to move the high schools 
as referenced above.  School Moving Services has facilitated moves for the 
district in the past and is a state approved vendor. 
 
 ADMINISTRATIVE CONSIDERATION 
 
The pricing is as follows: 
 

LOCATIONS AMOUNT 

RELHS $159,652.50 
JTHS $85,736.62 

TOTAL $245,389.12 
 
 
Funding is within the allotted 2017 Bond Budget. 
 
ADMINISTRATIVE RECOMMENDATION 
 
The administration recommends that the Board approve entering into a contract 
with School Moving Services in the total amount of $245,389.12 for the moving 
of furniture, curriculum and equipment for John Tyler High School and Robert 
E. Lee High School.   
 
ACTION REQUIRED 
 
Board Approval 
 
CONTACT PERSONS 
 
Tosha Bjork 
Tim Loper 
 

 
 
 
 

04-20-20  
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Subject:    Consider Approval of a Permanent Easement and Right-of-Way to Oncor 
Electric Delivery Company LLC (Oncor) for John Tyler High School  

 
BACKGROUND INFORMATION 
 
Oncor has requested an easement and right-of-way for a portion of the land 
owned by Tyler ISD located at 1120 NNW Loop 323, Tyler, TX.  The 
easement will provide electricity for the newly renovated campus.  It will not 
affect the campus in any adverse way or be a safety concern.  
 
ADMINISTRATIVE CONSIDERATION 
 
Copies of the easement and the location are included in the agenda. 
 
ADMINISTRATIVE RECOMMENDATION 
 
The administration recommends the Board approve the easement and 
right-of-way as requested by Oncor for a portion of the John Tyler High 
School property. 
 
ACTION REQUIRED 
 
Board Approval 
 
CONTACT PERSONS 
 
Tosha Bjork 
Tim Loper 
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Subject: Head Start Supplemental Funding Application for the 2020-2021 School 
Year 
 
BACKGROUND INFORMATION  
 
According to the Head Start Reauthorization Act of 2007 and Head Start 
Performance Standards, the Tyler ISD Board of Trustees that serves as the 
governing body of the Tyler ISD Head Start program must be actively 
involved in program decision-making, oversight and monitoring of the 
program.  
 
The grant application includes a supplemental application for $63,633 for 
Cost of Living Adjustment (COLA). Program Instruction ACF-PI-HS-20-02 
states that Head Start grantees will be provided additional funds.  A portion 
of the funds must include an increase of at least 2% cost of living adjustment 
to increase salaries, and fringe benefits. The remaining funds will offset 
other operating costs. 
 
The grant application also includes supplemental funding for Quality 
Improvement in the amount of $114,912. Quality Improvement funds are to 
be used to make a meaningful investment in program quality.  Funding will 
be invested into ongoing program efforts and activities that help better 
incorporate a trauma-informed approach that will support children and 
families as well as staff impacted by adverse experiences.  Activities must 
align with Sec. 640(a)(5) of the Head Start Act. 
 
Due to the current COVID-19 pandemic situation, the District is not required 
to supplement the funding with a local match. 

 
  ADMINISTRATIVE CONSIDERATION 
 

In compliance with the Head Start Performance Standards, the 
administration recommends the Board of Trustees review and approve the 
Head Start Supplemental Funding Application for 2020-2021. 

 
ACTION REQUIRED 

   
Board Approval 

 
  CONTACT PERSONS  
 
  Tosha Bjork 

Mary Russell 
  Vernora Jones 
 

04-20-20 
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Tyler Independent School District Head Start 

COLA and Quality Improvement Supplemental Funding 

For the 2020-2021 School Year 

 

According to the Head Start Reauthorization Act of 2007 [642(c)(I)(iv)(III)] and Head Start Performance 

Standards, the Tyler ISD Board of Trustees and Policy Council which serves as the governing body of 

the Tyler ISD Head Start Program must be actively involved in program decision-making, oversight and 

monitoring of the program.   

The grant application includes a supplemental funding application for $63,633 for Cost of Living 

Adjustment (COLA) and $114,912 for Quality Improvement.  Program Instruction ACF-PI-HS-20-02 

states that Head Start grantees will be provided additional funds.  A portion of the funds must include an 

increase of at least 2% cost of living adjustment to increase salaries and fringe benefits. The remaining 

funds will offset other operating costs.   

The grant application also includes supplemental funding for Quality Improvement in the amount of 

$114,912.  Quality Improvement funds are to be used to make a meaningful investment in program 

quality.  Funding will be invested into ongoing program efforts and activities that help better incorporate 

a trauma-informed approach that will support children and families, and staff impacted by adverse 

experiences.  Activities must align with Sec. 640(a)(5) of the Head Start Act.  

Board of Trustees and Policy Council reviewed and discussed the Supplemental Funding application and 

budget for the Head Start Program.  The members voted to make application for the following amounts. 

 

Common  Accounting Number (CAN) Funding Level 2020-2021 Funded Federal Enrollment 

Cost of Living Adjustment (COLA) $63,633 432 

Quality Improvement $114,912 432 

Total $178,545  

Non-Federal Share Not Applicable  

 

By signing this application, I certify (1) to the statement contained in the list of certifications and (2) 

that the statements herein are true, complete and accurate to the best of my knowledge. I also provide 

the required assurances and agree to comply with any resulting terms if I accept an award. I am aware 

that any false, fictitious, or fraudulent statements or claims may subject me to criminal, civil, or 

administrative penalties (U.S. Code, Title 218, Section 1001) 

 

______________________________________________  ________________ 

Board of Trustees President      Date 

 

______________________________________________  ________________ 

Policy Council Chairperson      Date 

 

______________________________________________  ________________ 

Head Start Director       Date 

 

4/13/2020 
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Subject: Resolution to approve Proposed Revisions for the 2019-2020 School Year 
to Board Policy EIC (LOCAL): Academic Achievement - Class Ranking  

 
BACKGROUND INFORMATION 
 
In response to school closures as part of the COVID-19 community 
mitigation period for Tyler ISD and other Smith County ISDs beginning 
March 16, 2020, and as mandated by Governor Abbott on March 19, 2020, 
it is necessary to update the timing that student grade-point averages are 
generated and calculated for the 2019-2020 school year. 
 
ADMINISTRATIVE CONSIDERATION 

 

Tyler ISD proposes changes to Board Policy EIC (LOCAL): Academic 
Achievement - Class Ranking, to update the timing that student grade-point 
averages (GPAs) and rankings are generated and to update class ranking 
requirements for the 2019-2020 school year.  

 
ADMINISTRATIVE RECOMMENDATION 

 

The administration recommends the board approve the Resolution 
Regarding Policy EIC (LOCAL) – Class Ranking for the 2019-2020 school 
year. 

   

ACTION REQUIRED 
 

Board approval 
 

CONTACT PERSONS 
 

Ronald Jones 
Jarrod Bitter 
Vanessa Holmes 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
04-20-20  
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Resolution of the Board Regarding Policy EIC (LOCAL), Class Rank 
 

 
WHEREAS, on March 16, 2020, Tyler Independent School District began closure of the district to protect 
the health and safety of staff and students;  
 
WHEREAS, on March 19, 2020, the Texas Governor issued Executive Order No. GA-08 relating to COVID-19 
preparedness and mitigation and through this action and in accordance with Guidelines from the President 
ordered the temporary closure of all Texas school districts; 
 
WHEREAS, the Board has implemented procedures for continuity of instruction to the extent possible 
during the district closure;  
 
WHEREAS, the Board finds that a need exists to temporarily adjust local policy provisions addressing class 
rank under these circumstances to ensure fair and consistent designation of local honors;  
 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the Board of Trustees of Tyler Independent School District makes 
the following temporary adjustments to policy EIC (LOCAL), Class Rank: 
 

 The determination of local honors for the Class of 2020, including valedictorian and salutatorian 
determinations, shall be based on the grades available at the end of the 4th 6-weeks grading 
period, for all grades other than those earned in dual credit courses administered by Tyler Junior 
College.  Grades for Dual Credit courses administered through Tyler Junior College will be 
calculated based on grades provided by Tyler Junior College at the end of the 5th 6-weeks grading 
period.  This will be the final calculation for the Class of 2020. 

 For grades used in the calculation of High School GPA for students at John Tyler High School and 
Robert E. Lee High School, excluding Dual Credit courses administered through Tyler Junior 
College, they will be calculated as follows: 

o There will be no 5th 6-weeks grades issued. 
o The 6th 6-weeks grade will be determined by averaging grades for the 1st, 2nd, 3rd, and 4th 

6-weeks.  The 2nd semester grade will be determined by averaging the grades for the 4th 
and 6th 6-weeks.  Final grades for the year will be calculated by averaging the 1st and 2nd 
semester grades. 

o For semester courses administered during the Spring 2020 semester, the 4th 6-weeks 
grade will serve as the final grade for the course. 

o For any student in danger of not receiving credit for a course, opportunity will be provided 
for the student to complete a program designated by the high school campus for purposes 
of awarding credit.  Students successfully completing the designated program will be 
assigned a grade of “70” for the semester and/or year, whichever is applicable. 

 
The authority granted by this resolution to adjust EIC (LOCAL) calculations shall apply for the remainder of 
the 2019–20 school year, unless the Board takes further action. 
 
Adopted this 20th day of April, 2020, by the Tyler ISD Board of Trustees. 
 
 

R. Wade Washmon, Board President 
 
 

Gina Orr, Board Secretary 
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Subject: Memorandum of Understanding (MOU) for the Dual Credit Program with 
Tyler Junior College for the 2020-2021 School Year 

 
    BACKGROUND INFORMATION 
 

The district has a partnership with TJC which allows Tyler ISD students the 
opportunity to simultaneously earn both high school and college credit by 
enrolling in and successfully completing a single dual credit course. The 
courses are taught by certified dual credit course instructors on and off Tyler 
ISD campuses. The purpose of the MOU is to define the roles and 
responsibilities of TJC and Tyler ISD within the scope of the Dual Credit 
Program. In addition, the MOU outlines the expectations for Tyler ISD staff 
who would like to become accredited dual credit instructors through the TJC 
system.   

   
 ADMINISTRATIVE CONSIDERATION 
 
 Through the existing partnership between TJC and Tyler ISD, students are 

given the opportunity to earn both high school and college credit through 
the Dual Credit Program.  Students who desire to continue their college 
careers have the ability to graduate from high school with college credit, 
saving the student (family) time and money.     

 

 ADMINISTRATIVE RECOMMENDATION 
 
 The administration recommends the Board approve the Memorandum of 

Understanding with Tyler Junior College for the 2020-2021 Dual Credit 
Program.  

 
 ACTION REQUIRED 
 
 Board approval 
 
 CONTACT PERSON 

 
Gary Brown 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
04-20-20 
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Subject: Memorandum of Understanding (MOU) for the College Preparatory 
Mathematics and English Language Arts courses with Tyler Junior 
College (TJC) for the 2020-2021 School Year 

 
   BACKGROUND INFORMATION 
 

The district has a partnership with TJC which allows Tyler ISD 
students who have not met the TSI requirements for college 
admission to receive academic support to achieve this standard prior 
to graduation from high school.  The design of the support courses 
in the areas of Math and ELA are a collaborative effort of TJC and 
Tyler ISD staff members.  The purpose of the MOU is to define the 
roles and responsibilities of TJC and Tyler ISD within the scope of 
development and implementation of these college preparatory 
courses. 

   
 ADMINISTRATIVE CONSIDERATION 
 
 Through the existing partnership between TJC and Tyler ISD 

students who successfully complete the requirements of the 
Mathematics and English Language Arts preparatory courses are 
eligible for admission to TJC.   

 
 ADMINISTRATIVE RECOMMENDATION 
 
 The administration recommends the board approve this 

Memorandum of Understanding with Tyler Junior College for College 
Preparatory Mathematics and English Language Arts courses for the 
2020-2021 School Year. 

 
 ACTION REQUIRED 
 
 Board Approval 
 
 CONTACT PERSON 

 
Gary Brown 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
04-20-20 
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Subject: High School Voter Registration Update 
 
 
  Information will be presented at the meeting. 
   
 
  ACTION REQUIRED 
   

Information only 
 
  CONTACT PERSONS 
   
  Marty Crawford, Ed. D. 
  John Landes 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
  04-20-20 
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Subject: School Board Member Training 
 
  BACKGROUND INFORMATION 
 

The Texas Education Code requires board members to complete ongoing 
continuing education in accordance with State Board of Education (SBOE) 
rule. Under the SBOE rule, Board members are required to complete four 
different tiers, or categories, of continuing education. These four tiers are 
as follows: 
  

 Tier 1 local district orientation, basic legal orientation and legal 
update training; 

 Tier 2 team-building training with all board members and the 
superintendent; 

 Tier 3 annual continuing education; and 

 Tier 4 evaluating student academic performance. 
 

House Bill 403 (2019) and House Bill 3834 (2019), requires board members 
to complete training regarding child abuse and cybersecurity. Those 
trainings are scheduled to be completed prior to the required deadlines later 
this spring and summer. 

 
 In 2017, the Texas Legislature passed Senate Bill 1566.  The bill changed 

Texas Education Code Section 11.159.  As a result of the changes, each 
year at the board’s last regular meeting before an election of trustees, the 
board must announce publicly which members of the board have met their 
annual obligation and which have not.  See attached report. 

 
 ACTION REQUIRED 
 
 Information only 
 
 CONTACT PERSON 
 
 R. Wade Washmon 
  

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
04-20-20 
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School Board Continuing Education Record 
Tyler Independent School District 

04/20/2020 

 

Name Tier One Tier Two Tier Three 

 

Tier Four 
Open 

Meetings 
Training 

Public 
Information 
Act Training 

 
 

Local 
Orientation* 

 

Education 
Code 

Orientation * 
or Update 

 

Team-Building 
and 

Assessment 

 

Continuing 
Education in 

Assessed 
Needs** 

 

Student 
Achievement 

(Every two 
years) 

Required of 
All Elected 

Public 
Officials 

 

Required of All 
Elected Public 

Officials*** 

 

Wade Washmon M M M E M M Delegated 

Rev. Orenthia Mason M M M E M M Delegated 

Andy Bergfeld M M M E M M Delegated 

Rev. Fritz Hager M M M E M M Delegated 

Aaron Martinez M M M E M M Delegated 

Dr. Patricia Nation M M M E M M Delegated 

 
* Applicable for first year board members only or Legislative Update for experienced members after legislative session. 
**  New Member are required to have a minimum of 10 hours.  Returning members are required to have a minimum of 5 hours. 
*** Boards may delegate this training to the district’s public information coordinator. 
 
 
M –Met Requirements 
E- Exceeded Requirements 
D-Deficient 
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Subject: TASB Localized Policy – DEA(LOCAL) 
 
  BACKGROUND INFORMATION 
 

During times of emergency/crisis, policies in need of adjustment are 
identified to proactively address potential needs that may arise in the 
future.  Policy DEA (LOCAL) is being updated to align with the 
resolution that was approved by the Board on March 23, 2020.  
 
ADMINISTRATIVE CONSIDERATION 
 
This policy has been reviewed by the district administration to make 
corrections as needed that reflect the practices of the district and the 
intentions of the board.   
 

 
DEA(LOCAL): COMPENSATION AND BENEFITS 
COMPENSATION PLAN 
REPLACE POLICY 
 
 

ADMINISTRATIVE RECOMMENDATION 
 
The administration recommends the board review this update as it 
prepares to incorporate the policy into the district’s Localized Policy 
Manual.   
 
ACTON REQUIRED 
 
First Reading 
 
CONTACT PERSON 
 
Marty Crawford, Ed.D. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
04-20-20 
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Tyler ISD  
212905  
  
COMPENSATION AND BENEFITS DEA 
COMPENSATION PLAN (LOCAL) 

 

  1 of 2 
  
DEA(LOCAL)-A to X  

 

PROPOSED REVISIONS: 4.2.2020 
The Superintendent shall recommend an annual compensation 
plan for all District employees. The compensation plan may include 
wage and salary structures, stipends, benefits, and incentives. 
[See also DEAA]  The recommended plan shall support District 
goals for hiring and retaining highly qualified employees. The 
Board shall review and approve the compensation plan to be used 
by the District. The Board shall also determine the total compensa-
tion package for the Superintendent. [See BJ series] 

The Superintendent shall implement the compensation plan and 
establish procedures for plan administration consistent with the 
budget. The Superintendent or designee shall classify each job title 
within the compensation plan based on the qualifications, duties, 
and market value of the position.  

The District shall pay all salaried employees over 12 months in 
equal monthly or bimonthly installments, regardless of the number 
of months employed during the school year. Salaried employees 
hired during the school year shall be paid in accordance with ad-
ministrative regulations. 

The Superintendent shall recommend to the Board an amount for 
employee pay increases as part of the annual budget. The Super-
intendent or designee shall determine pay adjustments for individ-
ual employees, within the approved budget following established 
procedures.  

A contract employee’s pay may be increased after performance on 
the contract has begun only if authorized by the compensation plan 
of the District or there is a change in the employee’s job assign-
ment or duties during the term of the contract that warrants addi-
tional compensation. Any such changes in pay that do not conform 
with the compensation plan shall require Board approval. [See 
DEA(LEGAL) for provisions on pay increases and public hearing 
requirements] 

The Superintendent may grant a pay increase to a noncontract em-
ployee after duties have begun because of a change in the em-
ployee’s job assignment or to address pay equity. The Superinten-
dent shall report any such pay increases to the Board at the next 
regular meeting. 

If the Board chooses to pay employees during an emergency clo-
sure for which the workdays are not scheduled to be made up at a 
later date, then that authorization shall be by resolution or other 
Board action and shall reflect the purpose served by the expendi-
ture. [See EB for the authority to close schools] 

Pay Administration 

Annualized Salary 

Pay Increases 

Mid-Year Pay 
Increases 

Contract 
Employees 

Noncontract 
Employees 

Pay During Closing 
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Tyler ISD  
212905  
  
COMPENSATION AND BENEFITS DEA 
COMPENSATION PLAN (LOCAL) 

 

  2 of 2 
  
DEA(LOCAL)-A to X  

 

After authorization by resolution or other Board action and in 
accordance with such authorization, nonexempt employees 
who are required to work during an emergency closing for a 
disaster, as declared by a federal, state, or local official or the 
Board, shall be paid at the rate of one and one half times their 
regular rate of pay for all hours worked up to 40 hours per 
week. Overtime for time worked over 40 hours in a week shall 
be calculated and paid according to law. [See DEAB] The Su-
perintendent or designee shall approve payments and ensure 
that accurate time records are kept of actual hours worked 
during emergency closings.  

 

Premium Pay 
During Disasters 
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Subject: COVID-19 Update 
 
 
 Information will be presented at the meeting. 
 
 

ACTION REQUIRED 
 
Board Approval 
 
CONTACT PERSON 
 
Marty Crawford, Ed.D. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
04-20-20 

 

137


	Cover
	Agenda
	Call to Order
	First Order of Business - Announcement by the Chairman as to the presence of a quorum, that the meeting has been duly called and that notice of the meeting has been posted in the time and manner required.
	Executive Session will be held for the purposes authorized by the Texas Open Meetings Act, Texas Government Code Section 551.071 et seq. concerning any and all purposes permitted by the Act.
	Texas Government Code Section 551.071
	When the governmental body seeks the advice of its attorney about pending or contemplated litigation or a settlement offer or
	On a matter in which the duty of the attorney to the governmental body under the Texas Disciplinary Rules of Professional Conduct of the State Bar of Texas clearly conflicts with this chapter.
	Consider legal advice regarding personnel and related action items.

	Texas Government Code Section 551.072
	Discussing purchase, exchange, lease, or value of real property

	Texas Government Code Section 551.074
	Consider hiring of professional personnel.
	Principal for Moore Middle School
	Principal for Hogg Middle School
	Principal for Austin Elementary School

	Consider renewals, non-renewals and terminations of contracts for professional personnel.  (To deliberate the appointment, employment, evaluation, reassignment, duties, and contracts of employees.)
	Consider Appointment of School Board Trustee for Single Member District 3

	Texas Government Code Section 551.076
	Considering the deployment, specific occasions for, or implementation of, security personnel or devices.


	Reconvene from Executive Session
	7:00 p.m. Prayer and Pledge of Allegiance - Mr. Washmon
	Consider action on items discussed in Executive Session
	Consider hiring of professional personnel.
	Personnel - JMH revisions.docx
	Principal for Moore Middle School
	Principal for Hogg Middle School
	Principal for Austin Elementary School

	Consider renewals, non-renewals and terminations of contracts for professional personnel.
	Consider Appointment of School Board Trustee for Single Member District 3
	Appointment of Candidate to fill term for SMD 3.docx


	Public Participation
	Approval of Minutes
	Approve Minutes of Board Workshop - March 5, 2020
	March 5, 2020 - Board Workshop.docx

	Approve Minutes of Regular Meeting - March 23, 2020
	March 23, 2020 - Regular Meeting.docx


	Continuous Improvement/Student Outcomes
	Literacy and Professional Development Update
	Literacy and Professional Development Update.docx


	Business/Legal/Finance/Consent Agenda
	Consider approval of 2019-2020 Amended Budget
	2019-2020 Amended Budget.pdf

	Consider approval of Resolutions for Sale of Property for Delinquent Taxes
	Resolution for Sale of Property for Delinquent Taxes.docx
	Resolution for Sale of Property for delinquent taxes - attachment.pdf

	Consider approval of Paving Improvements to Various District Campuses
	Paving Improvement for 2020.docx

	Consider approval of Contract with School Moving Services for the Moving of Furniture, Curriculum and Equipment for John Tyler High School and Robert E. Lee High School
	Moving Services for John Tyler and REL.docx

	Consider approval of a Permanent Easement and Right-of-Way to Oncor Electric Delivery Company LLC for John Tyler High School
	Easement and ROW for John Tyler High School.docx
	Easement and ROW for John Tyler High School-attachment.pdf

	Consider approval of Head Start Supplemental Funding Application for 2020-2021 School Year
	Head Start Supplemental Funding Application for 2020-2021.docx
	Head Start Supplemental Funding Application for 2020-2021 - attachment.docx


	Curriculum/Instruction/Consent Agenda
	Consider approval of Resolution Regarding EIC (Local) - Class Ranking for the 2019-2020 School Year
	Resolution for EIC Local - Class Ranking.docx
	Resolution for EIC Local - Class Ranking - attachment.docx

	Consider approval of Memorandum of Understanding with Tyler Junior College for the  Dual Credit Program for the 2020-2021 School Year
	MOU with Tyler Junior College for Dual Credit Program.docx
	MOU with Tyler Junior College for Dual Credit Program - attachment.pdf

	Consider approval of Memorandum of Understanding with Tyler Junior College for the College Preparatory Mathematics and English Language Arts Courses (TSI) for the 2020-2021 School Year
	MOU with Tyler Junior College for College Prep Math and Language Arts.docx
	MOU with Tyler Junior College for College Prep Math and Language Arts - attachment.pdf


	Superintendent's/Staff Report
	High School Voter Registration Update
	High School Voter Registration Update.docx

	Quarterly Financial Executive Summary
	Quarterly Financial Executive Summary.pdf

	Quarterly Investment Report
	Quarterly Investment Report.pdf


	Discussion
	School Board Member Training Report
	Board Training Report.docx
	Board Training Report - attachment.docx

	Local Policy DEA (First Reading)
	DEA Local Policy (First Reading).docx
	DEA Local Policy (First Reading) - attachment.pdf

	COVID-19 Update
	COVID-19 Update.docx


	Future Business
	May 7, 2020 - Board Workshop
	May 18, 2020 - Regular Meeting

	Adjournment

