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SCHEDULES AND ATTACHMENTS

APPROVED AT THE REGULAR MEETING

JUNE 27, 2019





Meeting 6/27/19 SECONDARY FIELD TRIP DESTINATIONS Attachment AA-1

THEATERS: MUSEUMS/HISTORIC SITES/PROGRAMS CON'D AQUARIUMS

All local theaters Grounds for Sculputre Adventures Aquarium, Camden, NJ

All New York City Theaters Holocaust Museum Jenkinsen's Aquarium

Clearview Cinema, Matawan IKEA National Aquarium in Baltimore

Count Basie Theater Joann Fabrics

George Street Playhouse Lakeshore Learning Center, E. Brunswick, NJ CENTERS

McCarter Theater Laurence Harbor/Raritan Bay All NY, NJ & PA Convention Centers

Medieval Times Dinner & Tour Liberty Science Center Giants Stadium

NJPAC Manasquan Inlet & Tidal Wetlands Kateri Environmental Center

Patriot Theater, Trenton Manasquan Reservoir Lakewood BlueClaws Stadium

State Street Theater McGuire Air Force Base Meadowlands Experience Tour

Strand Theater Middlesex County Court House New Jersey Exposition Center

Two Rivers Theater- Red Bank Middlesex County Sewage & Wasterwater Plant NJ State Bar Association Law Center

MUSEUMS/HISTORIC SITES/PROGRAMS Middlesex County Utility Authority Old Bridge Civic Center

All New Jersey Museums Middletown Arts Center, Middletown, NJ Park Performing Art Ctr, Union City

All New York City Museums & Landmarks New Brunswick Superior Court Prudential Athletic Center

Atlantic Highlands & Observation Point New Jersey State Capital in Trenton Somerset Patriots Stadium

Baltimore Harbor Newark Museum of Art Sovereign Bank Arena

Battleship New Jersey NJ Marine Science Consortium Special Olympics Complex, Lawrenceville, NJ

Battleview Orchards NJ Vietnam Vet Ed Center - Holmdel Trenton Thunder Stadium

Boston Old Trenton Barracks

BWP Bats LLC, Brookville, PA Philadelphia Museums  & Liberty Square

Chinese Consulate General, NY Philalphia Magic Gardens EDUCATIONAL INSTITUTIONS

Cliffwood Beach/Raritan Bay Repertorio Espanol All New Jersey & New York Colleges

Color Mid Atlantic, Edison, NJ Restaurant Depot All New Jersey High& Middle Schools

COSTCO San Gennaro Festival Parade Automotive Training Center, Exton, PA

Discovery Times Square Exposition Sandy Hook Lighthouse Drew University

Fabric Warehouse Shark River Inlet & Belmar Beach FIT

Falling Water, Mill Run, PA Sterling Hill Mining Museum Lincoln Tech, South Plainfield

First Brokers/ICAP Securities, Jersey City, NJ Strathmore Bowling Alley Middlesex County Vo-Tech HS

Fort Hancock and Twin Lights The Cloisters NJ Institute of Technology

Franklin Institute Washington, DC The Academy of Culinary Arts

Goethe Institute, NY Waterloo Village The French Culinary Institute of NYC

Gregg's Beauty Supply, Linden, NJ Wetlands Institute, Stone Harbor, NJ UTI Bloomfield Campus

Grimaldi's Woodbridge Bowling Alley UTI Exton Campus
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Meeting 6/27/19 SECONDARY FIELD TRIP DESTINATIONS Attachment AA-1

PARKS/ZOOS MISCELLANEOUS

All New Jersey State Parks & Farms EVENTS - LOCATIONS SUBJECT TO CHANGE FMRTL, LLC Accounting Firm

Battleview Orchards HerWorld STEM Event Freehold Mall

Camp Ockanickon YMCA, Medford Interact Club - Leadership Goggle, NYC

Duke Farms, Hillsborough JROTC Competitions HBO Studios, NYC

Fairview Lake YMCA Junior Statesman of America conferences Healthy Italia, Madison, NJ

Foracy Park,  Monmouth County NJ Science Olympiad Competition Hobby Lobby, Marlboro

Hershey Park NJ Student Council Competition Jinli Sichuan Cuisine, Marlboro, NJ

Liberty State Park OBHS Fishing Club Job Corp, Edison, NJ

Pequest Trout Hatchery & Natural Resource Center Peer Leadership Conferences Johnson & Johnson, Summit

Popcorn Park Zoo, Forked River, NJ Peer, Service Learning Initiatives LaPlaca Pottery, Pt. Pleasant

Sandy Hook State Park Project Unify Lip Lab, NY

Six Flags-Great Adventure SADD Regional Conference Little Sheep Mongolian Hot Pot, Edison, NJ

Six Flags-Safari Journey in Learning Senior Dinner Cruise Maloney's Grill, Matawan, NJ

Tuckerton State Park Training Workshops Menlo Park Mall

HOSPITALS/HEALTH CENTERS Yearbook Workshops Michael Graves Warehouse, Princeton

George Busch Senior Center M. Millemann's architectural firm

Madison Center Genesis Elder Care MISCELLANEOUS Misty Morning Boat 

Menlo Park Veterans' Home Aberdeen Diner Monmouth Beach Pavillion & Long Branch, NJ

Old Bridge Health Care Centers Aberdeen/Matawan Train Station/NJ Transit Monster Golf, Marlboro       

Old Bridge Manor Nursing Home Aby's Mexican Restaurant, Matawan, NJ Mountain Creek Resort, Vernon Township, NJ

Robert Wood Johnson University Hospital All NYC Restaurants Nunzio's Kitchen, Sayreville

Roosevelt Care Center, Old Bridge All Old Bridge Businesses & Restaurants Papa Ganche Bakery, Matawan

All Old Bridge Municipality venues Park Performing Arts Center, Union

EVENTS - LOCATIONS SUBJECT TO CHANGE Amazing Escape Room, Princeton & Freehold, NJ Pines Manor

Academic Competitions Black Bear Lake Country Club, Millstone, NJ Raceway Park           

Band Competitions & Parades Bounce U, Marlboro, NJ Ronald McDonald House, all NJ locations

Bodyworks Exhibit Brick House City, Newark, NJ Rosalita's Roadside Cantina, Marlboro, NJ

Cheerleading Competitions & Performances                                Brooks Art Center, Bound Brook, NJ Salsa Latina Restaurant          

Child Development Conferences Camelback Ski Resort Seaside Heights Broadwalk

Chinese Club Chocolate Works, Red Bank Sebastian's Schnitzelhaus, Wrightstown, NJ

Choir Competitions Cross Fit, South Amboy, NJ Shop Rite of Spotswood

Dance Team Dallenbach's Lake, East Brunswick Sophie's Bistro, Somerset

Environmental Club Deutscher Klub, Clark, NJ Soul Sister Bakery, South Amboy

FBLA National  & State Conventions Disney, Florida (senior class trip) Surrender Café, Woodbridge

FEA Conferences Eastern State Penitentiary, Phila Ulta Beauty, Holmdel Commons, NJ

Habitat for Humanity Eatontown Mall Via 45 Restaurant

Escondido's Restaurant Wegman's 

Festival of Music Competition Wilkin & Guttenplan, East Brunswick, NJ
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2018-19 BUDGET TRANSFER #11 THROUGH 5/31/2019

 JUNE 27, 2019 BOARD MEETING

DESCRIPTION ACCOUNT AMOUNT DESCRIPTION ACCOUNT AMOUNT
FROM TO

Tuition-CSSD/Reg Day Training 11-000-100-565-00-000 40,000.00 Salaries-Non Instr Aides Transportation 11-000-270-107-00-126 40,000.00
Tuition-Private Schools 11-000-100-566-00-603 95,000.00 Energy-Gas 11-000-262-621-01-122 46,000.00

Energy-Electric 11-000-262-622-04-123 49,000.00

Salaries-Other Support Svcs. 11-000-217-100-00-000 50,000.00 Other Support Svcs.-Purch Prof Svcs. 11-000-216-320-00-553 50,000.00

Salaries-Guidance Drug/Alcohol 11-000-218-104-00-000 40,000.00 Salaries-Guidance Sec/Clerks 11-000-218-105-01-000 40,000.00

Instruction Svcs-Supplies 11-000-221-600-00-000 500.00 Instruction Svcs-Membership Fees 11-000-221-800-00-000 500.00

Legal Services 11-000-230-331-00-000 25,000.00 Architect/Engineer Fees 11-000-230-334-00-000 60,000.00
Judgements 11-000-230-820-00-000 39,000.00 Other Purch Prof Svcs Admin 11-000-230-339-00-075 2,000.00

Other Purch Prof Svcs BOE 11-000-230-580-00-000 1,000.00
Supplies & Materials Admin 11-000-230-600-00-164 1,000.00

Salaries-Principal Secretaries 11-000-240-105-01-000 115,000.00 Salaries-Principals 11-000-240-103-01-000 115,000.00

Salaries-Central Support Svcs 11-000-251-110-00-152 3,000.00 Admin Info Tech Supplies 11-000-252-600-00-000 3,000.00

Custodial Supplies 11-000-262-610-00-117 3,000.00 Custodial Supplies Admin 11-000-262-600-00-120 3,000.00

Trans-Contr Svcs Between Home & School 11-000-270-511-00-590 10,000.00 Trans-Vehicle Maintenance 11-000-270-420-00-136 10,000.00

Unemployment Ins. 11-000-291-250-00-000 3,000.00 DCRP Contribution 11-000-291-232-00-000 3,000.00

Inst Svcs-Purch Prof Home Instruction 11-150-100-320-00-049 20,000.00 Salaries-Home Instruction 11-150-100-101-00-042 20,000.00

Salaries-Teachers Bilingual 11-240-100-101-00-000 20,000.00 Salaries-Spec Ed Home Instruction 11-219-100-101-00-042 20,000.00

Spec Ed LD-Supplies 11-204-100-610-00-000 7,000.00 Other Support Svcs. Evaluations 11-000-216-320-00-648 10,000.00
Spec Ed PSD Full Day-Supplies 11-216-100-610-00-000 3,000.00

Confucius-Purch Prof Svcs 20-044-200-500-00-000 711.12 Confucius-Travel 20-044-200-580-00-200 711.12

Title III IMG-Hourly Salaries 20-245-100-100-00-211 0.94 Title III IMG-Supplies 20-245-200-600-00-000 5.21
Title III IMG-Supplies 20-245-100-600-00-000 4.27

Title III IMG-Hourly Salaries 20-245-100-100-00-211 313.17 Title III IMG-Supplies 20-245-200-600-00-000 613.17
Title III IMG-Hourly Salaries 20-245-200-100-00-211 300.00

Perkins-Other Purchased Services 20-398-200-500-00-000 507.48 Perkins-Supplies & Materials 20-398-100-600-00-000 507.48

TOTAL FROM 475,336.98 TOTAL TO 475,336.98

P:\CJ Documents\Budget Transfers\2018-2019\2018-19 Budget Transfers.xlsx 6/12/2019

Agenda Session:  06.18.19
Regular Meeting:  06.27.19 Attachment B-1



 Summary of Out-of-District Placements and Transportation Requests  

2018-2019 School Year — June 2019 

Student ID # School Tuition Starting Termination

808273 New Road School of Parlin $40,786.20 5/13/19  

812941 Rutgers Day School $64,714.17 5/20/19  

32400 Rugby School $68,760.09 5/24/19 

802451 CPC Adolescent $66,960.00 5/29/19 

28208 Bancroft School – Aide $3,456.00 5/17/19  

AGENDA SESS ION:   06 .18 .19  

REGULAR MEETING:   06 .27 . 19 ATTACHMENT  B-2



 Summary of Out-of-District Placements and Transportation Requests  

2019 Extended School Year — June 2019 

Student ID # School Tuition Starting Termination

808273 New Road School of Parlin $10,839.30 7/1/19 

810685     Rutgers Day School $12,942.82 7/1/19 

808794   Rutgers Day School $12,942.82 7/1/19 

812941   Rutgers Day School $12,942.82 7/1/19 

31566   Hawkswood School – Aide $5,550.00 7/1/19 

803268   Hawkswood School – Aide $5,550.00 7/1/19 

32400   Rugby School $11,737.50 7/1/19 

813385   Hawkswood School  $11,143.80 7/1/19 

808347   Hawkswood School $11,143.80 7/1/19 

813208   Summit Speech School $8,700.00 7/1/19 

39486   Cambridge School $4,263.00 7/1/19 

28208   Bancroft School - Aide $6,000.00 7/1/19 

802834   Chapel Hill Academy – Aide Adj. $4,800.00 7/1/19 

36393   Schroth/LADACIN $10,601.54 7/1/19 

807369   SEARCH Day School $13,542.36 7/1/19 

807369   SEARCH Day School – Aide $6,825.00 7/1/19 

802561   Bancroft School $11,262.30 7/1/19 

810966   Schroth (LADACIN) – Tuition adj. $11,973.00 7/1/19 

809761   Schroth (LADACIN) – Tuition adj. $11,973.00 7/1/19 

808628   Schroth (LADACIN) – Tuition adj. $11,973.00 7/1/19 

36393   Schroth (LADACIN) $11,973.00 7/1/19 

38562   Collier $9,930.00 7/1/19 

AGENDA SESS ION:   06 .18 .19  

REGULAR MEETING:   06 .27 . 19 ATTACHMENT  B-4



Agenda Session:  06.18.19
Regular Meeting:  06.27.19

OLD BRIDGE TOWNSHIP PUBLIC SCHOOLS
CANCELLED CHECK LIST THROUGH JUNE 30, 2018

Attachment B-5

CHECK
DATE CHECK NO AMOUNT

7/5/2017 126098 200.00$         
7/26/2017 126172 65.00$           
7/26/2017 126198 705.00$         
7/26/2017 126325 9.79$             
7/26/2017 126335 9.79$             
9/13/2017 126883 401.47$         

10/18/2017 127612 350.00$         
11/15/2017 127931 9.79$             
11/16/2017 127935 9.79$             
12/31/2017 128265 401.47$         

1/17/2018 128576 401.47$         
2/14/2018 129191 401.47$         
2/21/2018 129284 204.64$         
4/18/2018 129811 401.47$         
2/21/2017 35631 66.00$           

3/9/2017 35633 220.00$         
4/25/2017 35644 20.00$           
11/2/2017 35728 341.00$         

2/8/2017 35780 476.36$         

4,694.51$      

CHECK
DATE CHECK NO AMOUNT

7/28/2017 914256 83.86             
10/13/2017 919093 50.38             
11/15/2017 920572 142.22           
12/15/2017 920666 38.74             
12/22/2017 920673 15.25             
12/22/2017 920693 2,634.52        

11/2/2018 920703 30.50             
2/28/2018 920800 7.90               
3/15/2018 920829 15.79             
3/15/2018 920833 7.77               
4/30/2018 920900 23.70             
4/30/2018 920920 89.35             
5/15/2018 920926 15.79             

 AMBOY GENERAL ACCOUNT #100102

 AMBOY PAYROLL ACCOUNT #100560



Agenda Session:  06.18.19
Regular Meeting:  06.27.19

OLD BRIDGE TOWNSHIP PUBLIC SCHOOLS
CANCELLED CHECK LIST THROUGH JUNE 30, 2018

Attachment B-5

5/30/2018 920951 23.70             
5/30/2018 920953 15.79             
5/30/2018 920977 15.53             
5/30/2018 920981 15.79             

11/30/2016 922457 168.59           
6/22/2018 922504 19.43             
6/22/2018 922505 19.75             
6/29/2018 922523 40.79             

3,475.14        

CHECK
DATE CHECK NO AMOUNT

9/11/2017 16940 71.50$           
4/12/2018 17381 50.00$           
4/13/2018 17390 75.76$           
4/18/2018 17400 21.00$           
4/18/2018 17401 21.00$           
4/18/2018 17402 21.00$           
4/18/2018 17405 21.00$           
4/27/2018 17449 35.00$           
4/27/2018 17462 35.00$           
4/27/2018 17466 35.00$           
4/27/2018 17471 35.00$           
4/27/2018 17491 35.00$           
4/27/2018 17511 35.00$           
4/27/2018 17518 35.00$           

5/4/2018 17580 23.00$           
5/23/2018 17675 400.00$         

6/6/2018 17742 200.00$         
6/6/2018 17778 79.00$           
6/6/2018 17820 250.00$         
6/6/2018 17846 250.00$         
6/6/2018 17884 300.00$         
6/8/2018 18046 500.00$         

6/11/2018 18062 250.00$         
6/11/2018 18077 300.00$         
6/11/2018 18086 300.00$         
6/14/2018 18125 94.00$           
6/22/2018 18167 250.00$         

3,722.26$      

 AMBOY OBHS STUDENT ACTIVITY ACCOUNT # 6146196



Agenda Session:  06.18.19
Regular Meeting:  06.27.19

OLD BRIDGE TOWNSHIP PUBLIC SCHOOLS
CANCELLED CHECK LIST THROUGH JUNE 30, 2018

Attachment B-5

CHECK
DATE CHECK NO AMOUNT

9/18/2017 11972 106.00$         
10/16/2017 12154 100.00$         

1/22/2018 12357 81.00$           
5/1/2018 12625 120.00$         

5/21/2018 12711 70.00$           
477.00$         

CHECK
DATE CHECK NO AMOUNT

12/20/2017 10111 10.00$           
12/20/2017 10112 10.00$           

3/23/2018 10149 30.00$           
5/23/2018 10188 275.00$         
6/22/2018 10230 80.00$           
6/22/2018 10235 50.00$           
6/22/2018 10237 50.00$           

505.00$         

CHECK
DATE CHECK NO AMOUNT

6/15/18 396 30.00$           

30.00$           

 AMBOY  PROJECT GRADUATION  ACCOUNT #177520

 AMBOY SANDBURG STUDENT ACTIVITES ACCOUNT #6116319

 AMBOY HIGH SCHOOL ATHLETIC ACCOUNT #180386





Agenda Session:  06.18.19
Regular Meeting:  06.27.19

OLD BRIDGE TOWNSHIP BOARD OF EDUCATION  

Health Benefit Rates Effective July 1, 2019 to June 30, 2020  

Attachment  B-6

Current Rates Final Renewal + 0% Dental Plan - OBEA with $125/$250 Calendar Year Deductible

7/1/18 - 6/30/19 7/1/19 - 6/30/20 2018-2019 2019-2020

Single $275.59 $275.59 Single $39.59 $39.59

2Adults $620.06 $620.06 2Adults $82.21 $82.21

Family $688.96 $688.96 Family $129.16 $129.16

P/C $385.81 $385.81 Employee & Child(ren) $80.22 $80.22

Current Rates Final Renewal + 0% Dental Plan - OBSA with $75/$150 Calendar Year Deductible

7/1/18 - 6/30/19 7/1/19 - 6/30/20 2018-2019 2019-2020

Single $273.29 $273.29 Single $41.76 $41.76

2Adults $614.89 $614.89 2Adults $86.72 $86.72

Family $683.20 $683.20 Family $136.25 $136.25

P/C $382.58 $382.58 Employee & Child(ren) $84.62 $84.62

Current Rates Final Renewal + 0% Dental Plan - OBAA with $125/$250 Calendar Year Deductible

7/1/18 - 6/30/19 7/1/19 - 6/30/20 2018-2019 2019-2020

Single $273.29 $273.29 Single $39.59 $39.59

2Adults $614.89 $614.89 2Adults $82.21 $82.21

Family $683.20 $683.20 Family $129.16 $129.16

P/C $382.58 $382.58 Employee & Child(ren) $80.22 $80.22

Current Rates Final Renewal + 0% Dental Plan - OBDO with $125/$250 Calendar Year Deductible

7/1/18 - 6/30/19 7/1/19 - 6/30/20 2018-2019 2019-2020

Single $273.29 $273.29 Single $39.59 $39.59

2Adults $614.89 $614.89 2Adults $82.21 $82.21

Family $683.20 $683.20 Family $129.16 $129.16

P/C $382.58 $382.58 Employee & Child(ren) $80.22 $80.22

2018-2019 2019-2020

Single $5.19 $5.19

For Retirees, AmeriFlex will add a $5.50 billing charge to the active rates.

July 1, 2019 to June 30, 2020

BENECARD SERVICES - OBDO - 4000

BeneCard Prescription Drug - Group #3113

July 1, 2019 to June 30, 2020

Horizon Dental - Group #85731

BENECARD SERVICES - OBSA 2000

BENECARD SERVICES - OBAA - 3000

Vision Service Plan

BENECARD SERVICES - OBEA 1000





6/25/2019 REGULAR NOON HOUR SUPERVISOR 2019-20 ASSIGNMENTS

LAST NAME

FIRST 

NAME

19-20 

placement

CAVALUZZI PRUDENCE 2 hour Carpenter

BABAJKO ANDREA 2 hour Carpenter

ROSSI IVETTE 2 hour Carpenter

TORRE MARGARET 2 hour Carpenter

SEIDEL DONNA 2 hour Carpenter

BOYD JOSEPHINE 2 hour Carpenter

TAMSULA MARGARET 1 hour Carpenter

BILOTTI MARLENE 1 hour Cooper

FONTANA SHARON 1 hour Cooper

RASMUSSEN MELISA 1 hour Cooper

DAMION DIANE 1 hour Cooper

BOWERS KAREN 1 hour Cooper

MCLAUGHLIN EVONNE 1 hour Cooper

SHAKER MARIE 1 hour Cooper

DOLAN CAROL L 2 hour Grissom

BRAMANTE JENNY 2 hour Grissom

PASSARETTI DELORES 2 hour Grissom

VAFIADOU BARBARA 2 hour Grissom

WASKO LISA 2 hour Grissom

GARBARINO IRENE 2 hour Grissom

METZ LORRAINE 2 hour MADISON PARK

HASSAN AZZA 2 hour MADISON PARK

FIGUEROA DAWN 2 hour MADISON PARK

WALKER LISA 2 hour MADISON PARK

MEICKE DONNA 2 hour MADISON PARK

SCHROEDER THERESA 2 hour MADISON PARK

VIG BINDU 1 hour MADISON PARK

DAVIES KIMBERLY 1 hour MADISON PARK

BARNETT KATHLEEN 1 hour MADISON PARK

THOMAS ELENAMARIE 1 hour MADISON PARK

SHALLONIS CHRISTINE 2 hour McDivitt

MAHLER NORMA 2 hour McDivitt

GILLESPIE DENISE A 2 hour McDivitt

VITELLO JENNIFER 2 hour McDivitt

LENT MARY 2 hour McDivitt

ELSHERBINI ENAS A 2 hour McDivitt

SCHIANO DANIELA 2 hour McDivitt

PISTOLA FRANCINE 2 hour McDivitt

SEACHRIST MARCELLA 2 hour McDivitt

NELSON LAURA 2 hour McDivitt

CUOMO BARBARA 2 hour McDivitt

LOCKHART ANN MARIE 2 hour McDivitt

Agenda Session:  06.18.19
Regular Meeting:  06.27.19

Attachment C-6



6/25/2019 REGULAR NOON HOUR SUPERVISOR 2019-20 ASSIGNMENTS

LAST NAME

FIRST 

NAME

19-20 

placement
HANSEN DOLORES 2 hour Memorial

FREYER ANNE C 2 hour Memorial

MOOMJIAN ROSEMARIE P2 hour Memorial

OSBORNE LOU ANN 2 hour Memorial

ARESTA SHARON 2 hour Memorial

CRAMAROSSA FONTINA 2 hour Memorial

PEDI LORI ANN 2 hour Memorial

PATEL DEVYANI 2 hour Memorial

PARASCANDOLOBARBARA 2 hour Memorial

NIERADKA GAIL E 2 hour Miller

PROVINCIALI ANNA 2 hour Miller

BAUMANN SUSAN 2 hour Miller

SALIM ENTESSAR 2 hour Miller

JUNG SHIRLEY 2 hour Miller

MASSA LISA 2 hour Miller

DONNAMARIA LINDA 2 hour Miller

SILKES BETH 2 hour Schirra

HUNT SANDRA 2 hour Schirra

SIERRA PATRICIA A 2 hour Schirra

MARTIN CAROL 2 hour Schirra

YIK LEE YAN 2 hour Schirra

VIOLANTE THERESA 2 hour Schirra

BILINSKI MARIE 2 hour Schirra

FAILLA CHRISTINE 2 hour Schirra

VAN BUREN LISA 2 hour Schirra

MARKETTA BARBARA 1 HR Shepard

DANSKY JEAN 1 hour Shepard

BARNHARDT CHERYL 1 hour Shepard

CANGRO ROSALIA 1 hour Shepard

RUANE VERNEYREGINA 1 hour Shepard

SCHNEIDER MELISSA 1 hour Shepard

TADDEO DIANE 1 hour Shepard

ARVELO DIANA 1 hour Shepard

SACCENTE GLORIA 2 hour southwood

CUCARESE MARIA 2 hour southwood

DANSKY SHERRY 2 hour southwood

RALPH SUSANNE 2 hour southwood

HOAG EILEEN 2 hour southwood

DANTONA NAOMI 2 hour southwood

BIANCHINO CHERYL 1 hour southwood

ANDREW KAREN 1 hour southwood



6/25/2019 REGULAR NOON HOUR SUPERVISOR 2019-20 ASSIGNMENTS

LAST NAME

FIRST 

NAME

19-20 

placement
SCHMALZ KELLY 1 hour southwood

MENKES LAUREN 1 hour TBD

CROCE ANTOINETTE 1 hour TBD

VITTORIA PAMELA 2 hour Voorhees

BURKE BARBARA 2 hour Voorhees

DORION JODI 2 hour Voorhees

DEGENHARDT PATRICIA 2 hour Voorhees

PARISI DONNA T 2 hour Voorhees

LOGARAS INES 2 hour Voorhees

GILL KATHERINE 2 hour Voorhees

ABDULLA HODA 2 hour Voorhees

DELANEY DALE 2 hour Voorhees

KOGUT VICTORIA 2 hour Voorhees

MARRERO JODI 2 hour Voorhees

BONNER JESSICA 1 hour Voorhees

FALCONE CHRISTINE 1 hour Voorhees

CHRISTIANA JOSEPHINE 1 hour Voorhees



6/25/2019 SUBSTITUTE NOON HOUR SUPERVISORS 2019-20

LAST NAME

FIRST 

NAME

19-20 

placement
NELA FATIME sub

BERTO LOUISE sub

MATERA LAURI sub

AKHTAR SHEHLA sub

KUTCHER LISA sub

HUFF LISA sub

BLEJWAS SUSAN sub

LOPEZ DOUGLAS sub

JONES MANIKA sub

DALY GAIL sub

DiPAOLA NANCY sub

SEICH LISA sub

JIBRAN SHAJIA sub

MACALUSO GRACE sub

REGINA KAREN sub

ODAH ENAYAT sub

CASTIGLIA KAREN sub

TRANCUCCI MARILYN sub

COOPER MICHELA sub

MALLOY REBECCA sub

CIRELLO MARIA sub

FEURY ANGELINA sub

CORREA JODI sub

BARILLA MARIA sub

WIEDMAN ANGELA sub

MC PHERSON ELIZABETH sub

SOROKINA KATERYNA sub

MUNOZ NATALIA sub

CINQUEGRANAMARGARET sub

AKTURK AYSEN sub

RAMSDEN KELLY sub

SANTAPOLO FRANCES sub

Agenda Session:  06.18.19
Regular Meeting:  06.27.19

        ATTACHMENT C-7



 6/18/19 Agenda Mtg

6/27/19 Regular Mtg
RN/CSN TRANSFERS

2019-20 SCHOOL YEAR

Attachment D-3 C

NAME FROM TO

Carol Brown

CSMS, RN                                                   

11-000-213-100-04-000

CSMS, RN                                                   

11-000-213-100-04-000

Faith Link

CSMS, CSN                                                   

11-000-213-100-04-000

Voorhees, CSN                                           

11-000-213-100-17-000

Yanett Toth

Voorhees, RN                                           

11-000-213-100-00-000

Voorhees, RN                                           

11-000-213-100-17-000

Jennifer Scheblein

District Floater, RN                                                   

11-000-213-100-00-000

Glenn, RN                                                        

11-000-213-100-08-000

Laura Goffred

Glenn, RN                                                        

11-000-213-100-08-000

Memorial/McDivitt, RN                                                       

11-000-213-100-12-000                                                                             

11-000-213-100-11-000                                                                             

Karen Diamond

Cheesequake, CSN                                           

11-000-213-100-06-000

Memorial, CSN                                           

11-000-213-100-12-000

Stacy Ritz

Voorhees, CSN                                           

11-000-213-100-17-000

CSMS, CSN                                                  

11-000-213-100-04-000

Mary Alice Maher Grissom, RN Grissom, RN

Lorraine Doris Carpenter, RN Carpenter, RN

Aliza Marques Schirra, CSN Schirra, CSN

Denise Dempsey McDivitt, CSN McDivitt, CSN

Regina Callahan Shepard, CSN Shepard, CSN

Kellie Atkinson

Cooper, RN                                                                 

11-000-213-100-07-000

Cooper, RN                                                                 

11-000-213-100-07-000

Zayda Harris Southwood, CSN Southwood, CSN

Karen Baran Madison Park, RN Madison Park, RN

Etleva Lleshi

District Floater, RN                                        

Schirra

District Floater, RN                                        

Southwood/Glenn

Karen Diamond

Cheesequake, CSN                                

11-000-213-100-06-000

Memorial, CSN                                            

11-000-213-100-12-000

Michelle Guidice Miller, CSN Miller, CSN

Rosa Maria Verdadeiro JSMS, CSN JSMS, CSN

Maria DeBellis JSMS, CSN JSMS, CSN

Susan Daily EMGNC, CSN EMGNC, CSN

Jodi Smith

District Floater, CSN                                   

EMGNC

District Floater, CSN                                                               

HS/MS 

Audrey Baker OBHS, CSN OBHS, CSN

Pamela Herbert OBHS, RN OBHS, RN

Dorothy Matrale OBHS, CSN OBHS, CSN
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A-Academy Termite & Pest Control Pest Control 
Able Mechanical, Inc. Cafeteria Equipment Maintenance & Repair

Achieve 3000 Pro Differentiated Literacy Solution 

Action Title Research LLC Title/Deed Services

Advancing Opportunities Therapeutic Mental Health Services

Altec Building Systems/Geopeak Solar Panels

Aramark Management Services Custodial & Management Services
Arthur J. Gallagher Risk Management Services, Inc. Broker of Record for commercial insurance
Atlantic Security and Fire Burglar Maintenance and Monitoring
Atlantic Tomorrows Office Copiers/Print Management

B & W Construction Company of NJ, Inc. Surface & Underground Utilities Repair & Maintenance/Paving & Excavation
Bank of America ESIP Lease Purchase Finance
Bayada Home Health Care, Inc. Nursing Services
Brentwood Healthcare Nursing Services
Bristol Environmental Asbestos Abatement

Brookfield Academy Home Instruction
Brown & Brown Advisors Group Insurance Broker of Record
Cablevision Lightpath District Bandwidth

CDW-Government Technology Services
Center for Behavioral Health Psychiatric Evaluations
Central Boiler, Inc. Boiler Repair & Maintenance
Childrens Hospital of Philadelphia Home Instruction
CM3 Security Camera Project

CNNH-Center for Neurological & Neurodevelopmental Health Neurological Evaluations
Computer Solutions SMARTS Budgetary Accounting/Payroll/H.R.

Creative Network Concepts Technology/Maintenance Work Order System
Cross County Clinical Bi-Lingual Evaluations
Data Network Solutions Inc. VOIP Phone Service

Delta-T North Jersey, Inc. Nursing Services
Doctor's Office Pre-employment Physicals
DPK Consulting, LLC Boundry & Location Survey

Dr. Pietrucha Neurological Evaluations
EACM Fire Damper
Edmentum Study Island & Education City
EDU Healthcare Substitute Nursing Services

Educational Development Software LLC Hibster
Educere Home Instruction
Eduserve Consulting Student Evaluations/Home Instruction
Edvocate Manage RFP process
Edvocate Custodial Program, Inspection, Contract Compliance, Monitoring Services
Edvocate Monitoring Services for Food Service Management Company
Effective School Solutions LLC Therapeutic Mental Services
EI US, LLC Home Instruction
Eisinger's Lawn Service Grasscutting
Eisinger's Lawn Service Snow Removal

Environmental Connection, Inc. Environmental Consulting Services
Epic Health Services Nursing Services
E-Rate

Excel Urgent Care Hepatitis B Series Injections
First Children OT/PT    
Follett School Solutions Replacement Textbooks/Workboods

Fronntline Technologies/Applitrack
Frontline Technologies/AESOP Services Support & Maintenance of Proprietary Software & User Licenses
Frontline Technologies/IEP Direct
Gaggle Safety Management
General Healthcare Resources Child Study Team Diagnostic Services
GovDeals.com online aution
Honeywell Energy Service Co.
Hybridge Learning Academy Behavior Assessment

Independent Rehabilitation Svs, Inc. OT/PT    
Industrial Cooling Corp HVAC Replacement
Innerspace Counseling Evaluations
Integrated Speech Pathology Evaluations
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Invo Healthcare Associates, LLC. Speech and Language Pathologist Services

IPG Telecom Telephone Repair
Itpro.tv Online training for technicians
Jesse Mintz, M.D. Neurodevelopemental Evaluations
Jewish Vocational Service of Metrowest Evaluations
JFK Johnson Rehabilitation Institute Speech Evaluations

JVM Mechanical Automatic Temperature Control
Karen Kimberlin, MS CCC-SLP Language Testing Evaluations
Kenney, Gross, Kovats & Parton Board Attorney
Lawrence P. Booth Bedside Instruction
Learning Tree Multicultural/Multilingual Evaluation & Consulting, Inc. CST Evaluations
Life Touch Inc. School Photography

Lyons Environmental Services, LLC. Water Treatment Plant Operator
Mealtime/The CLM Group, Inc. mPower lunch program
Media Flex Library Automation Services
New Hope Foundation Home Instruction

Northeast Roof Maintenance Roofing Repair & Maintenance
Oxford Consulting Services Home Instruction
Phoenix Advisors LLC Financial Advisors

Preferred Home Health Care & Nursing Services Nursing Services
Professional Education Services Home Instruction
Psychoeducational Consulting Group, LLC Behavioral Evaluations
REALTIME Maintenance of Proprietary Software & User Licenses
Red Fox Engineering P4P Rebates
Republic Services Garbage Removal
Robert Wood Johnson Medical Center Physician of Record
Rutgers University Behavioral Health Care Bedside Instruction

Sal Electric, Inc. Electrical Repairs (Time & Materials)
Sal Electric, Inc. Fire Alarms (Repair, Maintenance & Inspection-Time & Materials)
Samuel Klein & Company Districts Auditing Firm
Sciarillo, Cornell, Merlino, McKeever & Osborne LLC Special Education Attorney
SHI International Inc.
Silvergate Prep Bedside Instruction
Soar the Scores Student and Teacher Statistical Information
Sodexo Management Inc. Food Service Contract

Spitz, Inc. System Protection Plans For SciDome Planetarium System
SRS, Shoprite Food Supplies-Home Economics Classes

Sterling DiSanto & Associates Building Apprasial/Land & Market Valuation
Stress Care of NJ, LLC Psychiatric Evaluations
Summit Speech School Teacher of the Deaf/Itinerant Services
Sunesys LLC District Wide Area Network
TD Equipment Finance Lease Purchase Financing
Temco/Atalian  Building Maintenance Contracted Custodial Services

Tinisha R. Hood Home Instruction
Tokarski & Milleman Architects LLC Architect of Record
UMDNJ-Robert Wood Johnson Medical School District Physician of Record
United States Elevator Quarterly Elevator Maintenance
University Behavioral Health Care Home Instruction
Urutech Elevators Elevator Maintenance
US Bancorp Lease Purchase Financing

Wilentz, Goldman & Spitzer, PA Bond Counsel
Worldwide Gear Graduation Apparel
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6.13.19 19.20 MASTER DATABASE - RENEWAL CONTRACTS
CONTRACT #ROUTE # SCHOOL CONTRACTOR 2018-2019 % INCREASE 2019-2020
B1707 2040 OBHS BROWNTOWN $102.53 1.45% 1.49$       $104.01
C1707 3019 SALK BROWNTOWN $102.53 1.45% 1.49$       $104.01
M1707 1311 MILLER BROWNTOWN $102.53 1.45% 1.49$       $104.01
B1733 2010 OBHS BROWNTOWN $101.31 1.45% 1.47$       $102.78
C1733 3004 SALK BROWNTOWN $101.31 1.45% 1.47$       $102.78
Q1733 1401 SCHIRRA BROWNTOWN $101.31 1.45% 1.47$       $102.78
B1734 2014 OBHS BROWNTOWN $102.42 1.45% 1.49$       $103.91
C1734 3012 SALK BROWNTOWN $102.42 1.45% 1.49$       $103.91
T1734 1603 SOUTHWOOD BROWNTOWN $102.42 1.45% 1.49$       $103.91
B1736 2017 OBHS BROWNTOWN $98.96 1.45% 1.43$       $100.40
D1736 4029 SANDBURG BROWNTOWN $98.96 1.45% 1.43$       $100.40
Q1736 1407 SCHIRRA BROWNTOWN $98.96 1.45% 1.43$       $100.40
B1738 2005 OBHS BROWNTOWN $98.96 1.45% 1.43$       $100.40
D1738 4020 SANDBURG BROWNTOWN $98.96 1.45% 1.43$       $100.40
R1738 1503 SHEPARD W/C BROWNTOWN $98.96 1.45% 1.43$       $100.40
B1739 2016 OBHS BROWNTOWN $98.96 1.45% 1.43$       $100.40
D1739 4021 SANDBURG BROWNTOWN $98.96 1.45% 1.43$       $100.40
T1739 1601 SOUTHWOOD BROWNTOWN $98.96 1.45% 1.43$       $100.40
B1740 2021 OBHS BROWNTOWN $102.53 1.45% 1.49$       $104.01
C1740 3026 SALK BROWNTOWN $102.53 1.45% 1.49$       $104.01
M1740 1301 MILLER BROWNTOWN $102.53 1.45% 1.49$       $104.01
B1741 2058 OBHS BROWNTOWN $98.96 1.45% 1.43$       $100.40
D1741 4030 SANDBURG BROWNTOWN $98.96 1.45% 1.43$       $100.40
Q1741 1419 SCHIRRA BROWNTOWN $98.96 1.45% 1.43$       $100.40
P1810 1068 ST. JOHN VIANNEY BROWNTOWN $151.50 1.45% 2.20$       $153.70
R1810 1501 SHEPARD   BROWNTOWN $142.00 1.45% 2.06$       $144.06
B1811 2050 OBHS BROWNTOWN $101.00 1.45% 1.46$       $102.46
C1811 3028 SALK BROWNTOWN $101.00 1.45% 1.46$       $102.46
M1811 1303 MILLER BROWNTOWN $99.50 1.45% 1.44$       $100.94

V740 4013 E. B. VO. TECH. DURHAM $94.80 1.45% 1.37$        $96.17

K845 1102 MCDIVITT DURHAM $17,576.77 1.45% 254.86$    $17,831.64

P845 1051 ST. BENEDICT'S DURHAM $33,247.65 1.45% 482.09$    $33,729.74

B920 2053 OBHS DURHAM $100.57 1.45% 1.46$        $102.02

D920 4023 SANDBURG DURHAM $100.57 1.45% 1.46$        $102.02

J920 1001 MADISON PARK DURHAM $100.57 1.45% 1.46$        $102.02

P931 1069/1083 ST. JOHN VIANNEY DURHAM $102.59 1.45% 1.49$        $104.08

L931 1210 MEMORIAL DURHAM $146.36 1.45% 2.12$        $148.48

B1701 2008 OBHS DURHAM $100.49 1.45% 1.46$        $101.95

D1701 4011 SANDBURG DURHAM $100.49 1.45% 1.46$        $101.95

G1701 7004 COOPER DURHAM $100.49 1.45% 1.46$        $101.95

B1702 2020 OBHS DURHAM $98.46 1.45% 1.43$        $99.89

C1702 3001 SALK DURHAM $98.46 1.45% 1.43$        $99.89

M1702 1302 MILLER DURHAM $98.46 1.45% 1.43$        $99.89

P1720 1051 ST. AMBROSE DURHAM $76.13 1.45% 1.10$        $77.24

T1720 1606 SOUTHWOOD DURHAM $167.49 1.45% 2.43$        $169.92

AIDE: DURHAM $65.00 $65.00

B1735 2015 OBHS DURHAM $97.45 1.45% 1.41$        $98.86

D1735 4025 SANDBURG DURHAM $97.45 1.45% 1.41$        $98.86

K1735 1103 MCDIVITT DURHAM $97.45 1.45% 1.41$        $98.86

P1742 1052 ST. BENEDICT'S DURHAM $40.60 1.45% 0.59$        $41.19

V1742 4012 EAST BRUNSWICK VO.TECH. DURHAM $263.93 1.45% 3.83$        $267.75

P1745 1055 ST. BENEDICT'S DURHAM $153.28 1.45% 2.22$        $155.50

L1745 1202 MEMORIAL DURHAM $153.28 1.45% 2.22$        $155.50

B1746 2007 OBHS DURHAM $96.43 1.45% 1.40$        $97.83

D1746 4016 SANDBURG DURHAM $96.43 1.45% 1.40$        $97.83

L1746 1201 MEMORIAL DURHAM $96.43 1.45% 1.40$        $97.83

B1808 2035 OBHS DURHAM $144.50 1.45% 2.10$        $146.60

T1808 1605 SOUTHWOOD DURHAM $144.50 1.45% 2.10$        $146.60

B1700 2003 OBHS FIRST STUDENT $109.63 1.45% 1.59$        $111.22

D1700 4004 SANDBURG FIRST STUDENT $109.63 1.45% 1.59$        $111.22

K1700 1101 MCDIVITT FIRST STUDENT $107.09 1.45% 1.55$        $108.65

B1709 2043 OBHS FIRST STUDENT $147.19 1.45% 2.13$        $149.32

C1709 3029 SALK FIRST STUDENT $147.19 1.45% 2.13$        $149.32

B1711 2052 OBHS FIRST STUDENT $147.19 1.45% 2.13$        $149.32

M1711 1307 MILLER FIRST STUDENT $147.19 1.45% 2.13$        $149.32

B1712 2057 OBHS FIRST STUDENT $147.19 1.45% 2.13$        $149.32

C1712 3022 SALK FIRST STUDENT $147.19 1.45% 2.13$        $149.32

P1716 1131 ST. THOMAS FIRST STUDENT $152.27 1.45% 2.21$        $154.47

Y1716 1703 VOORHEES FIRST STUDENT $176.27 1.45% 2.56$        $178.83

P1717 1132 ST. THOMAS FIRST STUDENT $152.27 1.45% 2.21$        $154.47

I1717 9004 GRISSOM FIRST STUDENT $176.27 1.45% 2.56$        $178.83
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P1718 1136 ST. THOMAS FIRST STUDENT $152.27 1.45% 2.21$        $154.47

M1718 1306 MILLER FIRST STUDENT $176.27 1.45% 2.56$        $178.83

P1722 2451 MATER DEI FIRST STUDENT $71.06 1.45% 1.03$        $72.09

Y1722 1712 VOORHEES FIRST STUDENT $247.43 1.45% 3.59$        $251.02

P1723 1064 ST. JOHN VIANNEY FIRST STUDENT $71.06 1.45% 1.03$        $72.09

Y1723 1710 VOORHEES FIRST STUDENT $247.43 1.45% 3.59$        $251.02

P1729 1067 ST. JOHN VIANNEY FIRST STUDENT $43.65 1.45% 0.63$        $44.28

T1729 1608 SOUTHWOOD FIRST STUDENT $274.84 1.45% 3.99$        $278.82

AIDE: FIRST STUDENT $50.00 $50.00

P1730 2051 IMMACULATE CONCEPTION FIRST STUDENT $71.06 1.45% 1.03$        $72.09

E1730 5003 CARPENTER FIRST STUDENT $247.43 1.45% 3.59$        $251.02

AIDE: FIRST STUDENT $50.00 $50.00

P1750 1135 ST. THOMAS FIRST STUDENT $43.65 1.45% 0.63$        $44.28

V1750 4015 EAST BRUNSWICH VO.TECH. FIRST STUDENT $274.84 1.45% 3.99$        $278.82

P1806 1122/1072 BISHOP AHR/ST. JOSEPH'S FIRST STUDENT $75.00 1.45% 1.09$        $76.09

K1806 1108 MCDIVITT FIRST STUDENT $274.00 1.45% 3.97$        $277.97

P1807 1121/1071 BISHOP AHR/ST. JOSEPH'S FIRST STUDENT $75.00 1.45% 1.09$        $76.09

V1807 1707 VOORHEES FIRST STUDENT $274.00 1.45% 3.97$        $277.97

P748 1063/1081 ST. JOHN VIANNEY HELFRICH $197.99 1.45% 2.87$        $200.86

B804 2006 OBHS HELFRICH $16,306.17 1.45% 236.44$    $16,542.61

B807 2011 OBHS HELFRICH $16,306.17 1.45% 236.44$    $16,542.61

B809 2013 OBHS HELFRICH $16,306.17 1.45% 236.44$    $16,542.61

B814 2022 OBHS HELFRICH $16,306.17 1.45% 236.44$    $16,542.61

B816 2025 OBHS HELFRICH $16,306.17 1.45% 236.44$    $16,542.61

B821 2030 OBHS HELFRICH $16,306.17 1.45% 236.44$    $16,542.61

B823 2032 OBHS HELFRICH $16,306.17 1.45% 236.44$    $16,542.61

B825 2037 OBHS HELFRICH $16,306.17 1.45% 236.44$    $16,542.61

B826 2038 OBHS HELFRICH $16,306.17 1.45% 236.44$    $16,542.61

C807 3010 SALK HELFRICH $16,306.17 1.45% 236.44$    $16,542.61

C823 3018 SALK HELFRICH $16,306.17 1.45% 236.44$    $16,542.61

C825 3009 SALK HELFRICH $16,306.17 1.45% 236.44$    $16,542.61

C826 3021 SALK HELFRICH $16,306.17 1.45% 236.44$    $16,542.61

D804 4017 SANDBURG HELFRICH $16,306.17 1.45% 236.44$    $16,542.61

D809 4018 SANDBURG HELFRICH $16,306.17 1.45% 236.44$    $16,542.61

D814 4003 SANDBURG HELFRICH $16,306.17 1.45% 236.44$    $16,542.61

D816 4001 SANDBURG HELFRICH $16,306.17 1.45% 236.44$    $16,542.61

D821 4002 SANDBURG HELFRICH $16,306.17 1.45% 236.44$    $16,542.61

E825 5001 CARPENTER HELFRICH $16,306.17 1.45% 236.44$    $16,542.61

J809 1004 MADISON PARK HELFRICH $16,306.17 1.45% 236.44$    $16,542.61

J816 1003 MADISON PARK HELFRICH $16,306.17 1.45% 236.44$    $16,542.61

J821 7005 COOPER HELFRICH $16,306.17 1.45% 236.44$    $16,542.61

L804 1207 MEMORIAL HELFRICH $16,306.17 1.45% 236.44$    $16,542.61

L814 1205 MEMORIAL HELFRICH $16,306.17 1.45% 236.44$    $16,542.61

T826 1604 SOUTHWOOD HELFRICH $16,306.17 1.45% 236.44$    $16,542.61

Y807 1701 VOORHEES HELFRICH $16,306.17 1.45% 236.44$    $16,542.61

Y823 1705 VOORHEES HELFRICH $16,306.17 1.45% 236.44$    $16,542.61

B919 2051 OBHS HELFRICH $99.46 1.45% 1.44$        $100.90

C919 3003 SALK HELFRICH $99.46 1.45% 1.44$        $100.90

Y919 1706 VOORHEES HELFRICH $99.46 1.45% 1.44$        $100.90

B1704 2031 OBHS IRVIN RAPHAEL $98.04 1.45% 1.42$        $99.46

C1704 3006 SALK IRVIN RAPHAEL $98.04 1.45% 1.42$        $99.46

Q1704 1403 SCHIRRA IRVIN RAPHAEL $98.04 1.45% 1.42$        $99.46

B1705 2036 OBHS IRVIN RAPHAEL $145.67 1.45% 2.11$        $147.78

C1705 3008 SALK IRVIN RAPHAEL $145.67 1.45% 2.11$        $147.78

B1706 2039 OBHS IRVIN RAPHAEL $145.67 1.45% 2.11$        $147.78

C1706 3016 SALK IRVIN RAPHAEL $145.67 1.45% 2.11$        $147.78

B1708 2041 OBHS IRVIN RAPHAEL $145.67 1.45% 2.11$        $147.78

C1708 3020 SALK IRVIN RAPHAEL $145.67 1.45% 2.11$        $147.78

B1713 2060 OBHS IRVIN RAPHAEL $102.86 1.45% 1.49$        $104.35

C1713 3031 SALK IRVIN RAPHAEL $102.86 1.45% 1.49$        $104.35

M1713 1305 MILLER IRVIN RAPHAEL $102.87 1.45% 1.49$        $104.36

B1714 2067 OBHS IRVIN RAPHAEL $145.67 1.45% 2.11$        $147.78

Y1714 1708 VOORHEES IRVIN RAPHAEL $145.67 1.45% 2.11$        $147.78

P1721 1133 ST. THOMAS IRVIN RAPHAEL $60.91 1.45% 0.88$        $61.79

V1721 4014 EAST BRUNSWICH VO.TECH. IRVIN RAPHAEL $242.61 1.45% 3.52$        $246.13

B1737 2044 OBHS IRVIN RAPHAEL $99.81 1.45% 1.45$        $101.26

C1737 3002 SALK IRVIN RAPHAEL $99.81 1.45% 1.45$        $101.26

Y1737 1704 VOORHEES IRVIN RAPHAEL $99.82 1.45% 1.45$        $101.27
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B1747 2048 OBHS IRVIN RAPHAEL $96.43 1.45% 1.40$        $97.83

C1747 3027 SALK IRVIN RAPHAEL $96.43 1.45% 1.40$        $97.83

M1747 1308 MILLER IRVIN RAPHAEL $96.43 1.45% 1.40$        $97.83

V1803 4002 WOODBRIDGE VO.TECH IRVIN RAPHAEL $290.00 1.45% 4.21$        $294.21

P1814 1043 ST. AMBROSE IRVIN RAPHAEL $70.00 1.45% 1.02$        $71.02

Y1814 1714 VOORHEES IRVIN RAPHAEL $205.00 1.45% 2.97$        $207.97

P1816 1139 ST. THOMAS IRVIN RAPHAEL $60.00 1.45% 0.87$        $60.87

K1816 1116 MCDIVITT IRVIN RAPHAEL $219.00 1.45% 3.18$        $222.18

P1817 1047 ST. AMBROSE IRVIN RAPHAEL $50.00 1.45% 0.73$        $50.73

J1817 1005 MADISON PARK IRVIN RAPHAEL $210.00 1.45% 3.05$        $213.05

S1824 3161 CENTER FOR LIFELONG LEARNING SCHOOL DAYZ $125.00 1.45% 1.81$        $126.81

AIDE: SCHOOL DAYZ $45.00 $45.00

S1826 3861 SEARCH DAY SCHOOL DAYZ $130.00 1.45% 1.89$        $131.89

S1828 3572 RUGBY SCHOOL DAYZ $169.00 1.45% 2.45$        $171.45

S1829 3301 NEPTUNE DEAF PROGRAM SCHOOL DAYZ $153.00 1.45% 2.22$        $155.22

S1831 3472 HAWKSWOOD SCHOOL DAYZ $215.00 1.45% 3.12$        $218.12

AIDE: SCHOOL DAYZ $55.00 $55.00

S1837 3661 NEW GRANGE SCHOOL DAYZ $239.00 1.45% 3.47$        $242.47

C714 3017 SALK SHAMROCK $94.01 1.45% 1.36$        $95.37

B800 2001 OBHS SHAMROCK $17,576.77 1.45% 254.86$    $17,831.64

B801 2002 OBHS SHAMROCK $17,576.77 1.45% 254.86$    $17,831.64

D800 4010 SANDBURG SHAMROCK $17,576.77 1.45% 254.86$    $17,831.64

D801 4026 SANDBURG SHAMROCK $17,576.77 1.45% 254.86$    $17,831.64

G800 7003 COOPER SHAMROCK $17,576.77 1.45% 254.86$    $17,831.64

G801 7002 COOPER SHAMROCK $17,576.77 1.45% 254.86$    $17,831.64

S861 3032 CPC LAKEVIEW SHAMROCK $222.73 1.45% 3.23$        $225.96

AIDE: SHAMROCK $41.00 $41.00

S874 3072 CHILDREN'S CENTER SHAMROCK $223.84 1.45% 3.25$        $227.08

AIDE: SHAMROCK $40.00 $40.00

V839 4001 WOODBRIDGE VO. TECH. SHAMROCK $169.94 1.45% 2.46$        $172.40

B904 2012 OBHS SHAMROCK $86.89 1.45% 1.26$        $88.15

D904 4009 SANDBURG SHAMROCK $86.89 1.45% 1.26$        $88.15

G904 7001 COOPER SHAMROCK $86.89 1.45% 1.26$        $88.15

B906 2019 OBHS SHAMROCK $86.89 1.45% 1.26$        $88.15

K906 1109 MCDIVITT SHAMROCK $86.89 1.45% 1.26$        $88.15

B912 2028 OBHS SHAMROCK $86.89 1.45% 1.26$        $88.15

D912 4007 SANDBURG SHAMROCK $86.89 1.45% 1.26$        $88.15

L912 1209 MEMORIAL SHAMROCK $86.89 1.45% 1.26$        $88.15

B922 2055 OBHS SHAMROCK $86.89 1.45% 1.26$        $88.15

D922 4005 SANDBURG SHAMROCK $86.89 1.45% 1.26$        $88.15

L922 1208 MEMORIAL SHAMROCK $86.89 1.45% 1.26$        $88.15

B923 2056 OBHS SHAMROCK $86.89 1.45% 1.26$        $88.15

D923 4013 SANDBURG SHAMROCK $86.89 1.45% 1.26$        $88.15

L923 1213 MEMORIAL SHAMROCK $86.89 1.45% 1.26$        $88.15

P926 1062/1082 ST. JOHN VIANNEY SHAMROCK $139.76 1.45% 2.03$        $141.79

L926 1204 MEMORIAL SHAMROCK $139.80 1.45% 2.03$        $141.83

P1015 1053 ST. AMBROSE SHAMROCK $53.29 1.45% 0.77$        $54.07

R1015 1504 SHEPARD W/C SHAMROCK $178.73 1.45% 2.59$        $181.32

AIDE: SHAMROCK $40.00 $40.00

S1731 3411 ACADEMY LEARNING CENTER SHAMROCK $214.19 1.45% 3.11$        $217.29

AIDE: SHAMROCK $50.00 $50.00

B1813 2070 OBHS SHAMROCK $126.50 1.45% 1.83$        $128.33

K1813 1111 MCDIVITT SHAMROCK $126.50 1.45% 1.83$        $128.33

P1818 1066 ST. JOHN VIANNEY SHAMROCK $66.67 1.45% 0.97$        $67.64

M1818 1309 MILLER SHAMROCK $207.33 1.45% 3.01$        $210.34

B1820 2061 OBHS SHAMROCK $122.00 1.45% 1.77$        $123.77

Y1820 1711 VOORHEES SHAMROCK $122.00 1.45% 1.77$        $123.77

S1825 3162 CENTER FOR LIFELONG LEARNING (W/C) SHAMROCK $244.00 1.45% 3.54$        $247.54

AIDE: SHAMROCK $50.00 $50.00

S1830 3061 SCHROTH SCHOOL/3 W/C SHAMROCK $269.00 1.45% 3.90$        $272.90

AIDE: SHAMROCK $60.00 $60.00

S1832 3471 HAWKSWOOD/2 W/C SHAMROCK $219.00 1.45% 3.18$        $222.18

AIDE: SHAMROCK $50.00 $50.00

S1833 3071 CHILDREN'S CENTER OF MONMOUTH SHAMROCK $269.00 1.45% 3.90$        $272.90

AIDE: SHAMROCK $60.00 $60.00

6.12.19



 

 

Security Drill Statement of Assurance 
 

 

 

Pursuant to 18A:41-1, every principal of a school of two or more rooms, or of a school of one 

room, when located above the first story of a building, shall have at least one fire drill and one 

school security drill each month within the school hours, including any summer months during 

which the school is open for instructional programs. 

 

Schools are required to hold annually a minimum of two of each of the following security drills:  

active shooter, evacuation (non- fire), bomb threat and lockdown. 

   

Once the above requirements are met, additional security drills relating to shelter-in-place, 

reverse evacuation, evacuation to relocation site, testing of school’s notification system and 

procedures, testing of school’s communication system and procedures, tabletop exercise and full 

scale exercise can be practiced to fulfill the requirements of this law. 

 

Districts are required to annually submit this statement to their County Office of Education by 

June 30 of each year. The county office shall additionally send an informational copy to the 

respective county prosecutor's office. 

  

Upon completion, send only the first page of this document and retain the remaining 

documentation for your records.  
 

 

 

 

 

CERTIFICATION 

 

 
I, ______________________________, being the Chief School Administrator of 

_____________________________, do hereby certify that, pursuant to 18A:41-1, all 

requirements have been met relating to the practicing of school security drills. 

 

 

       Date: ___________________________  
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Agenda Session:  06.18.19

Regular Meeting:  06.27.19 Attachment F-4

Package Number Browntown Durham First Student Helfrich Irvin Raphael Jay's K&D Keyport

Package Number 1 NO BID NO BID 263.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

P 1901 NO BID NO BID 263.00/.45/80.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Package Number 2 NO BID NO BID 376.00 NO BID 411.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID

P 1902 NO BID NO BID 58.00/.45 NO BID 82.00/1.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID

L 1902 NO BID NO BID 238.00/.45/80.00 NO BID 233.75/1.95/96.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Package Number 3 NO BID NO BID 345.00 NO BID 291.00 NO BID 205.00 NO BID

S 1903 NO BID NO BID 345.00/.45/80.00 NO BID 291.00/1.95 NO BID 205.00/0.99 NO BID

Package Number 4 NO BID NO BID 345.00 NO BID 291.00 NO BID 190.00 NO BID

S 1904 NO BID NO BID 345.00/1.50/80.00 NO BID 291.00/1.95 NO BID 190.00/1.99 NO BID

Package Number 5 NO BID NO BID 345.00 289.00 291.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

S 1905 NO BID NO BID 345.00/1.50/80.00 289.00/.10/60.00 291.00/1.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Package Number 6 NO BID NO BID 360.00 275.00 291.00 NO BID 190.00 NO BID

S1906 NO BID NO BID 360.00/1.50/80.00 275.00/.10/60.00 291.00/1.95 NO BID 190.00/0.99 NO BIDNOT AWARDED 

Package Number 7 NO BID NO BID 455.00 NO BID 415.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

S 1907 NO BID NO BID 375.00/1.50/80.00 NO BID 319.00/1.95/96.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Package Number 8 NO BID NO BID 375.00 277.00 344.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

V 1908 NO BID NO BID 375.00/1.50/75.00 277.00/.10/60.00 344.00/1.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Package Number 9 NO BID NO BID 340.00 NO BID 339.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

P 1909 NO BID NO BID 120.00/.45/40.00 NO BID 138.00/1.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID

B 1909 NO BID NO BID 220.00/.45/40.00 NO BID 201.00/1.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Package Number 10 NO BID NO BID 380.00 NO BID 411.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID

D 1910 NO BID NO BID 160.00/.45/40.00 NO BID 157.00/1.95/48.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

J 1910 NO BID NO BID 140.00/.45/40.00 NO BID 158.75/1.95/48.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Package Number 11 338.70 360.00 345.00 NO BID 328.00 510.00 NO BID 294.00

B 1911 112.90/1.50 120.00/0.01 115.00/.45/25.00 NO BID 110.00/1.95 140.00/0.01/30.00 NO BID 98.00/1.25/20.00

D 1911 112.90/1.50 120.00/0.01 115.00/.45/25.00 NO BID 110.00/1.95 140.00/0.01/30.00 NO BID 98.00/1.25/20.00

R 1911 112.90/1.50 120.00/0.01 115.00/.45/25.00 NO BID 108.00/1.95 140.00/0.01/30.00 NO BID 98.00/1.25/20.00

Package Number 12 328.00 360.00 345.00 NO BID 328.00 510.00 NO BID 294.00

B 1912 109.50/1.50 120.00/0.01 115.00/.45/25.00 NO BID 110.00/1.95 140.00/0.01/30.00 NO BID 98.00/1.25/20.00

D 1912 109.50/1.50 120.00/0.01 115.00/.45/25.00 NO BID 110.00/1.95 140.00/0.01/30.00 NO BID 98.00/1.25/20.00

R 1912 109.00/1.50 120.00/0.01 115.00/.45/25.00 NO BID 108.00/1.95 140.00/0.01/30.00 NO BID 98.00/1.25/20.00

Package Number 13 328.00 360.00 345.00 NO BID 328.00 510.00 NO BID NO BID

B 1913 109.50/1.50 120.00/0.01 115.00/.45/25.00 NO BID 110.00/1.95 140.00/0.01/30.00 NO BID NO BID

C 1913 109.50/1.50 120.00/0.01 115.00/.45/25.00 NO BID 110.00/1.95 140.00/0.01/30.00 NO BID NO BID

K 1913 109.00/1.50 120.00/0.01 115.00/.45/25.00 NO BID 108.00/1.95 140.00/0.01/30.00 NO BID NO BID

Package Number 14 328.00 360.00 345.00 NO BID 328.00 510.00 NO BID NO BID

B 1914 109.50/1.50 120.00/0.01 115.00/.45/25.00 NO BID 110.00/1.95 140.00/0.01/30.00 NO BID NO BID

D 1914 109.50/1.50 120.00/0.01 115.00/.45/25.00 NO BID 110.00/1.95 140.00/0.01/30.00 NO BID NO BID

J 1914 109.00/1.50 120.00/0.01 115.00/.45/25.00 NO BID 108.00/1.95 140.00/0.01/30.00 NO BID NO BID

Package Number 15 358.00 360.00 345.00 285.00 328.00 510.00 NO BID NO BID

B 1915 119.50/1.50 120.00/0.01 115.00/.45/25.00 95.00/.10/30.00 110.00/1.95 140.00/0.01/30.00 NO BID NO BID

D 1915 119.50/1.50 120.00/0.01 115.00/.45/25.00 95.00/.10/30.00 110.00/1.95 140.00/0.01/30.00 NO BID NO BID

L 1915 119.00/1.50 120.00/0.01 115.00/.45/25.00 95.00/.10/30.00 108.00/1.95 140.00/0.01/30.00 NO BID NO BID

Package Number 16 358.00 360.00 345.00 330.00 328.00 510.00 NO BID 294.00

B 1916 119.50/1.50 120.00/0.01 115.00/.45/25.00 110.00/.10/30.00 110.00/1.95 140.00/0.01/30.00 NO BID 98.00/1.25/20.00

D 1916 119.50/1.50 120.00/0.01 115.00/.45/25.00 110.00/.10/30.00 110.00/1.95 140.00/0.01/30.00 NO BID 98.00/1.25/20.00

L 1916 119.00/1.50 120.00/0.01 115.00/.45/25.00 110.00/.10/30.00 108.00/1.95 140.00/0.01/30.00 NO BID 98.00/1.25/20.00

                                                                                   MASTER BID TABULATION SHEET
June 13, 2019   11:00 AM

Bid #19-109
Transportation Routes


