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NORTH LITTLE ROCK SCHOOL DISTRICT
OFFICE OF THE SUPERINTENDENT

AGENDA

Regular Meeting - Board of Education
Administration Building

2700 Poplar Street
North Little Rock, Arkansas 72115

Thursday, July 20, 2017 05:30 PM

I.  CALL TO ORDER

Darrell Montgomery, President

II.  INVOCATION

III.  FLAG SALUTE

IV.  MISSION STATEMENT AND VISION STATEMENT

Mission Statement:
The North Little Rock School District and the Community will provide for achievement, accountability, acceptance and the
necessary assets in the pursuit of each student’s educational success.

Vision Statement:
World Class Schools for World Class Students

V.  ROLL CALL OF MEMBERS

Sandi Campbell
Luke King
Darrell Montgomery
Taniesha Richardson-Wiley
Tracy Steele
Scott Teague
Dorothy Williams

VI.  DISPOSITION OF MINUTES OF PRIOR MEETINGS
Special Board Meeting Minutes - June 8 2017.pdf (p. 5)

Regular Board Meeting Minutes - June 15 2017.pdf (p. 6)

Special Board Meeting Minutes - July 13 2017.pdf (p. 9)

VII.  ACTION ITEMS - NEW BUSINESS
1.  Consent Agenda

Presenter: Kelly Rodgers, Superintendent
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a.  Monthly Financial Reports

b.  Employment of Personnel

Employment of Personnel - July 2017 Revised.pdf (p. 11)

c.  Business Office Items

Business Office Items - July 2017.pdf (p. 15)

d.  Building Use Request

Little Rock Wind Symphony - July 2017.pdf (p. 18)

Rose City Community Church of Christ - July 2017.pdf (p. 21)

e.  Payment of Regular Bills

2.  Employment of Campus Administrators

3.  North Little Rock Middle School Construction Renovation
Presenter: Mr. Rodgers, Superintendent

North Little Rock Middle School Construction - July 2017.pdf (p. 23)

4.  2017 Annual Election Documents
Presenter: Mr. Rodgers, Superintendent

2017 Annual School Election Resolution - July 2017.pdf (p. 28)

Early Voting Notices - July 2017 (p. 30)

2018-2019 Proposed Budget of Expenditures - July 2017.doc (p. 33)

5.  Resolution to Transfer Fund Balances
Presenter: Brian Brown, Interim Executive Director of Business Operations

RESOLUTION to Transfer District Savings Fund Balance - July 2017.docx (p. 35)

6.  2016-2017 Audit Engagement Letter Hudson Cisne and Co.
Presenter: Brian Brown, Interim Executive Director of Business Operations

2016-2017 Audit Engagement Letter - Hudson Cisne and Co..pdf (p. 36)

7.  2017-2018 Child Nutrition Bids
Presenter: Marsha Satterfield, Director of Child Nutrition

a.  Diary Bids

2017-2018 Child Nutrition Dairy Bid - July 2017.pdf (p. 44)

b.  Bakery Bid

2017-2018 Child Nutrition Bakery Bid - July 2017.docx (p. 45)

8.  Office for Civil Rights (OCR) Resolution
Presenter: Dr. Beth Shumate, Deputy Superintendent

NLRSD and Office for Civil Rights Resolution Agreement - July 2017 Revised.pdf (p. 46)

9.  MOU - Pulaski Technical College
Presenter: Dr. Beth Shumate, Deputy Superintendent

NLRSD MOU -Pulaski Tech College.pdf (p. 50)
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10.  2017-2018 Legal Transfers
Presenter: Micheal Stone, Executive Director of Student and Equity Services

2017-2018 Legal Transfers - July 2017.pdf (p. 62)

VIII.  CALENDAR OF EVENTS

Administrators Training 
North Little Rock Middle School Cafeteria
Tuesday, July 25, 2017 (All Administrators)
Wednesday, July 26, 2017 (ACT Aspire Assessment Data Workshop by ADE Team)

Administrators Training
Elementary and Secondary Planning and Work
North Little Rock Chamber of Commerce
Thursday, July 27, 2017

AAEA Summer Conference
Marriott Hotel & Statehouse Convention Center
Monday, July 31, 2017 - Wednesday, August 2, 2017

Board Workshop
Administration Office Boardroom
Thursday, August 3, 2017
5:30 p.m.

New Teacher Luncheon
North Little Rock, Middle School Cafeteria
Friday, August 4
11:30 am

First Day of School
Monday, August 14, 2017

Regular Board Meeting
Administration Office Boardroom
Thursday, August 17, 2017
5:30 p.m.

IX.  MID YEAR REVIEW OF SUPERINTENDENT'S PROFESSIONAL
GROWTH PLAN

X.  ADJOURNMENT
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NORTH LITTLE ROCK SCHOOL DISTRICT
OFFICE OF THE SUPERINTENDENT

AGENDA

Special Board Meeting
Meeting Minutes

Administration Office
2700 N. Poplar

North Little Rock, AR 72115
Thursday, June 8, 2017 05:30 PM

I.  Call to Order

President Darrell Montgomery called the meeting to order at 5:30 pm.

II.  Roll Call of Members

Present:                                                                          Absent: 
Sandi Campbell                                                              None
Luke King
Darrell Montgomery
Taniesha Richardson-Wiley
Tracy Steele
Scott Teague
Dorothy Williams

III.  New Business

1.  Employment of Personnel

The Board went into a closed executive session at 5:31 pm and recovened in open session at 6:28 pm.

Motion
Scott Teague moved to accept the employment of personnel as presented and printed on the agenda. Sandi Cambpell
seconded the motion.

YEAS: Campbell, King, Montgomery, Richardson-Wiley, Steele, Teague, Williams
NAYS: None

IV.  Adjournment

Motion
Dorothy Williams moved to adjourn the meeting. Scott Teague seconded the motion.

YEAS: Campbell, King, Montgomery, Steele, Teague, and Williams
NAYS: None

President Montgomery declared the meeting adjourned at 6:30 pm.

________________________________                                         _______________________________________
Darrell Montgomery, President                                                         Rhonda Colquitt, Recording Secretary
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NORTH LITTLE ROCK SCHOOL DISTRICT
OFFICE OF THE SUPERINTENDENT

AGENDA

Regular Meeting - Board of Education
Meeting Minutes

Administration Building
2700 Poplar Street

North Little Rock, Arkansas 72115
Thursday, June 15, 2017 05:30 PM

PUBLIC COMMENTS

I.  CALL TO ORDER

President Darrell Montgomery called the meeting to order at 5:30 pm.

II.  ROLL CALL OF MEMBERS

Present:
Sandi Campbell
Luke King
Darrell Montgomery
Taniesha Richardson-Wiley
Tracy Steele
Scott Teague

Absent:
Dorothy Williams

III.  DISPOSITION OF MINUTES OF PRIOR MEETINGS

Motion: 
Scott Teague moved to accept the regular Board meeting minutes Thursday, May 18, 2017. Sandi Campbell seconded the
motion.

YEAS: Campbell, King, Montgomery, Richardson-Wiley, Steele, Teague
NAYS: Williams - absent

1.  Regular Board Meeting - Thursday, May 18, 2017

IV.  ACTION ITEMS - NEW BUSINESS

1.  Consent Agenda

Motion:
Scott Teague moved to accept the consent agenda (monthly financial reports, employment of personnel, business office items,
and payment of regular bills) as presented and printed on the agenda. Luke King seconded the motion.

YEAS: Campbell, King, Montgomery, Richardson-Wiley, Steele, Teague
NAYS: Williams - absent

2.  Employment of Administrative Personnel
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Motion:
Darrell Montgomery moved to accept the employment of administrative personnel with Scott Jennings as the principal of
North Little Rock High School. Luke King seconded the motion.

YEAS: Campbell, King, Montgomery, Richardson-Wiley, Steele, Teague
NAYS: Williams - absent

3.  Organization Chart Changes

Motion:
Luke King moved to accept administration's recommendation on the organization chart with the following changes as
presented Henry Anderson, Executive Director of AP, ESL, GT, Secondary Education and Testing; Brian Brown, Interim
Executive Director of Business Operations;  and  Julie Drake, Coordinator of Public Information Community and Parent
Involvement. Scott Teague seconded the motion.

YEAS: Campbell, King, Montgomery, Richardson-Wiley, Steele, Teague
NAYS: Williams - absent

4.  Policy Updates

a.  Section 1 - Board Governance and Operations

Motion:
Scott Teague moved to accept policy changes to Section 1 - Board Governance Operations as presented and printed on the
agenda. Tracy Steele seconded the motion.

YEAS: Campbell, King, Montgomery, Richardson-Wiley, Steele, Teague
NAYS: Williams - absent

b.  Section 3 - Licensed Personnel Policies

Motion:
Luke King moved to accept policy changes to Section 3 -  Licensed Personnel Policies as presented and printed on the
agenda. Sandi Campbell seconded the motion.

YEAS: Campbell, King, Montgomery, Richardson-Wiley, Steele, Teague
NAYS: Williams - absent

c.  Section 4 - Students

Motion:
Scott Teague moved to accept policy changes to Section 4 - Students as presented and printed on the agenda. Luke King
seconded the motion.

YEAS: Campbell, King, Montgomery, Richardson-Wiley, Steele, Teague
NAYS: Williams - absent

d.  Wellness Policy 5.29

Motion:
Tracy Steele moved to accept policy changes to the Wellness policy - 5.29 as presented and printed on the agenda.
Taniesha Richardson-Wiley seconded the motion.

YEAS: Campbell, King, Montgomery, Richardson-Wiley, Steele, Teague
NAYS: Williams - absent

e.  Section 6 - School, Home and Community

Motion:
Scott Teague moved to accept policy changes to Section 6 - School, Home, Community as presented and printed on the
agenda. Sandi Campbell seconded the motion.

YEAS: Campbell, King, Montgomery, Richardson-Wiley, Steele, Teague
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NAYS: Williams - absent

5.  Legal Transfers

Motion:
Tracy Steele moved to accept the legal transfers as presented and printed on the agenda. Taniesha Richardson-Wiley
seconded the motion.

YEAS: Campbell, King, Montgomery, Richardson-Wiley, Steele, Teague
NAYS: Williams - absent

6.  Resolution for one-cent Sales Tax

The North Little Rock School District whereby we appreciate the support with the city of North Little Rock, we do hereby
support the one-cent increase in the city sales tax to be considered in a special election on August 8, 2017 and do authorize
the Board President and Superintendent to participate in marketing campaigns.

Motion:
Luke King moved to accept the resolution for one-cent sales tax as presented and printed on the agenda. Sandi Campbell
seconded the motion.

YEAS: Campbell, King, Montgomery, Richardson-Wiley, Teague
NAYS: Steele and (Williams - absent)
 

7.  3.1.1 Licensed Personnel Extra Compensation - Teacher/Administrator Salary Schedule

Motion:
Luke King moved to accept administration's recommendation to accept the following changes to 3.1.1 Licensed Personnel
Extra Compensation - Teacher/Administrator Salary Schedule. To change the position increment percent for middle school
assistant principals from 14% to 16%, high school assistant principals from 16% to 18%; and the census count (from the
October high school student enrollment numbers) for the high school principal is $5/per student. Scott Teague seconded the
motion.

YEAS: Campbell, King, Montgomery, Richardson-Wiley, Steele, Teague
NAYS: Williams - absent

V.  EMPLOYEE HEARING

Motion:
Luke King moved that the School Board finds that the grievance filed by Samantha Salaam is not a grievable issue. Scott Teague
seconded the motion.

YEAS: Campbell, King, Montgomery, Teague
NAYS: Richardson-Wiley, Steele and (Williams - absent)

VI.  ADJOURNMENT

Motion:
Luke King moved to adjourn the meeting. Scott Teague seconded the motion.

YEAS: Campbell, King, Montgomery, Richardson-Wiley, Steele, Teague
NAYS: Williams - absent

President Darrell Montgomery declared the meeting adjourned at 8:00 pm. 

____________________________                          ________________________________
Darrell Montgomery, President                                   Rhonda Colquitt, Recording Secretary
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NORTH LITTLE ROCK SCHOOL DISTRICT
OFFICE OF THE SUPERINTENDENT

AGENDA

Special Board Meeting
Meeting Minutes

Thursday, July 13, 2017 05:30 PM

I.  CALL TO ORDER

President Darrell Montgomery called the meeting to order at 5:30 pm.

II.  Roll Call of Members

Present:                                                                         Absent:  
Sandi Campbell                                                              None
Luke King
Darrell Montgomery
Taniesha Richardson-Wiley
Tracy Steele
Scott Teague
Dorothy Williams

III.  ACTION ITEMS - NEW BUSINESS

1.  Employment of Personnel

Motion:
Dorothy Williams moved to accept the employment of personnel as presented and printed on the agenda. Sandi Campbell
seconded the motion.

YEAS: Campbell, King, Montgomery, Richardson-Wiley, Steele, Teague, Williams
NAYS: None

2.  North Little Rock Sister City Transportation

Motion:
Luke King moved to accept the North Little Rock Sister City Transportation agreement as presented and printed on the
agenda. Sandi Campbell seconded the motion.

YEAS:  Campbell, King, Montgomery, Steele, Teague, Williams
NAYS:  Richardson-Wiley

3.  2017-2018 Board to Board Transfers

Motion:
Dorothy Williams moved to accept the 2017-2018 Board to Board transfers as presented and printed on the agenda. Scott
Teague seconded the motion.

YEAS: Campbell, King, Montgomery, Richardson-Wiley, Steele, Teague, Williams
NAYS: None

IV.  ADJOURNMENT
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Motion:
Luke King moved to adjourn the meeting. Dorothy Williams seconded the motion.

YEAS: Campbell, King, Montgomery, Richardson-Wiley, Steele, Teague, Williams
NAYS: None

President Montgomery declared the meeting adjourned at 5:39 pm.

_________________________                         _______________________________
Darrell Montgomery, President                           Rhonda Colquitt, Recording Secretary
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*            Did not meet specifications 
**           Part of all or no bid 
***         Quality not recommended 
****        Limited Coverage 
*****       Recommended 
******      Recommended Pending Contract Negotiation                     

 

 

NORTH LITTLE ROCK SCHOOL DISTRICT 
BUSINESS OFFICE ITEMS FOR CONSENT AGENDA APPROVAL 

July 20, 2017 
 
 
ITEM: Commercial Property Insurance 
ITEM DESCRIPTION: Commercial Property Insurance 
COMPETITIVE BID: NA 
BID NAME: NA 
SOURCE OF FUNDING:  Operating 
LOCATION: District Wide 
 
Arkansas Insurance Department Risk Management  $367,375.71***** 
 
 
ITEM: Commercial Vehicle Insurance 
ITEM DESCRIPTION: Commercial Vehicle Insurance 
COMPETITIVE BID: NA 
BID NAME: NA 
SOURCE OF FUNDING:  Operating 
LOCATION: District Wide 
 
Arkansas Insurance Department Risk Management  $130,790.00***** 
 
 
ITEM: Jumbo Tissue 
ITEM DESCRIPTION: Jumbo Tissue 
COMPETITIVE BID: Yes 
BID NAME: State Contract # SP14-0125 
SOURCE OF FUNDING:  Operating 
LOCATION: District Wide 
 
American Paper & Twine Co.     $11,739.70***** 
 
 
ITEM: Bakery Bid 
ITEM DESCRIPTION: Bakery Bid 
COMPETITIVE BID: Bakery Bid 
BID NAME: Bakery Bid 
SOURCE OF FUNDING:  Child Nutrition 
LOCATION: District Wide 
 
Harris Baking Company      $43,430.00***** 
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*            Did not meet specifications 
**           Part of all or no bid 
***         Quality not recommended 
****        Limited Coverage 
*****       Recommended 
******      Recommended Pending Contract Negotiation                     

 

 

 
 
 
 
ITEM: Gateway Annual License Fee (Registration), Professional Services & Hosting Services 
ITEM DESCRIPTION: Gateway Annual License Fee (Registration), Professional Services & Hosting Services 
COMPETITIVE BID: NA 
BID NAME: NA 
SOURCE OF FUNDING:  Operating 
LOCATION: District Wide 
 
SRC Solutions Inc.      $39,000.00***** 
 
 
ITEM: Website Hosting 
ITEM DESCRIPTION: Website Hosting 
COMPETITIVE BID: NA 
BID NAME: NA 
SOURCE OF FUNDING:  Operating 
LOCATION:  District Wide 
 
Apptegy       $19,794.00***** 
 
 
ITEM: Scrubbers (2) & Vacuums (11) 
ITEM DESCRIPTION: Scrubbers (2) & Vacuums (11) 
COMPETITIVE BID: Yes 
BID NAME: Tips/Taps # 2082715 
SOURCE OF FUNDING: Operating 
LOCATION:  District Wide 
 
Datek        $21,371.04***** 
 
 
ITEM: Read 180 Program 
ITEM DESCRIPTION: Read 180 Program 
COMPETITIVE BID: NA 
BID NAME: NA 
SOURCE OF FUNDING: Title I 
LOCATION:  NLRMS & NLRHS 
 
Houghton Mifflin Harcourt     $35,740.81***** 
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*            Did not meet specifications 
**           Part of all or no bid 
***         Quality not recommended 
****        Limited Coverage 
*****       Recommended 
******      Recommended Pending Contract Negotiation                     

 

 

 
 
 
 
ITEM: Dell Chromebooks (100) & OS Management License (100) 
ITEM DESCRIPTION: Dell Chromebooks (100) & OS Management License (100) 
COMPETITIVE BID: Yes 
BID NAME: Tips/Taps # 2062515 
SOURCE OF FUNDING:  Title IIA 
LOCATION:  District Wide 
 
White River Services      $26,236.00***** 
 
 
ITEM: Dell Laptops (6) & Dell Thunderbolt Dock (6) 
ITEM DESCRIPTION: Dell Laptops (6) & Dell Thunderbolt Dock (6) 
COMPETITIVE BID: Yes 
BID NAME:  Tips/Taps # 2062515 
SOURCE OF FUNDING:  Operating 
LOCATION:  Business Office 
 
White River Services      $10,995.32***** 
 
 
ITEM:  SpedTrack Annual Subscription Fees 
ITEM DESCRIPTION: SpedTrack Annual Subscription Fees 
COMPETITIVE BID: NA 
BID NAME: NA 
SOURCE OF FUNDING: Special Education 
LOCATION:  District Wide 
 
SpedTrack       $12,600.00***** 
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RESOLUTION 
 
 

 WHEREAS, the annual school election in the North Little Rock School District No. 1 of 
Pulaski County, Arkansas is scheduled for September 19, 2017; 
 
 WHEREAS, the county board of election commissioners (the “County Board”) is charged 
with the responsibility of preparing the ballot and setting the polling places; 
 
 WHEREAS, A.C.A. §6-14-111(b) provides that the County Board shall place on the 
ballots as candidates for school districts directors names of any qualified voters whose names 
have been filed and verified by the county clerk at least seventy (70) days before the annual 
school election; 
 
 WHEREAS, only one candidate for school district director has filed (per position) with the 
county clerk at least forty-five days prior to the annual school election; 
 
 WHEREAS, no write-in candidate for school district director has notified the County 
Board of his or her intention to be a write-in candidate; 
 
 WHEREAS, the proposed millage rate for the 2018-19 school year is the current millage 
rate; 
 
 WHEREAS, no other ballot issues will be submitted to the electors for consideration; and 
 
 WHEREAS, A.C.A. §6-14-102(c)(1) provides that in any election year, if no more than 
one candidate for school district director (per position) has presented a petition or notice in 
writing to the County Board as required by A.C.A. §6-14-111 and if there are no ballot issues to 
be submitted to district electors for consideration, the board of directors may, by resolution, 
request the County Board to open no polling places on election day so that the election can be 
conducted by absentee ballot and early voting only. 
 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Board of Directors of the North Little Rock 
School District No. 1 of Pulaski County, Arkansas: 
 
 Section 1.  That since only one (1) candidate for school district director (per position) has 
presented a petition or notice in writing to the County Board as required by §6-14-111 and since 
there are no other ballot issues to be submitted to the district electors for consideration, with the 
exception of the local tax rate which rate is not being changed or restructured, the Board of 
Directors (the “Board”) hereby requests the County Board to open no polling places on the day 
of the annual election and to conduct the election only by absentee ballot and early voting. 
 
 Section 2.  That the Board hereby authorizes the President of the Board to present this 
Resolution to the County Board. 
 
 Section 3.  That all Resolutions in conflict herewith are repealed to the extent of such 
conflict. 
 
 Section 4.  That this Resolution shall be in full force and effect from and after its 
adoption. 
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CERTIFICATE 

 
 
 I, THE UNDERSIGNED, Secretary of the Board of Directors of the above District, certify 
the foregoing to be a true copy of a Resolution duly adopted by the Board at a regular meeting 
of the Board held on the ________day of _____________, 2017.  The Resolution appears in 
the official minutes of the meeting which are in my custody.  At the time of the meeting the duly 
elected (or appointed), qualified and serving members of the Board and their respective votes 
on the adoption of the Resolution were as follows: 
 
  Director                         Vote 
                  (Aye, Nay, Abstain, or Absent) 
 
 
             
 
             
 
             
 
             
 
             
 
             
 
             
 
 
 I further certify that the meeting of the Board was duly convened and held in all respects 
according to law; that to the extent required by law due and proper notice of the meeting was 
given to the members of the Board and to the public; that the meeting was open to the public, 
that a legal quorum was present throughout the meeting; that all other requirements and 
proceedings under the law incident to the proper adoption and passage of the Resolution have 
been duly fulfilled, carried out and otherwise observed; and that I am authorized to execute this 
Certificate. 
 
 CERTIFIED under my hand and seal of the District this ______ day of ______________, 
2017.      
 
 
             
      Secretary 
 
 
(SEAL)
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NOTICE OF ANNUAL SCHOOL ELECTION IN
NORTH LITTLE ROCK SCHOOL DISTRICT NO. 1

OF PULASKI COUNTY, ARKANSAS

In accordance with the requirements of Ark. Code Ann. §6-14-109, notice is hereby given
that the annual school election in the above named school district will be held on September 19,
2017, for the following purposes:

To elect ___1__ member to the Board of Directors for a term of __3__ years;

To submit the question of voting a total school tax rate (state and local) of 48.3 mills on
the  dollar  of  the  assessed  value  of  taxable  property  located  in  this  School  District.   The
proposed tax includes the uniform rate of tax (the “Statewide Uniform Rate”) to be collected on
all taxable property in the State and remitted to the State Treasurer pursuant to Amendment No.
74 to the Arkansas Constitution to be used solely for maintenance and operation of schools in
the State. As provided in Amendment No. 74, the Statewide Uniform Rate replaces a portion of
the existing rate of tax levied by this School District and available for maintenance and operation
of schools in this District. The total proposed school tax levy of  48.3 mills includes  25.0 mills
specifically  voted  for  general  maintenance  and  operation  and  23.3 mills  for  debt  service
previously  voted  as  a  continuing  levy  pledged  for  the  retirement  of  existing  bonded
indebtedness.  The surplus revenues produced each year by debt service millage may be used
by the District for other school purposes.

The total proposed school tax levy of 48.3 mills represents the same rate presently being
collected.

The polls will open at 7:30 a.m. and will close at 7:30 p.m. at the following polling places:

Ward or
Precinct Polling Place

Early Voting:
Pulaski County Regional Bldg., 501 W. Markham St., Little Rock beginning Tuesday, September
12, 2017 through Friday, September 15, 2017 and Monday, September 18, 2017 between the
hours of 8:00 a.m. and 5:00 p.m. on weekdays.  No Saturday Early Voting.

BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF NORTH LITTLE
ROCK SCHOOL  DISTRICT  NO.  1 OF
PULASKI COUNTY, ARKANSAS 

                                                                         By                                                                                                                                                                                                                              
                                                                                                          Secretary 

___________________________________________________________________________
INSTRUCTIONS:  Fill in polling places for each ward or precinct as designated by the County
Board of Election Commissioners.  Check Early Voting information.  Publish once a week for
three consecutive weeks in a newspaper published in Pulaski County.  The first publication must
be not later than twenty (20) days before the election.
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NOTICE OF POLLING SITES FOR
ANNUAL SCHOOL ELECTION IN 

NORTH LITTLE ROCK SCHOOL DISTRICT NO. 1
OF PULASKI COUNTY, ARKANSAS

In accordance with the requirements of Ark. Code Ann. §6-14-106, notice is hereby given
that:

(1) The school has chosen to hold their election with Absentee and Early Voting only.
No polls will be open on Election Day. The School has no candidates with opposition and there
will be no change in millage. Absentee and Early Voting will be held in the offices of the Pulaski
County Election Commission, 501 W. Markham (Pulaski County Regional Building), Little Rock,
Arkansas, beginning  Tuesday, September 12, 2017 through Friday, September 15, 2017 and
Monday, September 18, 2017, during the hours of 8:00 a.m. until 5:00 p.m.

(2) No polling site has been changed since the 2016 annual school election.

BOARD  OF  DIRECTORS  OF  NORTH
LITTLE ROCK SCHOOL DISTRICT  NO. 1
OF PULASKI COUNTY, ARKANSAS

                                                                                                                                                                                    
Secretary of the Board

INSTRUCTIONS: Fill in wards or precincts and polling sites in (1) as designated by the County 
Board of Election Commissioners.  List in (2) those wards or precincts for which the polling site 
has changed since the 2016 annual school election and the former polling sites.  If there have 
been no changes in polling sites, (2) may be deleted and replaced with the following statement: 
“(2) No polling site has been changed since the 2016 annual school election.” Check Early 
Voting information.  Publish this notice one time in a newspaper or newspapers with general 
circulation in each county in which any part of the territory of the District is located. The 
publication must be not more than ten (10) days and not less than three (3) days prior to the 
school election. 
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NORTH LITTLE ROCK
SCHOOL DISTRICT

SUGGESTED MOTION:

To adopt the attached Proposed Budget of Expenditures with Tax

Levy  for  Fiscal  Year  Beginning  July  1,  2018  to  and  including

June 30, 2019 and to approve all related election documents.
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PROPOSED BUDGET OF EXPENDITURES
WITH TAX LEVY FOR FISCAL YEAR

BEGINNING JULY 1, 2018 TO AND INCLUDING JUNE 30, 2019

The Board of Directors of North Little Rock School District No. 1 of Pulaski County, Arkansas, in
compliance with the requirements of Amendments No. 40 and No. 74 to the Constitution of the State of
Arkansas and of Ark. Code Ann. § 6-13-622 has prepared, approved and hereby makes public the
proposed budget of expenditures, together with the tax rate, as follows:

1. Salary Fund Expenditures $ 57,817,897

2. Instructional Expense $ 26,311,404

3. Maintenance & Operation Expense $ 8,734,001

4. Dedicated M & O Expense $ 0

5. Pupil Transportation Expense $ 4,812,217

6. Other Operating Expense $ 1,719,474

7. Non-Bonded Debt Payment $ 460,113

8. Bonded Debt Payment $ 12,481,038

To provide for the foregoing proposed budget of expenditures, the Board of Directors proposes a
total  school  tax rate (state and local)  of  48.3  mills  on the dollar  of  the assessed value of  taxable
property  located  in  this  School  District.   The  proposed  tax  includes  the  uniform  rate  of  tax  (the
“Statewide Uniform Rate”) to be collected on all taxable property in the State and remitted to the State
Treasurer  pursuant  to  Amendment  No.  74  to  the  Arkansas  Constitution  to  be  used  solely  for
maintenance and operation of schools in the State.  As provided in Amendment No. 74, the Statewide
Uniform Rate replaces a portion of the existing rate of tax levied by this School District and available for
maintenance and operation of schools in this District.  The total proposed school tax levy of 48.3 mills
includes  25.0  mills specifically voted for general maintenance and operation and  23.3  mills voted for
debt  service  previously  voted  as  a  continuing  levy  pledged  for  the  retirement  of  existing  bonded
indebtedness.  The surplus revenues produced each year by debt service millage may be used by the
District for other school purposes.  

The total proposed school tax levy of 48.3 mills represents the same rate presently being levied.

GIVEN this ______ day of ____________, 2017.

BOARD  OF  DIRECTORS  OF  NORTH  LITTLE  ROCK
SCHOOL  DISTRICT  NO.  1  OF  PULASKI  COUNTY,
ARKANSAS

                President of Board

               Secretary of Board

INSTRUCTIONS:  After its adoption, publish budget one time in a newspaper published in Pulaski County, not 
later than sixty days prior to the election date.
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RESOLUTION

I move to transfer district savings that exceeds the legal fund balance in the operating fund in 
excess of 12,800,000 to the building fund.

_____________________________                                                               _____________
Board President                                                                                                Date

_____________________________
Board Secretary

Packet page 35 of 64



Packet page 36 of 64



Packet page 37 of 64



Packet page 38 of 64



Packet page 39 of 64



Packet page 40 of 64



Packet page 41 of 64



Packet page 42 of 64



Packet page 43 of 64



These are the milk bids for the 2017-2018 school year: 

Go Fresh 

Chocolate-.2871 

White-.2871 

Flavored-.2871 

Whole White-.2871 

 

Sysco Foods 

Chocolate-.2988 

White-.2960 

Flavored-no bid 

Whole White-.3172 

 

***Hiland Dairy 

Chocolate-.2900 

White-.2900 

Flavored-.2900 

Whole White-.2900 

 

Hiland Dairy was selected due to plant location and delivery options 
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Child Nutrition 2017-2018 Bids under $100,000 per vendor bid

Bakery Bid

Harris Baking Company $43,430.00
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RESOLUTION AGREEMENT 
 

North Little Rock School District (NLRSD) 

OCR Reference No. 06-16-1305 
 
The U.S. Department of Education, Office for Civil Rights (OCR), initiated an investigation into 

allegations that the North Little Rock School District (“the Recipient”) violated Section 504 of the 

Rehabilitation Act of 1973 and its implementing regulation at 34 C.F.R. Part 104, and Title II of the 

Americans with Disabilities Act of 1990 and its implementing regulation at 28 C.F.R. Part 35.  

Specifically, the complainant alleged that the Recipient’s website contains barriers to access for people 

with disabilities, thereby denying them an equal opportunity to participate in the Recipient’s programs, 

services, and activities and denying them effective communication necessary for full participation in 

the Recipient’s programs, services, and activities.  

 

Prior to the completion of OCR’s investigation, the recipient agreed to resolve the issue of this 

investigation pursuant to Section 302 of OCR’s Case Processing Manual (CPM). This resolution has 

been entered into voluntarily between the parties and does not constitute admissions that the recipient 

is not in compliance with Section 504, Title II and/or their implementing regulations. Accordingly, to 

ensure compliance with Section 504 and Title II and their implementing regulations and to resolve the 

issues of this investigation, the recipient voluntarily agrees to take the actions set forth below.  

 

Assurances of Nondiscrimination.  The Recipient hereby reaffirms its commitment to ensure that 

people with disabilities have an opportunity equal to that of their nondisabled peers to participate in the 

Recipient’s programs, benefits, and services, including those delivered through electronic and 

information technology, except where doing so would impose an undue burden or create a fundamental 

alteration.   

 

Benchmarks for Measuring Accessibility.  For the purposes of this Agreement, the accessibility of 

online content and functionality will be measured according to the World Wide Web Consortium’s 

(W3C’s) Web Content Accessibility Guidelines (WCAG) 2.0 Level AA and the Web Accessibility 

Initiative Accessible Rich Internet Applications Suite (WAI-ARIA) 1.0 techniques for web content, 

which are incorporated by reference. 

 

Adherence to these accessible technology standards is one way to ensure compliance with the 

Recipient’s underlying legal obligations to ensure people with disabilities are able to acquire the same 

information, engage in the same interactions, and enjoy the same benefits and services within the same 

timeframe as their nondisabled peers, with substantially equivalent ease of use; that they are not 

excluded from participation in, denied the benefits of, or otherwise subjected to discrimination in any 

Recipient programs, services, and activities delivered online, as required by Section 504 and Title II 

and their implementing regulations; and that they receive effective communication of the Recipient’s 

programs, services, and activities delivered online. 

 

Remedies and Reporting  

 

1) Proposed Policies and Procedures Regarding New Online Content and Functionality.  Within 

90 days of the date of this Agreement the Recipient will submit to OCR for its review and 
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approval proposed policies and procedures (“the Plan for New Content”) to ensure that all new, 

newly-added, or modified online content and functionality will be accessible to people with 

disabilities as measured by conformance to the Benchmarks for Measuring Accessibility set 

forth above, except where doing so would impose a fundamental alteration or undue burden.   

 

a) When fundamental alteration or undue burden defenses apply, the Plan for New Content 

will require the Recipient to provide equally effective alternative access.  The Plan for 

New Content will require the Recipient, in providing equally effective alternate access, 

to take any actions that do not result in a fundamental alteration or undue financial and 

administrative burdens, but nevertheless ensure that, to the maximum extent possible, 

individuals with disabilities receive the same benefits or services as their nondisabled 

peers.  To provide equally effective alternate access, alternates are not required to 

produce the identical result or level of achievement for persons with and without 

disabilities, but must afford persons with disabilities equal opportunity to obtain the 

same result, to gain the same benefit, or to reach the same level of achievement, in the 

most integrated setting appropriate to the person’s needs.   

 

b) The Plan for New Content must include sufficient quality assurance procedures, backed 

by adequate personnel and financial resources, for full implementation.  This provision 

also applies to the Recipient’s online content and functionality developed by, 

maintained by, or offered through a third-party vendor or by using open sources.   

 

c) Within 30 calendar days of receiving OCR’s approval of the Plan for New Content, the 

Recipient will officially adopt, and fully implement the amended policies and 

procedures.   

 

d) Reporting:   Within 45 calendar days of receiving OCR’s approval, the Recipient will 

submit to OCR the approved policies and procedures, evidence of their adoption and 

distribution, and a description of how they are being implemented. 

 

2) Undue Burden and Fundamental Alteration.  For any technology-related requirement in this 

Agreement for which the Recipient asserts an undue burden or fundamental alteration defense, 

such assertion may only be made by the Superintendent or by an individual designated by the 

Superintendent and who has budgetary authority after considering all resources available for 

use in the funding and operation of the service, program, or activity, and must be accompanied 

by a written statement of the reasons for reaching that conclusion, including the cost of meeting 

the requirement and the available funding and other resources.  The written statement will be 

certified by the determining official.  If such a determination is made, the certifying official 

will describe in the written statement how it will provide equally effective alternate access, i.e., 

other action that would not result in such an alteration or such burdens but would nevertheless 

ensure that, to the maximum extent possible, individuals with disabilities receive the same 

benefits or services provided by the Recipient as their nondisabled peers.   

 

3) Audit of Existing Content and Functionality.  Within 90 days of the date of this Agreement, the 

Recipient will propose for OCR’s review and approval the identity and bona fides of an 

Auditor (corporation or individual) to audit all content and functionality on its website, 
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including, but not limited to, the home page, all subordinate pages, and intranet pages and sites, 

to identify any online content or functionality that is inaccessible to persons with disabilities, 

including online content and functionality developed by, maintained by, or offered through a 

third party vendor or an open source.  The Auditor will have sufficient knowledge and 

experience in website accessibility for people with disabilities to carry out all related tasks, 

including developing a Proposed Corrective Action Plan. The Audit will use the Benchmarks 

for Measuring Accessibility set out above, unless the Recipient receives prior permission from 

OCR to use a different standard as a benchmark.  During the Audit, the Recipient will also seek 

input from members of the public with disabilities, including parents, students, employees, and 

others associated with the Recipient, and other persons knowledgeable about website 

accessibility, regarding the accessibility of its online content and functionality. 

 

a) Reporting:  Within 90 days of the date of this Agreement, the Recipient will submit the 

bona fides of its proposed Auditor to OCR for review and approval.  OCR will evaluate 

whether the proposed Auditor has the requisite experience and knowledge to carry out 

an appropriate Audit and to develop a Proposed Corrective Action Plan.  Within 90 

calendar days of receiving OCR’s approval of the proposed Auditor, the Recipient will 

submit to OCR documentation of the steps taken by the Auditor during the Audit, a 

description of the outreach it undertook and the input it received, and a detailed 

accounting of the results of the Audit. 

 

4) Proposed Corrective Action Plan.  Simultaneously with the submission of the Audit, the 

Recipient will submit to OCR for its review and approval a proposed Corrective Action Plan to 

address all inaccessible content and functionality identified during the Recipient’s Audit.  The 

proposed Corrective Action Plan will set out a detailed schedule for: (1) addressing problems, 

taking into account identified priorities, with all corrective actions to be completed within 18 

months of the date OCR approved the Corrective Action Plan; (2) setting up systems of 

accountability and verifying claims of accessibility by vendors or open sources; and setting up 

a system of testing and accountability to maintain the accessibility of all online content and 

functionality on an ongoing basis.   

 

5) Within 30 calendar days of receiving OCR’s approval of the proposed Corrective Action Plan, 

the Recipient will officially adopt and implement the Corrective Action Plan.  

 

a) Reporting:  Within 45 calendar days of receiving OCR’s approval of the proposed 

Corrective Action Plan, the Recipient will submit to OCR the approved Corrective Action 

Plan, and documentation establishing that the approved Corrective Action Plan is being 

implemented according to the approved schedule.  Reports will be due every six months 

thereafter until the Corrective Action Plan has been completed.  

 

6) Notice.  Within 30 calendar days of the date of this Agreement, the Recipient will submit to 

OCR for review and approval a proposed Notice to persons with disabilities regarding how to 

request the webmaster or other appropriate person to provide access to (or notify the Recipient 

regarding) online information or functionality that is currently inaccessible.  The proposed 

notice will also include information or an accessible link to information instructing people how 

to file formal grievances under Section 504 and Title II.   Within 10 calendar days of receiving 
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OCR’s approval of the proposed Notice, the Recipient will officially adopt and prominently 

post the approved Notice on its home page and throughout its website (including all 

subordinate pages and intranet sites).  

 

a) Reporting.  Within 15 calendar days of receiving OCR’s approval of the Recipient’s 

proposed Notice, the Recipient will provide documentation to OCR regarding the 

locations and content of its published Notice. 

 

7) Training.  Starting no later than 30 calendar days from the date of this Agreement, and annually 

thereafter, until such time as OCR closes its monitoring of this Agreement, the Recipient will 

deliver website accessibility training to all appropriate personnel, including, but not limited to: 

content developers, webmasters, procurement officials, and all others responsible for 

developing, loading, maintaining, or auditing web content and functionality. 

 

a) Reporting:  For each training session required by this Agreement, until such time as 

OCR closes the monitoring of this Agreement, the Recipient will submit to OCR 

documentation that it has been delivered.  The documentation will include a list of 

invitees and attendees, including titles; a description of the delivered training content; 

and the presenter’s credentials for giving such training.  

 

The Recipient understands that OCR will not close the monitoring of this Agreement until OCR 

determines that the Recipient has fulfilled the terms of this Agreement and is in compliance with the 

regulations implementing Section 504, at 34 C.F.R. §§ 104.4 (a) and (b), 104.8, and 104.21, and Title 

II, at 28 C.F.R. §§ 35.130, 35.149, and 35.160, which were at issue in this case.   

 

The Recipient also understands that by signing this Agreement, it agrees to provide data and other 

information in a timely manner in accordance with the reporting requirements of this Agreement.  

Further, the Recipient understands that during the monitoring of this Agreement, if necessary, OCR 

may visit the Recipient, interview staff, and request such additional reports or data, including 

simulated website accounts and passwords, as are necessary for OCR to determine whether the 

Recipient has fulfilled the terms of this Agreement and is in compliance with the regulations 

implementing Section 504, at 34 C.F.R. §§ 104.4 (a) and (b), 104.8, and 104.21, and Title II, at 28 

C.F.R. §§ 35.130, 35.149, and 35.160, which were at issue in this case.  

 

The Recipient understands and acknowledges that OCR may initiate administrative enforcement or 

judicial proceedings to enforce the specific terms and obligations of this Agreement.  Before initiating 

administrative enforcement (34 C.F.R. §§ 100.9, 100.10), or judicial proceedings to enforce this 

Agreement, OCR shall give the Recipient written notice of the alleged breach and sixty (60) calendar 

days to cure the alleged breach. 

 

 

___________________________________  _________________________ 

Kelly Rodgers      Date 

Superintendent 

North Little Rock School District 
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