
Minutes of Regular Meeting of the El Dorado School Board 
July 11, 2005 

 
The directors of the board met on the above date at 7:00 p.m. in the Board Room, School 
Administration Building, 200 West Oak Street, with Will Vance presiding.  Other 
directors present were Joey Bauman, Vicky Dobson, Wayne Gibson, Larry Holder, 
Teresa Swint, and Susan Turbeville.  Also attending the board meeting was Supt. Bob 
Watson, Dr. James Fouse, Shirley Billingly, Don Thompson, and Lou Ann Voris. 
 
Mr. Vance called the meeting to order and asked if there were any corrections or 
additions to the minutes of the meeting held June 13.  On a motion by Wayne Gibson, 
seconded by Teresa Swint, and carried on a 7-0 vote, the minutes were approved. 
 
The board reviewed the monthly bills.  After some discussion and on a motion by Teresa 
Swint, seconded by Larry Holder, and carried on a 7-0 vote, the bills were approved for 
payment.  A list of bills paid and monthly financial statement are on file in the business 
office. 
 
Don Thompson covered the proposed two-year budget and millage with the board. In 
presenting the 2006-07 proposed budget, Thompson said $560,000 was added to the 
Teacher Salary Fund for a total of $14,564,644.  Proposed instructional expenses were 
listed at $6,112,588; maintenance and operational expenses were $2,980,269; pupil 
transportation expenses were $1,014,621 and other operating expenses were $2,464,691.  
He noted that at this time there are no plans to increase the 28.90 school millage rate – 
the lowest in the county and one of the lowest in the state.  Of the 28.90 mills, 26.90 is 
for maintenance and operations, 1.40 is dedicated maintenance and operations and .60 
mills is for debt service.  When the Union School District was consolidated with El 
Dorado last school year, the El Dorado District assumed Union’s debt.  El Dorado has not 
had a millage increase in numerous years and has not had any debt for at least 25 years, 
Mr. Thompson said. After a time of discussion and on a motion by Larry Holder, 
seconded by Vicky Dobson, and carried on a 7-0 vote, it was 
 

RESOLVED, That the board hereby approves the two year budget and millage for 
the El Dorado School District. 

 
Mr. Thompson discussed with the board the year-end transfer of funds.  On a motion by 
Teresa Swint, seconded by Wayne Gibson, and carried on a 7-0 vote, it was 
 
 RESOLVED, That the board hereby approves the year-end transfer of funds. 
 
Mr. Vance stated the district’s membership to the Arkansas School Boards Association is 
due.  Mr. Watson explained the services provided by the A.S.B.A.  On a motion by Susan 
Turbeville, seconded by Joey Bauman, and carried on a 7-0 vote, it was 
 

RESOLVED, That the board hereby approves membership renewal to the 
Arkansas School Boards Association for 2005-06. 
 

Mr. Watson presented bids on a fourteen passenger, Type A bus. 
 
 Company          Amount
Merl’s Bus Sales, Ft. Smith, AR     $44,294.00 
Wards Transportation Service, Conway, AR      44,811.00 
Central States Bus Sales, North Little Rock, AR     45,897.00 
 
On a motion by Teresa Swint, seconded by Vicky Dobson, and carried on a 7-0 vote, it 
was 
 

RESOLVED, That the board hereby approves the low bid from Merl’s Bus Sales 
for $44,294.00 for a fourteen passenger, Type A bus. 

 
Mr. Watson presented the bids received on the gasoline and diesel for the 2005-06 school 
term. 



 
      89 Octane            Low Sulphur

Company      Gasoline            Dyed Diesel
Central Oil & Supply, Monroe, LA   No Bid   
James P. Hill Oil Co., El Dorado   No Bid 
South Arkansas Oil Co., El Dorado   No Bid 
Sewell Oil Company, El Dorado  $.0190      $.0190 
Felton Oil Company, El Dorado    .0185        .0195 
Petroleum Traders, Ft. Wayne, IN    .0195        .0207 
 
He noted that the figure represents the amount above rack price, not the actual price per 
gallon.  The amount above rack price will remain the same all year.  On a motion by Joey 
Bauman, seconded by Larry Holder, and carried on a 7-0 vote, it was 
 

RESOLVED, That the board hereby approves the bid from Sewell Oil Company 
for the gasoline and diesel for the 2005-06 school term. 

 
Mr. Watson said that bid requests were sent to the following companies for security 
cameras at Northwest Elementary School. 
 
 Company         Amount
Custom Wiring, Sherwood, AR     $30,000.00 
Arkansas State Security, Inc., Mabelvale, AR     29,870.00 
Johnson Controls, Little Rock, AR       58,970.00 
Southgate Alarms, Pocahontas, AR       19,950.00 
 
Mr. Watson stated a law has been passed that school districts cannot request a business 
provide a particular good or service, write specifications for bids, and the district cannot 
specify a brand name of a product that they would prefer.  He noted the difficulty this 
presents in bidding a job.  He explained that the low bid on the security cameras did not 
meet specifications.  Mr. Watson recommended the low bid from Arkansas State 
Security.  After a time of discussion and on a motion by Teresa Swint, seconded by Larry 
Holder, and carried on a 7-0 vote, it was 
 

RESOLVED, That the board hereby approves the bid $29,870.00 from Arkansas 
State Security for security cameras at Northwest Elementary School. 

 
Dr. Fouse presented bids for 26 computers for Union’s computer lab.  He noted that these 
will be purchased with Carl Perkins funding. 
 
 Company    Unit Price     Amount
Gov Connections, Fairfield, CT          no bid  
Global Computers, Fletcher, OH   $505.00  $13,130.00 
CDW-G, Vernon Hills, IL      666.00    17,316.00 
 
On a motion by Susan Turbeville, seconded by Wayne Gibson, and carried on a 7-0 vote, 
it was 
 

RESOLVED, That the board hereby approves the bid from Global Computers for 
$13,130.00 for 26 computers for the computer lab at Union School. 

 
Dr. Fouse presented bids for 25 computers for the multi-media lab at El Dorado High 
School.   
 
 Company    Unit Price     Amount
Gov Connections, Fairfield, CT          no bid 
Global Computers, Fletcher, OH   $710.00  $17,750.00 
CDW-G, Vernon Hills, IL                 829.00    20,725.00   
 
On a motion by Susan Turbeville, seconded by Joey Bauman, and carried on a 7-0 vote, it 
was 
 



RESOLVED, That the board hereby approves the purchase of 25 computers from 
Global Computers for $17,750.00 for the multi-media lab at El Dorado High 
School. 

 
Dr. Fouse stated that he brought before the board in the June board meeting the policy on 
the habitually disruptive student for use when the district has run out of options.  He said 
the district only has a handful of students who are habitually disruptive.  He noted that he 
sent the policy to the Arkansas School Boards Association’s attorney and also to their 
policy service department for review.  They reviewed his request and offered changes and 
suggestions on having one portion as administrative procedure and the other as board 
policy.  He reminded the board that they would only be voting on the policy.  He said if 
the board adopts the policy that they will be a landmark case for the rest of the state. The 
administrative procedure will be attached to the board minutes. The board policy is as 
follows: 
 

Habitually Disruptive Student Policy 
 

If a student is determined to be “habitually disruptive” he/she will be referred to the 
School Board for removal from regular classes and placed in the Virtual School 
program. 
 
“Habitually Disruptive Student” means a student who has been suspended or assigned to 
Alternative Learning Environment three times during the school year or calendar year 
for conduct that caused a material and substantial disruption while at school or on 
school grounds, at a district-sanctioned activity or event, or while being transported in a 
district approved vehicle because of behavior that was initiated, willful, and overt on the 
part of the student. 
 
After some discussion and on a motion by Joey Bauman, seconded by Vicky Dobson, and 
carried on a 7-0 vote, it was 
 

RESOLVED, That the board hereby approves the Habitually Disruptive Student 
Policy. 

 
The board heard a committee report and recommendation from Larry Holder. He stated 
that the Committee to Review the Discipline Handbook and Policies had met over the 
past three months and were recommending handbook changes sent to the board members 
for their review.  He noted that the committee had spent considerable time working in the 
areas of student bullying, repeat offenders, habitually disruptive students, and student 
conflict.  He felt the committee had been diligent in bringing to the board 
recommendations for corrections, changes, and additions to the handbook.  Teresa Swint 
brought before the board concerns that she noticed in several areas of the handbook.  Mr. 
Watson and Mr. Holder addressed those concerns.  Mr. Holder stated the committee 
consisted of patrons, parents, students, teachers, administrators, a guidance counselor and 
the attendance officer.  He stated that Kelly Walters chaired the committee of the 
following members:  Carol Felton, Willie McGhee, Kelsie Holmes, Vince Dawson, 
Bobbie Shepherd, Sharon Patterson, Nelson Post, Joe Berry and Larry Holder.   Dr. 
Fouse and Mr. Watson attended all meetings.  After a time of discussion and on a motion 
by Teresa Swint, seconded by Wayne Gibson, and carried on a 7-0 vote, it was 
 

RESOLVED, That the board hereby approves El Dorado Public Schools Policies 
for Discipline, Safety, Homework, and Extra-Curricular Activities Handbook with 
the committee’s recommendations. 

 
Dr. Fouse asked the board for their consideration of the following members of the 
Citizens Textbook Committee:  Kristie Dixon, Mary Clark, Walter Compton, Jean Nixon, 
and David Ross.  On a motion by Larry Holder, seconded by Wayne Gibson, and carried 
on a 7-0 vote, it was 
 

RESOLVED, That the board hereby approves the Citizens Textbook Committee 
as presented. 

 



Mr. Vance reminded board members of the New Teacher Breakfast that will be held on 
Wednesday, August 10 at 7:30 a.m.  He also noted that the Opening Session for Certified 
Staff will be held Thursday, August 18 at 8:00 a.m. in the E.H.S. Gym.  
 
The meeting adjourned to an executive session to discuss personnel matters, then 
reconvened to an open meeting.  On a motion by Teresa Swint, seconded by Vicky 
Dobson, and carried on a 6-0 vote, it was 
 

RESOLVED, That the board hereby approves the superintendent’s 
recommendations concerning the acceptance of resignations and the employment 
of new personnel. 

 
There being no further business the meeting was adjourned. 
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