
Minutes of Regular Meeting of the El Dorado School Board 
June 14, 2010 

 
The directors of the board met on the above date at 6:00 p.m. in the Board Room, School 
Administration Building, 200 West Oak Street, with Susan Turbeville presiding.  Other 
directors present were Joey Bauman, Vicky Dobson, Wayne Gibson, Larry Holder, 
Renee Skinner, and Will Vance. Also attending was Supt. Bob Watson, Rhonda 
Simmons, Bonnie Haynie, Angie Drummond, and Lou Ann Voris. 
 
Mrs. Turbeville stated the board needed to approve and vote on treasurer for the school 
board.  On a motion by Wayne Gibson, seconded by Joey Bauman, and carried on a 7-0 
vote, it was 
 

RESOLVED, That the board hereby approves Angie Drummond as the treasurer 
to the El Dorado School Board. 
 

Mrs. Turbeville asked if there were any corrections or additions to the minutes of the 
meetings held May 10, 13, and June 2.  On a motion by Joey Bauman, seconded by 
Vicky Dobson, and carried on a 7-0 vote, the minutes were approved. 
 
The board reviewed the monthly bills.  After some discussion and on a motion by Joey 
Bauman, seconded by Larry Holder, and carried on a 7-0 vote, the bills were approved 
for payment.  A list of bills paid and monthly financial statement are on file in the 
business office. 
 
Mrs. Turbeville recognized Daniel Clayton, Student of the Month for May.  She said that 
Daniel is the son of Cathy and Donnie Clayton and is a senior at El Dorado High School.  
His physics teacher, Mrs. Forbess has taught Daniel the past two years and said it has 
been a pleasure!  As a student he is diligent, involved, and inspirational.  She said the 
reason Daniel deserves Student of the Month goes beyond his being an exceptional 
student.  It is because of how he treats other students; he is always kind and friendly no 
matter whom he is with.  She states that he treats every student, whatever their social 
standing with the same unfailing courtesy and respect.  He honors the opinions of others 
whether he agrees with them or not and he is always cooperative – this showing great 
maturity for a high school student! 
 
Daniel’s principal, Mr. Walters stated that he is a young man with his priorities in order.  
He has fantastic grades and great attendance.  Daniel plans to attend the University of 
Arkansas at Fayetteville and major in engineering.  Mr. Walters said with a 4.1 grade 
point average and a 30 on his ACT, along with his positive attitude – Daniel will be very 
successful.  Mr. Walters is proud that Daniel’s goal is to have his academic priorities in 
order but notes that running a tight second is his love of hunting and sports!  El Dorado 
High School staff and students are proud that Daniel was chosen Student of the Month.  
Mrs. Turbeville presented Daniel with a certificate from the board. 
 
Classified Employee of the Month from the Maintenance Department is Foster 
Poindexter.  Mrs. Turbeville said that Mr. Poindexter came to work for the district in 
November 2000 and is described by Rick Arnold as hard working, dependable, and great 
to work with.  He enjoys athletics and it shows in his work ethics.  He is a meticulous 
caretaker of the Memorial stadium field, soccer fields, baseball and softball fields, and 
practice fields on various campuses.  Fellow co-workers stated you can tell Foster enjoys 
his job because it shows in his work.  He is also a loyal Wildcat fan and goes to in and 
out of town games.  Mr. Arnold added that it is evident that Mr. Poindexter works hard to 
keep the facilities in great working condition; just look at them – they look great!  Mrs. 
Turbeville presented him with a certificate from the board. 
 
Angie Drummond brought before the board the Proposed Budget of Expenditures for 
2011 – 2012.  She stated the proposed annual budget of approximately thirty-five million 
dollars for the next two year represents about a two percent growth each year in 
expenditures.  After a time of discussion and on a motion by Larry Holder, seconded by 
Vicky Dobson, and carried on a 7-0 vote. 
 



RESOLVED, That the board hereby approves the Proposed Budget of 
Expenditures for 2011 – 2012. 
 

Mrs. Drummond also presented the insurance bids received for building, contents, and 
fleet coverage for the district.  She noted the coverage is effective July 1, 2010 through 
June 30, 2011. 
 
Building and contents coverage:                 Amount 
Hoffman Henry Insurance         $113,445.00 
United Insurance Agency         66,745.00 
Arkansas School Boards Association        87,114.00 
Associates Insurance Services          No bid                
 
On a motion by Will Vance, seconded by Larry Holder, and carried on a 7-0 vote, it was 
 

RESOLVED, That the board hereby approves the low bid of $66,745.00 from 
United Insurance Company for building and contents insurance.   
    

Mrs. Drummond said that Arkansas School Boards Association was the bidder for the 
fleet coverage. 
 
Fleet:           Amount 
Hoffman Henry Insurance          No bid 
United Insurance Company          No bid 
Arkansas School Boards Association    $ 33,559.00 
Associates Insurance Services         No bid 
 
On a motion by Wayne Gibson, seconded by Vicky Dobson, and carried on a 7-0 vote, it 
was 
 

RESOLVED, That the board hereby approves the insurance bids for fleet 
coverage for $33,559.00 from the Arkansas School Boards Association. 

 
Athletic director Phillip Lansdell presented to the board the 2010-2011 athletic budget of 
$137,249.00.  Mr. Lansdell stated the budget for next school term reflects an increase of 
$2,200 over last year’s budget.  He noted the increase is to pay for game officials who are 
requesting more money to officiate at sporting events.  The gate receipts at games last 
school year were down by about $3,000 because teams were just not traveling due to the 
economy.  On a motion by Will Vance, seconded by Joey Bauman, and carried on a 7-0 
vote, it was 
 

RESOLVED, That the board hereby approves the 2010 – 2011 athletic budget of 
$137,249.00. 

 
Mr. Lansdell also presented the insurance bids for athletic/activities and voluntary student 
coverage.  
 
Benchmark Insurance of Arkansas, Arkadelphia 

 Athletic: $13,000.00 
 Student: School time   $15.00   24 hour coverage $  73.00 

 
United Health Care Student Resources, Hot Springs 

 Athletic: $13,700.00 
 Student: School time   $25.00 24 hour coverage $  94.00 

 
Mr. Lansdell said the recommendation is for athletic and activities coverage from United 
Health Care and for United Health Care for voluntary student coverage.  On a motion by 
Joey Bauman, seconded by Vicky Dobson, and carried on a 7-0 vote, it was 
 

RESOLVED, That the board hereby approves the bid of $13,700 from United 
Health Care Student Resources for athletic and activities insurance coverage and 



for the bid of $25 and twenty-four hour coverage of $94 for voluntary student 
coverage the bid from United Health Care Student Resources. 

 
Mr. Watson presented to the board the bids for milk, bread, and groceries for the 2010-
2011 school year.  He explained on the milk bid that invitations were sent out but Borden 
and Foremost returned official letters stating they did not wish to bid due to no delivery 
service in the area.  This left the only the bid from Coleman.  Mr. Watson showed board 
members bid amounts received for bread products came from Flowers, IBC, and Sara 
Lee.  He stated that IBC had the lowest bids in each category of loaf bread, hot dog and 
hamburger buns.  Mr. Watson then went over the grocery bids received stating the 
recommendation is to accept low bid from six bidders for the other various grocery items.  
On a motion by Will Vance, seconded by Renee Skinner, and carried on a 7-0 vote, it was 
  

RESOLVED, That the board hereby approves the bid from Coleman Dairy for 
milk and milk products, the low bid from IBC for bread, and the low bids 
received for other grocery items for the 2010-2011 school year. 

 
Mr. Watson presented bids received for asbestos abatement at Washington Middle 
School. He noted that it is required the district have a project manager for the abatement.  
Occupational and Environmental Hazard Control, Inc. from Barling, Arkansas will over-
see the project and do air monitoring and sample analysis.  The estimated coat for this 
portion of the project will be $4,215.00.  He reminded board members this expense is in 
addition to the expense of the abatement firm.    
 
  Company         Amount 
Snyder Environmental & Construction, Inc., Little Rock  $7,860.00 
Environmental Protection Associates, Little Rock     9,137.00 
Gerken Environmental Enterprises, Inc., Springfield     9,918.00 
Pollution Management, Inc., Little Rock     15,421.00 
 
On a motion by Vicky Dobson, seconded by Wayne Gibson, and carried on a 7-0 vote, it 
was 
  

RESOLVED, That the board hereby approves the low bid of $7,860.00 from 
Snyder Environmental & Construction, Inc. for asbestos abatement at Washington 
Middle School.  Also the board approved is the additional cost of $4,215.00 for a 
project manager to oversee the project and do air monitoring and sample analysis. 

 
Mr. Watson talked with the board about bids received for masonry work to be done at 
Washington Middle School.   
 
  Company          Amount  
Wood’s Brick & Masonry, Junction City    $15,222.00 
Herring Masonry, LLC, Strong       19,910.00 
 
On a motion by Joey Bauman, seconded by Will Vance, and carried on a 7-0 vote, it was 
 

RESOLVED, That the board hereby approves the low bid of $15,222.00 from 
Wood’s Brick & Masonry for masonry work at Washington Middle School. 

 
Geni Smith, chair of the Personnel Policies Committee visited with the board about 
amending the current dress policy for employees.  She noted that last year at this time the 
PPC brought before them the proposed changes that were approved.  The current policy 
will be stated and the additions or changes are underlined:  
 

Employees shall ensure that their dress and appearance are professional and 
appropriate to their positions.  The standards for dress are as follows: 

 
1. All garments shall be no shorter than slightly above the knee and of  

appropriate tightness.  No leggings are to be worn unless the top worn with 
the leggings meets dress guidelines for length. 

 



2. Ears are the only exposed areas of the body on which pierced jewelry may be 
      worn.  
 
3. No low cut tops or those revealing cleavage, underwear, or the midsection 
      may be worn. 
 
4. Sweatpants are not appropriate in the classroom. 

 
5. Jeans are allowed, but they should be free of holes, frayed ends, stains, etc. 

 
6. T-shirts are to be worn only on school spirit days as designated by the 

principal. 
 

7. Appropriate shoes are expected of all staff. Sandals may be worn, but flip-
flops are not allowed.  If water would ruin the shoe, it is a sandal.  If a shoe 
gets wet and it’s still ok, it’s a flip-flop. 

 
8. Anything deemed inappropriate will be addressed on an individual basis. 

 
After a time of discussion and on a motion by Joey Bauman, seconded by Larry Holder, 
and carried on a 7-0 vote, it was 
 

RESOLVED, That the board hereby approves the additions and changes to the 
district dress policy as presented. 
 

Mrs. Smith talked with the board about adding Edline for grades five through eight at 
Washington Middle School and Barton Jr. High School.  She reminded the board that the 
program helps schools improve their performance by posting student grades online for 
parents and students to view to increase parental involvement and support teachers.  It 
was implemented at El Dorado High School last year and the teachers think the program 
has been great and it is a win-win situation for students and parents.    
 
Parents are given activation codes to look up grades for their children only with parent 
and students having different codes, Mrs. Smith said.  Mr. Vance asked if teachers could 
post the grades online in a more timely fashion and Mrs. Smith said teacher will post 
scores for the previous week by Tuesday.  She said the program is helpful to teachers but 
is primarily for parents.  It has a tight security and said that parents can only see their 
child’s scores.  There are other sites available for use by parents in the district who do not 
have a computer at home and hard copies of Edline postings are available at the 
counselor’s office at the high school.   
 
She explained the proposed changes to wording of the policy are underlined:   
 
Parents or guardians shall be kept informed concerning the progress of their student.  
Parent-teacher conferences are encouraged and may be requested by parents, guardians, 
or teachers.  If the progress of a student is unsatisfactory in a subject, the teacher shall 
attempt to schedule a parent-teacher conference.  In the conference, the teacher shall 
explain the reasons for difficulties and shall develop, cooperatively with the parents, a 
plan for remediation which may enhance the probability of the student succeeding. 
 
The elementary  schools shall send progress reports during the fifth week of each grading 
period and issue grades for each nine-week grading period to keep parents/guardians 
informed of their student’s progress.  
 
Grades 5-12 shall use Edline, and online method of communication, and issue grades for 
each nine-week grading period to keep parents/guardians informed of their progress.  
Grades from the previous week will be posted by teachers to Edline by the following 
Tuesday, with the exception of long-term projects, CHUNK test, and other tests which 
require additional grading time. 
 
After some discussion and on a motion by Will Vance, seconded by Wayne Gibson, and 
carried on a 7-0 vote, it was 



RESOLVED, That the board hereby approves the addition of Edline for grades 
five through eight at Washington Middle School and Barton Jr. High School and 
the changes to the policy wording as presented. 
 

Rhonda Simmons brought before the board the addition of new wording to the 
Acceptable Use – Internet Safety and Internet Filtering Policy.  Mrs. Simmons explained 
that the district has internet filters in place and wording in the district’s policy had to be 
amended to adhere to the Children’s Internet Protection Act.  She said the district’s 
internet filters look for everything out of the ordinary and flags appear whenever 
something is questionable and the filters identify the exact computer, if there is a doubt.   
Also, a copy of the Internet Safety Policy is given to each parent/guardian as a student 
goes through registration and orientation each year.  She noted the proposal presented 
with additions for the board’s consideration is quite lengthy but, as in the past, the 
parent/guardian and student will sign that they have read and agree to the conditions and 
privileges and understand that violation of these can result in the denial of internet 
privileges.  On a motion by Larry Holder, seconded by Vicky Dobson, and carried on a 7-
0 vote, it was 
 

RESOLVED, That the board approves the Acceptable Use – Internet Safety and 
Internet Filtering Policy as presented.  A copy of the policy will be attached to the 
minutes.  

 
Bonnie Haynie presented the 2010 – 2011 Professional Development Plan for the board’s 
consideration. She explained that teachers are required to have sixty hours of professional 
development from June 1 to May 31 and this year, the district will focus on 
comprehensive literacy and mathematical proficiency through the use of Best Practices 
and student-centered technology integration; closing the achievement gap through 
authentic student engagement and focused questioning techniques and parental 
involvement to promote student-centered instruction.  Mrs. Haynie said the district is 
required to update their professional development plan each year and there are three 
guiding questions that form the foundation of all professional development – What are all 
students expected to know and be able to do?  What must teachers know and do in order 
toe ensure student success?  Where must staff development focus to meet both goals? 
 
Mrs. Haynie said this year, two new areas of required professional development are 
automated external defibrillator and cardiopulmonary resuscitation.  Other professional 
development activities focus on K-12 content, instructional strategies, assessment, 
advocacy/leadership, systematic change process, standards, frameworks and curriculum 
alignment and other areas.  All approved professional development shall be based on 
improving student academic achievement on state assessments and academic 
performance.  Mr. Watson asked the board to consider the items presented for a vote in 
the July board meeting. 
 
Mrs. Haynie informed the board that El Dorado High School has been selected by the 
state for a Scholastic Audit which will be January 9 – 14, 2011.  She noted the school is 
required to pay for the audit and will cost the high school from $24,000 to $27,000 – 
which will come out of N.S.L.A. dollars.  Mr. Watson added that up until this year, the 
state paid for the audits.  The scholastic audit process began in 1998 in Kentucky and 
Arkansas included the process in 2006.  
 
Mrs. Haynie said that most schools in the county were identified for scholastic audits.  
Arkansas public schools that are identified as being in school improvement three or more 
years and have an achievement gap and/or with multiple sub-populations – 50 schools in 
the state – were selected for audits for 2010-2011.  A scholastic audit is a comprehensive 
review of the learning environment, organizational efficiency and academic performance 
of schools and districts, Mrs. Haynie said.   She explained the high school will learn what 
they are doing really well – this will be a good thing – a road map to continue closing the 
achievement gap and improving student test scores and parental involvement.   
 
A team of eight to twelve school practitioners, who have been trained in the scholastic 
audit process, will spend four to five days inquiring about nine standards which have a 
total of eighty-eight indicators.  They will inspect curriculum; classroom 



evaluation/assessment; instruction; school culture; student, family and community 
support; professional growth, development and evaluation; leadership; organizational 
structure and resources and comprehensive and effective planning. 
 
The meeting adjourned to an executive session to discuss personnel matters, then 
reconvened to an open meeting.  On a motion by Wayne Gibson, seconded by Vicky 
Dobson, and carried on a 7-0 vote, it was 
 

RESOLVED, That the board hereby approves the superintendent’s 
recommendations concerning the acceptance of resignations and the employment 
of new personnel.  

 
There being no further business the meeting was adjourned. 
 
 
       
       
 


