BLACKSTONE-MILLVILLE REGIONAL DISTRICT SCHOOL COMMITTEE

Frederick W. Hartnett Middle School
Thursday, June 23, 2016
7:00 PM

Included in this transmission is the following:

I. Opening of Meeting
a. Call to Order
b. Pledge of Allegiance
c. Introduction of Members

Il. Public Forum
lll. Recognition of Retirees

IV. Consent Agenda A
a. Warrants
b. Minutes of Meeting
a. June 14, 2016

V. School Committee
a. Discussion of Regional Agreement
b. Superintendents Evaluation

VI. Report of the Superintendent
a. Jill Tosti - Boys and Girls Lacrosse Co-Op
b. Vote to approve 2016-2017 Transportation Contract
c. Vote to approve 2016-2017 Rubbish Contract

Vil. Report of the Assistant Superintendent

VIll. Public Forum

m
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IX. School Committee Forum

Mrs. Erin P. Vinacco, Chair

Mrs. Wendy L. Greenstein, Vice Chair
Ms. Tara Larkin, District Secretary
Mrs. Jane Reggio, District Treasurer
Mr. William F. Chaplin, Jr., Member
Mr. Steven J. Tringali, Member

Ms. Jo-Anne Watson, Member

Ms. Georgette A. Jarret, Member
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X. Upcoming Meetings
a. July 11, 2016 — Public Meeting

Xl. Executive Session

Xil. Adjournment
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BLACKSTONE-MILLVILLE
REGIONAL SCHOOL DISTRICT
ALLEN W. HIMMELBERGER
SUPERINTENDENT OF SCHOOLS

MEMO
TO: Blackstone-Millville Regional School Committee
RE: School Committee, Consent Agenda A

DATE: June 23, 2016
Recommended Consent Agenda A — ltems

1. Warrants

a. Payroll

i. Move to approve payroll voucher numbers: and as submitted by the
Superintendent of Schools

b. Payables

i. Move to approve the payable voucher numbers: General , and
Cafeteria as submitted by the Superintendent of Schools

2. Minutes

i. Move to approve the school committee minutes of

1. June 14, 2016



6/15/2016 Blackstone Millville Regional School District Mail - Fwd: Boys & Girls Lacrosse Co-Op
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MRSD.NET Brigitie Walsh <

o
e

Fwd: Boys & Girls Lacrosse Co-Op

| message

Allen Himmelberger <ahimmelberger@bmrsd.net> Fri, Jun 10, 2016 at 7:38 AM
To: Brigitte Walsh <bwalsh@bmrsd.net>
Cc: Jill Tosti <jtosti@bmrsd.net>

Hi,

We will include this on the 6/23 agenda and Jill T will be there to explain.

Thanks,

——n Forwarded message ———-—-

From: Jill Tosti < >

Date: Thu, Jun 9, 2016 at 2:56 PM

Subject: Boys & Girls Lacrosse Co-Op
To: Allen Himmelberger < >

Hi Mr. ,Himmelberger

| have been doing some work on getting a co-op with Hopedale for boys and girls lacrosse for next spring, and |
just got an email from the Hopedale AD saying she is going to apply for the co-op with us for next spring.

| know this would need to be put in front of the school committee so | didn't know when the next meeting will be
so | could present this.

Thanks

hitps:/mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=28&ik=635aa25f9al&view=pt&g=ahimmelberger %40bmrsd.net&gs=true&search=query&th=1553a1af4676d226&sim|=1553a... 1A



Motions for BMRSD Transportation 2016-2017

Motion:
That any and all bids received for the Request for Bids, Transportation of Pupils,
Specifications dated March 16, 2016 be rejected in their entirety as not being in the
public interest.

Motion:
That the fifth Option Year under the current contract with Tellstone & Son, Inc. be
awarded at the following rates contained in their bid and subsequent contract:

Elementary Routes: § 195.00 per Day
Secondary Routes: $ 192.00 per Day
Other Secondary Routes: $ 239.00 per Day

Based upon our review of the routes and schedules provided, it appears that for 2016-17 the
District would require the following number of routes:

Elementary Routes: 13 routes (12 for the 3 elementary schools plus 1 for the multi
address students) @ $195.00 per Route per Day (180 days) = $ 456,300

Secondary Routes: 11 routes (based on actual ridership, as opposed to scheduled
ridership) @ $ 192.00 per Route per Day (180 days) = $ 380,160

Secondary Routes: 3 Routes @ $ 239.00 per Route per Day (180 days) =$ 129,060

Estimated Total Cost (2016-17): $ 965,520

**Bid Cost:
975,240+$27,000($150*180 for daycare shuttle) =$1,002,240

*Current Cost (4/5 option year with 13 elementary routes and 16 secondary routes):
$1,034,640+26,640($148*180 for daycare shuttle) =$1,061,280



OPTION:
The Blackstone

BLACKSTONE-MILLVILLE REGIONAL SCHOOL DISTRICT

INVITATION TO BID - BUS TRANSPORTATION

BID FORM B

-Millville Regional School District invites prospective contractors to bid

on providing bus services for the period August 2012 to June 2015. Bids are to be based
upon routes provided with bid documents for the period August 2012 to June 2015,

COMPANY NAME:

| REGULAR DAY TRANSPORTATION

Tellstone & Son,

Inc.

A. Elementary

Route # Per Day Bid Annual (180 Days) Two Year Total
M-1 - $195, $35,100, $70,200.
M-2 $195. $35.100. $70,200.
M-3 No Bid
m-4 $195.00 $35,100. $70,200.
M-5 $195, $35.100. $70.200.
M-6 No Bid
=1 $195, $35,100. $70.200.
B-2 No Bid

B-3 $195._ $35.100. E90..500:.
B-4 $195. $35.100. $70,200.
B-5 $195. $35.100. $70,200.
B-6 $195. $35.100. $70.200.
-7 $195. $35,100. $70,200.
B-8 No Bid

e $195, $35,100. $70,200.
Sl $195. $35.100. $70,200.
B-11 $195. $35.100. $70,200.
B-12 No Bid

B-13 No Bid

GRAND TOTAL $2.535 $456.300. $912.600.




BLACKSTONE-MILLVILLE REGIONAL SCHOOL DISTRICT

INVITATION TO BID

Bus Transportation

BID FORM B
B. Secondary
Route # Per Day Bid Annual (180 Days) Two Year Total

1 $192. ' $34.560. $69.120.
& $239. $43.020. $86,040.
3 $192, $34.560. $69,120.
= $192. $34.560, $69,120.
5 $192. $34,560. $69,120.
6 $192, $34.560. $69,120.
7 $192. $34,560. $69.120.
8 $239. $43.020. $86.040.
9 $192, $34.560. $69.120.
10 $192. $34,560. $69,120.
11 $192. $34.560. $69.120.
12y $192. $34.560. $69.120.
1B -2 $192. $34.560. $69,120.
14 y_3 $239. $43,020 $86,040.
15 w4 $192. $34,560. $69,120.
16 u_s $192, $34,560. $69,120.

17 M-6 No BRid _
GRAND TOTAL $3213. $578,340. $1,156,680
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XX Item S. Correction to Form H (Page 22)

Delete any sections that do not apply. Change Form H to

FORM H

BID COST SUBMITTAL —DETAIL

Two-Tier System Year 1 (FY17) Year 2 (FY18) Year 3 (FY19)

Price for full size
bus (77 pass),
four trips per 387 397 407
day, two 3 2 .
morning & two
afternoon

Yearly cost
(daily rate x 14
buses for
secondary run x
180 days) $_975,240 $ 1,000,440 $_1,025,640
{daily rate x 12
buses for
elementary run x
180 days)

Field Trips / Mileage Waiting Time Minimum per trip
Charters /
Athletics

S 4.00 _ /mile | § 75 Jhour | § 300 ftrip

NOTE: The awarding authority reserves the right to contract with other vendors for any trip
that the successful bidder is unable to support or when it is deemed in the best interest of the
district (i.e.: need for coach services, distance, overnight trips, etc.)

Item 6. Correction to Bus Route Page 1-12

Change Bus Route page 1-12 (JFK/AFM Elementary route) to Millville Elementary
route as follows.



Delete any sections that do not apply. Change Form H to

FORM H

 BIDCOST SUBMITTAL=DETAIL

Two-Tler System

- Year 4 (FY20)

. Year 5 (Fy21) '

Price for full size
bus {77 pass),
four trips per
day, twe
morning & two
gfternoon

{s 417

$ 437

Yearly cost
{daily rate x 12
buses for
secondary run X
180 days)

{daily rate x 12

buses for e e

elementary run x
180 days}

€ 1,050,840

€ 1,101,240

Field Trips /
Charters /
Athletics

Mileage

Waiting Time

Minimum pér irip

$ 4.25 /mile

S 80 fhour

325 ferip

NCTE: The awarding authority reserves the right to contract with other vendors for any trip
that the successful bidder is unable to support or when i is deemed in the best interest of the
district {i.e.: need for coach services, distance, overnight trips, ett.)




FORM |

bt e

BID COST SUMMARY -THREE YEARS

Total Bid Cost for providing pupil transportation services to the Blackstone-Millville Regional
School District Schools {Items 1 only- “Bid Cost Submittal — Detail”).

2016 - 2017

2017 - 2018

2018 -2019
**TOTAL 3-YR COST
Optional Extension
2019 -2020

2020-2021

April 4, 2016

Date

ANNUAL COST - ALL SERVICES

$ 975,240

$.1,000, 440

$.1,025,640

$.3,001,320

$ 1,050,840

$ 1,101,240

Tellstone & Son, Inc.

Company name

2

Authorized Representative- Signature

Neil S. Tellstone Vice President

Print Name- Title

** NOTE: Total cost (over three (3) years) along with all other pertinent criteria contained in these

specifications will be utilized to determine the lowest qualified bidder as prescribed by Chapter 30b of

the Massachusetts General Laws (MGL).

Transportation Bids FY17-FY19
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BLACKSTONE-MILLVILLE
REGIONAL SCHOOL DISTRICT

MEMO
TO: Blackstone-Millville Regional School Committee
RE: Rubbish Collection Contract

DATE: June 23, 2016

The District sent invitations for quotes for the collection of rubbish from the schools for
the 2016-2017 school year. The District is recommending Republic Services at a rate of
$13,860.00 with a summer pickup rate of $45.00 per container.

Recommendation:

Accept the quote from Republic Services of Fall River, MA for rubbish collection

Motion:

Move to accept the quote from Republic Services of Fall River, MA for rubbish collection
services for the 2016-2017 school year



