
Building Item Brand Model Quantity Unit Price Alternate Item Unit Price Alternate Item Unit Price Alternate Item Unit Price Alternate Item Unit Price Alternate Item Unit Price Alternate Item
Hayward 1/2 cello outfit Eastman VC100 1 $817.83 $860.00 $866.00 NO BID
Hayward 1/2 cello outfit Eastman VC100 1 $817.83 $860.00 $866.00 NO BID
Eugene Field 1/2 cello outfit Eastman VC100 1 $817.83 $860.00 $866.00 NO BID
Eugene Field 1/2 cello outfit Eastman VC100 1 $817.83 $860.00 $866.00 NO BID
JAE 1/2 cello outfit Eastman VC100 1 $817.83 $860.00 $866.00 NO BID

Cleveland 1/2 cello outfit Eastman VC90 1 $666.06 $701.00

$707.00 Eastman VC95 
(recommended 
replacement for 
VC90) NO BID

LBA 1/2 Cello Outfit Eastman VC100 1 $817.83 $860.00 $866.00 NO BID
Pettigrew 1/2 Cello Outfit Eastman VC100 1 $817.83 $860.00 $866.00 NO BID
Anne Sullivan 1/2 violin outfit Eastman VL100 1 $315.15 $332.00 $344.00 NO BID
Discovery 1/2 violin outfit Eastman VL100 1 $315.15 $332.00 $344.00 NO BID
Discovery 1/2 Violin Outfit Eastman VL100 1 $315.15 $332.00 $344.00 NO BID
Discovery 1/2 Violin Outfit Eastman VL100 1 $315.15 $332.00 $344.00 NO BID
Garfield 1/2 violin outfit Eastman VL100 1 $315.15 $332.00 $344.00 NO BID
Garfield 1/2 violin outfit Eastman VL100 1 $315.15 $332.00 $344.00 NO BID
Garfield 1/2 violin outfit Eastman VL100 1 $315.15 $332.00 $344.00 NO BID
Garfield 1/2 violin outfit Eastman VL100 1 $315.15 $332.00 $344.00 NO BID
Harvey Dunn 1/2 violin outfit Eastman VN100 1 $315.15 $332.00 VL100 $344.00 VL100 (Violin) NO BID

JFK 1/2 violin outfit Lake City VA150ST 1 $315.15 VL100 $425.00 LC150VL1/2

$383.00 Suggested Alternate 
Eastman VL140SBC

NO BID
John Harris 1/2 violin outfit Eastman VL100 1 $315.15 $332.00 $344.00 NO BID
LBA 1/2 violin outfit Eastman VL100 1 $315.15 $332.00 $344.00 NO BID
LBA 1/2 violin outfit Eastman VL100 1 $315.15 $332.00 $344.00 NO BID
Oscar Howe 1/2 violin outfit Eastman VL100 1 $315.15 $332.00 $344.00 NO BID
Oscar Howe 1/2 violin outfit Eastman VL100 1 $315.15 $332.00 $344.00 NO BID
Oscar Howe 1/2 violin outfit Eastman VL100 1 $315.15 $332.00 $344.00 NO BID
Oscar Howe 1/2 violin outfit Eastman VL100 1 $315.15 $332.00 $344.00 NO BID
Renberg 1/2 violin outfit Eastman VL100 1 $315.15 $332.00 $344.00 NO BID
Renberg 1/2 violin outfit Eastman VL100 1 $315.15 $332.00 $344.00 NO BID
Rosa Parks 1/2 violin outfit Eastman VL100 1 $315.15 $332.00 $344.00 NO BID
Rosa Parks 1/2 Violin Outfit Eastman VL100 1 $315.15 $332.00 $344.00 NO BID
Rosa Parks 1/2 Violin Outfit Eastman VL100 1 $315.15 $332.00 $344.00 NO BID

Terry Redlin
1/4 bass bow - 
German Glasser Brooklyn Classic 1 $84.00 $95.95 $126.00

Artino 
BF039DBG1/4

$99.99 Glasser          
G503SH-14 NO BID

Terry Redlin
1/4 bass bow - 
German Glasser Brooklyn Classic 1 $84.00 $95.95 $126.00

Artino 
BF039DBG1/4

$99.99 Glasser          
G503SH-14 NO BID

Hawthorne
1/4 bass bow - 
German Glasser Brooklyn Classic 1 $84.00 $95.95 $126.00

Artino 
BF039DBG1/4

$99.99 Glasser          
G503SH-14 NO BID

Garfield 1/4 bass outfit Eastman VB100 1 $1,770.03 VB95 $2,587.00 VB105

$1,888.00 Eastman VB95 
(recommended 
replacement for 
VB100) NO BID

Oscar Howe 1/4 bass outfit Eastman VB100 1 $1,770.03 VB95 $2,587.00 VB105

$1,888.00 Eastman VB95 
(recommended 
replacement for 
VB100) NO BID

Pettigrew
1/4 bass outfit 
w/French bow Eastman VB90 1 $1,770.03 VB95 $1,862.00 VB95

$1,888.00 Eastman VB95 
(recommended 
replacement for 
VB90) NO BID

Robert Frost
1/4 bass outfit 
w/French bow Eastman VB100 1 $1,770.03 VB95 $2,587.00 VB105

$1,888.00 Eastman VB95 
(recommended 
replacement for 
VB100) NO BID

PHMS
1/4 bass outfit 
wFrench bow Eastman VB90 1 $1,770.03 VB95 $1,862.00 VB95

$1,888.00 Eastman VB95 
(recommended 
replacement for 
VB90) NO BID

Robert Frost
1/4 cello bow, 
fiberglass, horsehair Glasser 1 $65.95 $83.00 Eastman BC101/2

$74.99 Glasser 401H14
NO BID

Oscar Howe 1/4 cello outfit Eastman VC100 1 $817.83 $860.00 $866.00 NO BID
Oscar Howe 1/4 cello outfit Eastman VC100 1 $817.83 $860.00 $866.00 NO BID
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Robert Frost

1/4 German bass bow, 
Glasser, Bronx or 
Brooklyn, fiberglass, 
horsehair Glasser 1 $84.00 $95.95 $100.00 Eastman BB10G1/4 $99.99

Glasser          
G503SH-14

NO BID
Terry Redlin 1/4 violin bow 1 $49.00 $48.95 201H14 $42.00 Artino BF39VN1/4 $49.99 Glasser 201H14 NO BID
Cleveland 1/4 violin outfit Eastman VL100 1 $315.15 $332.00 $344.00 NO BID
Cleveland 1/4 violin outfit Eastman VL100 1 $315.15 $332.00 $344.00 NO BID
Eugene Field 1/4 violin outfit Eastman VL100 1 $315.15 $332.00 $344.00 NO BID
JAE 1/4 violin outfit Eastman VL100 1 $315.15 $332.00 $344.00 NO BID
Robert Frost 1/4 violin outfit Eastman VL100 1 $315.15 $332.00 $344.00 NO BID
Rosa Parks 1/4 violin outfit Eastman VL100 2 $315.15 $332.00 $344.00 NO BID

Cleveland
1/8 bass bow - 
German Glasser Brooklyn Classic 1 $84.00 $95.95 $126.00

Artino 
BF39DBG1/8

$99.99 Glasser          
G503SH-18 NO BID

Hawthorne
1/8 bass bow - 
German Glasser Brooklyn Classic 1 $84.00 $95.95 $126.00

Artino 
BF39DBG1/8

$99.99 Glasser          
G503SH-18 NO BID

Terry Redlin
1/8 bass bow - 
German Glasser Brooklyn Classic 1 $84.00 $95.95 $126.00

Artino 
BF39DBG1/8

$99.99 Glasser          
G503SH-18 NO BID

Terry Redlin 1/8 Bass German Bow Glasser Brooklyn Classic 1 $84.00 $95.95 $126.00
Artino 
BF39DBG1/8

$99.99 Glasser          
G503SH-18 NO BID

Anne Sullivan 1/8 bass outfit Eastman VB90 1 $1,770.03 VB95 $1,862.00 VB95 $1,888.00

Eastman VB95 
(recommended 
replacement for 
VB90) NO BID

Laura Wilder 1/8 bass outfit Lake City VB125ST 1 $1,770.03 VB95 $1,345.00

$1,888.00 Suggested Alternate 
Eastman VB95SBC

NO BID

Discovery
1/8 Bass Outfit w/ 
French Bow Eastman VB90 1 $1,770.03 VB95 $1,862.00 VB95 $1,888.00

Eastman VB95 
(recommended 
replacement for 
VB90) NO BID

Pettigrew 1/8 german bass bow Glasser G501H-1/8 1 $84.00 $95.95 $126.00
Artino 
BF39DBG1/8

$86.99 Glasser                  
G501H-18 NO BID

Eugene Field 1/8 German Bow Glasser 1 $84.00 $95.95 $126.00
Artino 
BF39DBG1/8

$86.99 Glasser                  
G501H-18 NO BID

Eugene Field 1/8 German Bow Glasser 1 $84.00 $95.95 $126.00
Artino 
BF39DBG1/8

$86.99 Glasser                  
G501H-18 NO BID

Hayward 12 " viola outfit Eastman VA100 1 $388.61 $409.00 $411.00 NO BID
Hayward 12 " viola outfit Eastman VA100 1 $388.61 $409.00 $411.00 NO BID
Cleveland 12" viola outfit Eastman VA100 1 $388.61 $409.00 $411.00 NO BID
Discovery 12" viola outfit Eastman VA100 1 $388.61 $409.00 $411.00 NO BID
Discovery 12" viola outfit Eastman VA100 1 $388.61 $409.00 $411.00 NO BID
Robert Frost 12" viola outfit Eastman VA100 1 $388.61 $409.00 $411.00 NO BID
Rosa Parks 12" viola outfit Eastman VA100 2 $388.61 $409.00 $411.00 NO BID
Harvey Dunn 12" voila outfit Eastman VA100 1 $388.61 $409.00 $411.00 NO BID
Laura Wilder 13' viola outfit Eastman VA100 1 $388.61 $409.00 $411.00 NO BID
Eugene Field 13" viola outfit Eastman VA100 1 $388.61 $409.00 $411.00 NO BID
Garfield 13" viola outfit Eastman VA100 1 $388.61 $409.00 $411.00 NO BID
Sonia Sotomayor 14" viola outfit Eastman VA100 1 $388.61 $409.00 $411.00 NO BID
Sonia Sotomayor 14"viola outfit Eastman VA100 1 $388.61 $409.00 $411.00 NO BID
Whittier 14"viola outfit Eastman VA100 1 $388.61 $409.00 $411.00 NO BID
PHMS 14" viola outfit Eastman VA100 1 $388.61 $409.00 $411.00 NO BID
PHMS 14" viola outfit Eastman VA100 2 $388.61 $409.00 $411.00 NO BID

Whittier 14" Viola Outfit Lake City 1 $388.61 VA100 $475.00

$466.00 Suggested Alternate 
Eastman VA140SBC-
14" NO BID

Memorial 15" Viola Outfit Lake City 1 $388.61 VA100 $485.00

$466.00 Suggested Alternate 
Eastman VA140SBC-
15" NO BID

Eugene Field
26x12 Pipe Band Bass 
Drum - Black Mist 1 Pearl 1 No Bid $936.00 BDP2612

$818.00 This is model Pearl 
BDP2612/122

NO BID

Terry Redlin
26x12 Pipe Band Bass 
Drum - Black Mist 1 Pearl 1 No Bid $936.00 BDP2612

$818.00 This is model Pearl 
BDP2612/122

NO BID

Lincoln
3.0 Octave 
Vibraphone Yamaha YVT-2700C 1 $6,392.05 YVT-2700 $7,069.00

$4,994.00 Recommended 
Replacement is 
Yamaha YVRD2700 NO BID

Roosevelt
3.0 octave vibraphone 
w/field frame Yamaha YAM-YVRD2700 1 $5,452.74 YVRD2700 $6,080.00

with motor 
(VGR22400) & 
adapter 

$4,994.00

NO BID



Roosevelt
3.0 octave vibraphone 
w/field frame Yamaha YAM-YVRD2700 1 $5,452.74 YVRD2700 $6,080.00

with motor 
(VGR22400) & 
adapter 

$4,994.00

NO BID

Roosevelt
3.5 octave xylophone 
w/field frame Yamaha YAM-YXRD500F 1 $3,621.37 YXRD500F $3,810.00

$3,366.00
NO BID

Anne Sullivan 3/4 Cello Outfit Eastman VC100 1 $817.83 $860.00 $866.00 NO BID
LBA 3/4 Cello Outfit Eastman VC100 1 $817.83 $860.00 $866.00 NO BID
Robert Frost 3/4 cello outfit Eastman VC100 1 $817.83 $860.00 $866.00 NO BID

Sonia Sotomayor 3/4 cello outfit Lake City VC150ST 1 $817.83 VC100 $890.00

$800.00 Suggested Alternate 
Eastman VC140SBC

NO BID

Terry Redlin 3/4 Cello Outfit Eastman VC115ST 1 $817.83 VC100 $879.00

$800.00 Suggested Alternate 
Eastman VC140SBC

NO BID
Eugene Field 3/4 violin outfit Eastman VL100 1 $315.15 $332.00 $344.00 NO BID
Laura Wilder 3/4 violin outfit Eastman VL100 2 $315.15 $332.00 $344.00 NO BID
Oscar Howe 3/4 violin outfit Eastman VL100 1 $315.15 $332.00 $344.00 NO BID
Oscar Howe 3/4 violin outfit Eastman VL100 1 $315.15 $332.00 $344.00 NO BID
Oscar Howe 3/4 violin outfit Eastman VL100 1 $315.15 $332.00 $344.00 NO BID
Oscar Howe 3/4 violin outfit Eastman VL100 1 $315.15 $332.00 $344.00 NO BID
Pettigrew 3/4 violin outfit Eastman VL100 1 $315.15 $332.00 $344.00 NO BID
Pettigrew 3/4 violin outfit Eastman VL100 1 $315.15 $332.00 $344.00 NO BID
Rosa Parks 3/4 Violin Outfit Eastman VL100 1 $315.15 $332.00 $344.00 NO BID
Rosa Parks 3/4 Violin Outfit Eastman VL100 1 $315.15 $332.00 $344.00 NO BID

Roosevelt 4-piece jazz drum set Gretsch

GRE-CX1-J484-XX 
(Finish: Gloss 
Crimson Burst) 1 No Bid $810.00

Catalina Club Kit 
CT1-J484

$797.00

NO BID

Roosevelt
4.3 octave marimba 
w/field frame Yamaha YAM-YMRD2400 1 $5,888.83 YMT2400 $6,360.00

$5,095.00
NO BID

Roosevelt
4.3 octave marimba 
w/field frame Yamaha YAM-YMRD2400 1 $5,888.83 YMT2400 $6,360.00

$5,095.00
NO BID

Whittier 
4/4 Carbonfiber Cello 
Outfit Glasser

4/4 Carbonfiber Cello 
Outfit 1 $5,620.00 $129.95 NO BID NO BID

Whittier 
4/4 Carbonfiber Cello 
Outfit Glasser

4/4 Carbonfiber Cello 
Outfit 1 $5,620.00 $129.95 NO BID NO BID

Edison 4/4 cello outfit Lake City VC150ST 1 $817.83 VC100 $890.00

$800.00 Suggested Alternate 
Eastman VC140SBC

NO BID

Edison 4/4 cello outfit Lake City VC150ST 1 $817.83 VC100 $890.00

$800.00 Suggested Alternate 
Eastman VC140SBC

NO BID

Memorial 4/4 cello outfit Eastman VC90 1 $817.83 VC100 $701.00

$707.00 Eastman VC95 
(recommended 
replacement for 
VC90) NO BID

Pettigrew 4/4 cello outfit Eastman VC90 1 $817.83 VC100 $701.00

$707.00 Eastman VC95 
(recommended 
replacement for 
VC90) NO BID

Terry Redlin 4/4 cello outfit Eastman VC90 1 $817.83 VC100 $701.00

$707.00 Eastman VC95 
(recommended 
replacement for 
VC90) NO BID

Pettigrew 4/4 cello outfit Lake City VC150ST 1 $817.83 VC100 $890.00

$800.00 Suggested Alternate 
Eastman VC140SBC

NO BID
1

Edison 4/4 violin Lake City VL150ST 1 $315.15 VL100 $425.00

$383.00 Suggested Alternate 
Eastman VL140SBC

NO BID

Edison 4/4 violin Lake City VL150ST 1 $315.15 VL100 $425.00

$383.00 Suggested Alternate 
Eastman VL140SBC

NO BID

Edison 4/4 violin Lake City VL150ST 1 $315.15 VL100 $425.00

$383.00 Suggested Alternate 
Eastman VL140SBC

NO BID

Edison 4/4 violin Lake City VL150ST 1 $315.15 VL100 $425.00

$383.00 Suggested Alternate 
Eastman VL140SBC

NO BID
Whittier 4/4 violin outfit Eastman VL100 1 $315.15 VL100 $332.00 $344.00 NO BID
Discovery 4/4 violin outfit Eastman VL100 1 $315.15 VL100 $332.00 $344.00 NO BID
Eugene Field 4/4 violin outfit Eastman VL100 1 $315.15 VL100 $332.00 $344.00 NO BID



JAE 4/4 violin outfit Eastman VN100 1 $315.15 VL100 $332.00 VL100 $344.00 VL100 (Violin) NO BID
LBA 4/4 Violin Outfit Eastman VL100 1 $315.15 VL100 $332.00 $344.00 NO BID
Pettigrew 4/4 violin outfit Eastman VL100 1 $315.15 VL100 $332.00 $344.00 NO BID
Whittier 4/4 violin outfit Eastman VL100 1 $315.15 VL100 $332.00 $344.00 NO BID
Whittier 4/4 violin outfit Eastman VL100 1 $315.15 VL100 $332.00 $344.00 NO BID
Whittier 4/4 Violin Outfit Eastman VL100 1 $315.15 VL100 $332.00 $344.00 NO BID
McGovern alto sax w/case Yamaha YAS-26 1 $1,241.68 $1,225.00 $994.00 NO BID
McGovern alto sax w/case Yamaha YAS-26 1 $1,241.68 $1,225.00 $994.00 NO BID
Memorial Alto Sax w/case Yamaha YAS-26 1 $1,241.68 $1,225.00 $994.00 NO BID
Whittier Alto Sax w/case Yamaha YAS-26 1 $1,241.68 $1,225.00 $994.00 NO BID
PHMS alto sax w/case Yamaha YAS-26 1 $1,241.68 $1,225.00 $994.00 NO BID
PHMS alto sax w/case Yamaha YAS-26 1 $1,241.68 $1,225.00 $994.00 NO BID
Whittier alto sax w/case Yamaha YAS-26 1 $1,241.68 $1,225.00 $994.00 NO BID
Whittier alto sax w/case Yamaha YAS-26 1 $1,241.68 $1,225.00 $994.00 NO BID
Cleveland alto sax w/case Yamaha YAS-26 1 $1,241.68 $1,225.00 $994.00 NO BID
Laura Wilder alto sax w/case Yamaha YAS-26 1 $1,241.68 $1,225.00 $994.00 NO BID

Ben Reifel Bari Sax Yamaha YB-S52 1 $5,118.15 YBS-480 $8,178.00

$4,744.00 This is now YBS-
480 (Replaces YBS-
52) NO BID

Roosevelt Bari Sax Yamaha YB-S52 1 $5,118.15 YBS-480 $8,178.00

$4,744.00 This is now YBS-
480 (Replaces YBS-
52) NO BID

Lincoln Bari Sax Yamaha YB-S52 1 $5,118.15 YBS-480 $8,178.00

$4,744.00 This is now YBS-
480 (Replaces YBS-
52) NO BID

Memorial Bari Sax Yamaha YB-S52 1 $5,118.15 YBS-480 $8,178.00

$4,744.00 This is now YBS-
480 (Replaces YBS-
52) NO BID

PHMS Bari Sax Yamaha YB-S52 1 $5,118.15 YBS-480 $8,178.00

$4,744.00 This is now YBS-
480 (Replaces YBS-
52) NO BID

Discovery
Basic Beat Rolling 
Orff Stand Basic Beat BBV567 1 $132.95 SA1STAND $158.00 $121.12

Discovery
Basic Beat Rolling 
Orff Stand Basic Beat BBV567 1 $132.95 SA1STAND $158.00 $121.12

Discovery
Basic Beat Rolling 
Orff Stand Basic Beat BBV567 1 $132.95 SA1STAND $158.00 $121.12

Discovery
Basic Beat Rolling 
Orff Stand Basic Beat BBV567 1 $132.95 SA1STAND $158.00 $121.12

Discovery
Basic Beat Rolling 
Orff Stand Basic Beat BBV567 1 $132.95 SA1STAND $158.00 $121.12

Discovery
Basic Beat Rolling 
Orff Stand Basic Beat BBV567 1 $132.95 SA1STAND $158.00 $121.12

Discovery
Basic Beat Rolling 
Orff Stand Basic Beat BBV567 1 $132.95 SA1STAND $158.00 $121.12

Discovery
Basic Beat Rolling 
Orff Stand Basic Beat BBV567 1 $132.95 SA1STAND $158.00 $121.12

Discovery
Basic Beat Rolling 
Orff Stand Basic Beat BBV567 1 $132.95 SA1STAND $158.00 $121.12

Lincoln bass clarinet Yamaha YCL221 1 $2,117.08 $2,089.00 $1,991.00 NO BID
Roosevelt bass clarinet Yamaha YCL221 1 $2,117.08 $2,089.00 $1,991.00 NO BID

Jefferson
C-20 Powder Coat 
Lead Pan Panyard 1018 1 $995.43 NO BID

$1,090.00
NO BID

Ben Reifel Castanet Machine
Toca Percussion 
T2300 t2300 1 $79.95 $77.00

$66.00
$64.59

Ben Reifel clarinet w/case Jupiter 635N 2 $347.53 JCL700NA $354.00 JCL700NA

$333.00 This is now Jupiter 
JCL710N (Same as 
635N) NO BID

Ben Reifel clarinet w/case Jupiter 635N 2 $347.53 JCL700NA $354.00 JCL700NA

$333.00 This is now Jupiter 
JCL710N (Same as 
635N) NO BID

Memorial Clarinet Mouthpiece Hite Premier DH111 1 $28.00 $24.00 $19.99 NO BID
Memorial Clarinet Mouthpiece Hite Premier DH111 1 $28.00 $24.00 $19.99 NO BID
Memorial Clarinet Mouthpiece Hite Premier DH111 1 $28.00 $24.00 $19.99 NO BID

Memorial clarinet w/case Jupiter 635N 1 $347.53 JCL700NA $354.00 JCL700NA

$333.00 This is now Jupiter 
JCL710N (Same as 
635N) NO BID

Memorial clarinet w/case Jupiter 635N 1 $347.53 JCL700NA $354.00 JCL700NA

$333.00 This is now Jupiter 
JCL710N (Same as 
635N) NO BID



PHMS clarinet w/case Jupiter 635N 1 $347.53 JCL700NA $354.00 JCL700NA

$333.00 This is now Jupiter 
JCL710N (Same as 
635N) NO BID

PHMS clarinet w/case Jupiter 635N 1 $347.53 JCL700NA $354.00 JCL700NA

$333.00 This is now Jupiter 
JCL710N (Same as 
635N) NO BID

Whittier clarinet w/case Jupiter 635N 1 $347.53 JCL700NA $354.00 JCL700NA

$333.00 This is now Jupiter 
JCL710N (Same as 
635N) NO BID

Whittier clarinet w/case Jupiter 635N 1 $347.53 JCL700NA $354.00 JCL700NA

$333.00 This is now Jupiter 
JCL710N (Same as 
635N) NO BID

Whittier clarinet w/case Jupiter 635N 1 $347.53 JCL700NA $354.00 JCL700NA

$333.00 This is now Jupiter 
JCL710N (Same as 
635N) NO BID

Edison
clavinova digital piano 
with dolly Yamaha CLP-775 1 $4,394.00

CLP77B + 
Dolly+Installation NO BID NO BID

McGovern
clavinova digital piano 
with dolly Yamaha CLP-775 1 $4,394.00

CLP77B + 
Dolly+Installation NO BID NO BID

Patrick Henry
clavinova digital piano 
with dolly Yamaha CLP-775 1 $4,394.00

CLP77B + 
Dolly+Installation NO BID NO BID

Roosevelt
clavinova digital piano 
with dolly Yamaha CLP-775 1 $4,394.00

CLP77B + 
Dolly+Installation NO BID NO BID

Whittier
clavinova digital piano 
with dolly Yamaha CLP-775 1 $4,394.00

CLP77B + 
Dolly+Installation NO BID NO BID

Lincoln concert euphonium Mack Brass EU1150S 1 No Bid $3,029.00 Eastman EEP526S NO BID

Roosevelt Concert Marimba Marimba One

5.0 Octave Wave 
Series Marimba with 
Traditional Keyboard 
and Classic 
Resonators 1 No Bid NO BID NO BID

Roosevelt
Concert/Jazz 
Vibraphone Adams

4.0 Octave Alpha 
Series Vibraphone 
with Gold Bars 
(Walnut Black) 1 No Bid $10,241.00 VAWA40G

$8,888.00 Adams Model 
VAWA40G (9T1)

$8,939.70 NO BID
Memorial Conga Stand LP LP290B 1 $220.00 $288.00 $239.00 $275.00 $258.39

Edison 
Crash cymbal 
cradle/stand Gibraltar 7614 1 $89.95 $90.00

$80.99
$115.00 $80.74

Roosevelt crash cymbals (pair) Zildjian ZIL-K2104 1 $669.78 $747.00 $511.00 $565.00 NO BID

Roosevelt
drum set hardware 
pack Gibraltar 1 $349.98 4700PK $360.00

$519.00 6700PK
NO BID

Roosevelt
field frame cymbal 
mount Weiss SW-FFCM 1 No Bid NO BID

$69.99
NO BID

Whittier flute w/case Gemeinhardt 2SP 1 $299.68 2SPAJ1 $399.00 Lake City LCFL115 $333.00 NO BID
Whittier flute w/case Gemeinhardt 2SP 1 $299.68 2SPAJ1 $399.00 Lake City LCFL115 $333.00 NO BID
Whittier flute w/case Gemeinhardt 2SP 1 $299.68 2SPAJ1 $399.00 Lake City LCFL115 $333.00 NO BID

Roosevelt 150 choral folders musicfolders.com
deluxeclassroom 
music folders 1 $11.99 0120MARLO NO BID NO BID

Edison hihat cymbals (pair) Zildjan
14" A Zildjan New 
Beats 1 $411.30 K0940 $387.00

$272.00
$347.19

Edison hihat stand Pearl H930 1 No Bid $175.00 $128.99 $157.45

Jefferson

Import PC Black Dbl. 
Sec Pan Gig Ready 
PKG Panyard 1620 1 $3,454.83 NO BID

$3,222.00 Now Panyard 
W1621

NO BID

Jefferson
import PC Black Lead 
C Gig Ready PKG Panyard 1600 1 $2,465.80 NO BID

$2,333.00 Now Panyard 
W1601 NO BID

Memorial
Instrument Cables - 
20' Pro Co QTR20 1 $45.00 PW-AMSGRA-20 $12.00

HotWires 20' 
Instrument Cable NO BID

Memorial
Instrument Cables - 
20' Pro Co QTR20 1 $45.00 PW-AMSGRA-20 $12.00

HotWires 20' 
Instrument Cable NO BID

Memorial
Instrument Cables - 
20' Pro Co QTR20 1 $45.00 PW-AMSGRA-20 $12.00

HotWires 20' 
Instrument Cable NO BID

Memorial
Instrument Cables - 
20' Pro Co QTR20 1 $45.00 PW-AMSGRA-20 $12.00

HotWires 20' 
Instrument Cable NO BID

1
Roosevelt jazz cymbal pack Zildjian ZIL-KCD900 1 $1,020.64 $1,216.00 $888.00 $880.00 NO BID

Washington
Marching Concert 
Bass Drum Yamaha YAM-CB7032R 1 $880.77 $902.00 $788.30 NO BID

Roosevelt
marching synth cart 
w/rack Pageantry PAG-KC-15 1 No Bid NO BID NO BID

Roosevelt marching tuba silver Yamaha YBB-202MWC silver 1 $7,105.26 YBB-202MSWC $7,012.00 YBB-202MSWC
$6,544.00 YBB-202MSWC 

Silver NO BID
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Roosevelt marching tuba silver Yamaha YBB-202MWC silver 1 $7,105.26 YBB-202MSWC $7,012.00 YBB-202MSWC
$6,544.00 YBB-202MSWC 

Silver NO BID

Roosevelt marching tuba silver Yamaha YBB-202MWC silver 1 $7,105.26 YBB-202MSWC $7,012.00 YBB-202MSWC
$6,544.00 YBB-202MSWC 

Silver NO BID

Eugene Field
Multi-Fit Bass Drum 
Legs Pearl PEA-PMBDL3 1 No Bid $225.00

$188.00
NO BID

Terry Redlin
Multi-Fit Bass Drum 
Legs Pearl PEA-PMBDL3 1 No Bid $225.00

$188.00
NO BID

Terry Redlin rolling orff stands Basic Beat BBV567 3 $132.95 SA1STAND $158.00 $121.12

Anne Sullivan shaped viola case 13" Howard Core 2 $64.00
Foam Shell $64 
(Wood Shell $96) $47.95 $65.00 NO BID

Anne Sullivan shaped viola case 14" Howard Core 2 $64.00
Foam Shell $64 
(Wood Shell $96) $47.95 $65.00 NO BID

Discovery
Sonor Global Beat 
Alto Xylophone Sonor AX GBF 1 $500.74 $482.00 $440.00 $406.60

Whittier
Sound Shells - 
Travelmaster Wenger

SKU#:TRAVELMAS
TER SHELL 1 No Bid NO BID NO BID

Roosevelt suspended cymbal Zildjian ZIL-K1014 1 $467.77 $522.00 $377.00 $401.00 NO BID
Whittier tambourine Black Swamp BLA-TC2 1 $219.00 NO BID $195.00 NO BID
Lincoln tenor sax Yamaha YTS26 1 $1,568.21 $1,548.00 $1,222.00 NO BID

Lincoln
tenor sax 
(professional) Yamaha YTS62111 1 $2,924.81 $2,886.00

$2,696.00
NO BID

Whittier 
Travelmaster Storage 
Cart Wenger SKU#:064A170 1 No Bid NO BID NO BID

Whittier 
Travelmaster Storage 
Cart Wenger SKU#:064A170 1 No Bid NO BID NO BID

Whittier 
Travelmaster Storage 
Cart SKU#:064A170 1 No Bid NO BID NO BID

Edison Trombone w/case Yamaha YAS354 1 $688.51 YSL354 $679.00 YSL-354
$597.00 This is model YSL-

354 NO BID

PHMS Trombone w/case Yamaha YAS354 1 $688.51 YSL354 $679.00 YSL-354
$597.00 This is model YSL-

354 NO BID
PHMS Trombone w/case Yamaha YSL354 1 $688.51 YSL354 $679.00 $597.00 NO BID
Susan B Anthony Trombone w/case Yamaha YSL354 1 $688.51 YSL354 $679.00 $597.00 NO BID
Memorial Trombone w/case Yamaha YSL354 1 $688.51 YSL354 $679.00 $597.00 NO BID
Memorial Trumpet w/case Bach TR300 H2 USA 1 $607.57 $593.00 BTR301 $597.00 NO BID
PHMS trumpet w/case Bach TR300 H2 USA 1 $607.57 $593.00 BTR301 $597.00 NO BID
PHMS trumpet w/case Bach TR300 H2 USA 1 $607.57 $593.00 BTR301 $597.00 NO BID
Whittier Tuba+ Case St. Petersburg 203 1 No Bid $4,210.00 Eastman EBB431 $4,884.00 NO BID

Washington
Yamaha 2-way 
loudspeaker Yamaha DSR2015 1 $1,180.00 DZR15 Revised SKU NO BID NO BID

Washington
Yamaha 2-way 
loudspeaker Yamaha DSR2015 1 $1,180.00 DZR15 Revised SKU NO BID NO BID

Washington

Yamaha HD-300 
Harmony Director 
Instructional 
Keyboard Yamaha HD-300 1 $690.00 $630.00

$484.00

$595.00 NO BID

Washington
Yamaha powered 
subwoofer Yamaha DSR2015 1 $1,350.00

DXS18XLF Revised 
SKU NO BID NO BID

Washington
Yamaha powered 
subwoofer Yamaha DSR2015 1 $1,350.00

DXS18XLF Revised 
SKU NO BID NO BID

Ben Reifel
Zoom Multi-Track 
Handy Recorder

Zoom Multi Track 
Handy Recorder H4N Pro Black 1 $249.99 H4NPRO NO BID NO BID

Hayward 1/4 violin outfit Eastman VL100 1 $315.15 $420.00 $344.00 NO BID
Hayward 13" viola outfit Eastman VA 100 1 $388.61 $409.00 $411.00 NO BID
Hayward 12" viola Eastman VA100 1 $388.61 $409.00 $411.00 NO BID

Hayward 1/4 Cello outfit Eastman VC90 1 $666.06 $701.00

$707.00 Eastman VC95 
(recommended 
replacement for 
VC90) NO BID

Hayward 1/2 cello outfit Eastman VC90 1 $666.06 $701.00

$707.00 Eastman VC95 
(recommended 
replacement for 
VC90) NO BID

TOTAL BID $5,620.00 $57,234.84 $3,468.00 $64,032.95 $1,668.30 $1,682.39

605-367-4221
Boyd Perkins, Fine Arts Coordinator
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