Musical Instruments and Accessories Bids

Vendor: Taylor Music

Qty Model Item Unit price Total Delivery
1 YAM-TP6304 Yamaha Intermediate Series Smooth Copper Timpani (Set of 4
drums: 32,29,26,23) 12,222.00 12,222.00 15-30 days
2 ADM-MCPA43 Adams 4.3 Octave Padouk Marimba with Apex Frame 15-30 days (4
3,288.00 6,576.00 available)
15-30 days (1
1 ADM-VCNA30S Adams 3.0 Octave Concert Series Silver Vibraphone with Apex avail.able, then
Frame - No Motor special order
4,144.00 4,144.00 item)
1 ADM-BK2201C Adams 1.5 Octave Standard Series Chimes (GEN2) 15_.30 days (3
3,777.00 3,777.00 available
1 ADM-GCA33 Adams 3.3 Octave Concert Series Glockenspiel Per_fac'fgry
3,544.00 3,544.00 availability
1 ADM-XS1KA35 Adams 3.5 Octave Soloist Synthetic Xylophone Estimated July
2,122.00 2,122.00 2023

Per factory

32x16 Pearl Concert Bass Drum with Stand (Includes CBS80S .
availability - Fall

1 PEA-PBE3216/CBS46 Direct Mount Stand)

1,499.00 1,499.00 2023?
Per factory
1 PEA-PTE101246 10"x10"/12"x10" Pearl Concert Tom Set w/Stand availability - Fall
477.00 477.00 2023?
Per factory
1 PEA-PTE131446 13"x11"/14"x12" Pearl Concert Tom Set w/Stand availability - Fall
522.00 522.00 20237
1 GRE-CX1-J484-XX Gretsch Catalina Club Jazz 4-Piece Shell Pack - 18" Bass Drum  no bid no bid
1 ZIL-A0447 Zildjian 18" Symphonic Viennese Cymbal Pair 377.00 377.00 15-30 days
Per factory
3 PEA-CRP1455-103 Piano Black 14x5.5 Concert Series Maple Snare Drum availability - Fall
449.00 1,347.00 20237
1 SW-28CHAU Weiss 28" Hand Selected Chau Gong no bid no bid
1 ZIL-A0133 Zildjian 14" New Beat Hi-Hat Cymbals 272.00 272.00 15-30 days
1/ ZIL-K0965 Zildjian 20" K Custom Dark Ride Cymbal 288.00 288.00 15-30 days
1 ZIL-A0421 Zildjian 20" Classic Orchestral Selection Suspended Cymbal 259.00 259.00 15-30 days
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ZIL-K0951
LP-LP1210
BLA-LGTD1
TW-TRE35
LUD-LE9S7
SAB-61135-6B8H
BLA-MWB2
LP-LP204AN
LP-LP441T-M

7000004

GIB-5709

ROC-TIMPANI
GIB-GPRGS-L
PEA-H930
PEA-P930
YAM-SS745
GIB-7614
PEA-S930
GIB-5608
HUM-GL526CP
INN-CB5
INN-CB3
SW-TRIHANGER
YEP 321

TDC23L, TDC26L,
TDC29L, TDC32L

Zildjian 16" K Custom Dark Crash Cymbal

LP Granite Block Set (LP1210)

Black Swamp 10" Leggiero Double Row Tambourine - LGTD1
TreeWorks Tre35 Classic Single-Row 35 Bar Chime

Ludwig Sleigh Bells

Sabian 06" Hand Hammered Triangle

Black Swamp Rock Maple Woodblock - Med (MWB2)

LP Black Beauty Cowbell

LP Twist Shaker - Medium (Blue)

Mccormicks-Marimba Practice Mat - 5 Octave Keyboard Pad
Gibraltar Medium Weight Boom Cymbal Stand

Husky 52 in. W x 25 in. D Standard Duty 9-Drawer Mobile
Workbench Tool Chest with Solid Wood Top in Gloss Black

Roc-N-Soc Timpani Throne

Gibraltar Gong Stand

Pearl H930 Demonator Hi-Hat Stand

Pearl P-930 Demonator Bass Drum Pedal

Yamaha Concert Snare Stand

Gibraltar 7614 Concert Cymbal Cradle

Pearl S-930 Snare Drum Stand

Gibraltar 5608 Round Vinyl Drum Throne

Humes & Berg Galaxy Cymbal Bag - 22" With Dividers
Innovative CB5 Rollers Concert Bass Drum Mallets
Innovative CB3 Medium Concert Bass Drum Mallet
Weiss Metal Triangle Hanger

4 valve Yamaha baritones

Set of 4 Yamaha timpani covers (new for 2023) set of 4
Items in RED will not be delivered before June 1, 2023

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid
no bid

no bid

no bid

219.00
191.00

118.99
79.99

39.99
28.99
16.99

83.99

269.99
122.99
74.99
80.99
74.99
66.99
74.99

45.99
36.99

1,939.00
36,806.85

377

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid
no bid

no bid

no bid

219.00
191.00

118.99
79.99

39.99
28.99
16.99

419.95

269.99
122.99
74.99
242.97
74.99
200.97
74.99

45.99
36.99

3,878.00
43,563.77

15-30 days
15-30 days

15-30 days
15-30 days

15-30 days
15-30 days
15-30 days

15-30 days

15-30 days
15-30 days
15-30 days
15-30 days
15-30 days
15-30 days
15-30 days

15-30 days
15-30 days

November 2023



Vendor: Sweet Music

Qty
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Model
YAM-TP6304
ADM-MCPA43
ADM-VCNA30S

ADM-BK2201C
ADM-GCA33
ADM-XS1KA35

PEA-PBE3216/CBS46

PEA-PTE101246
PEA-PTE131446
GRE-CX1-J484-XX
ZIL-A0447
PEA-CRP1455-103
SW-28CHAU
ZIL-A0133
ZIL-K0965
ZIL-A0421
ZIL-K0951
LP-LP1210
BLA-LGTD1
TW-TRE35
LUD-LE97
SAB-61135-6B8H
BLA-MWB2
LP-LP204AN
LP-LP441T-M

7000004

GIB-5709

Item Unit Price
Yamaha Intermediate Series Smooth Copper Timpani (Set of 4
drums: 32,29,26,23) 12,695
Adams 4.3 Octave Padouk Marimba with Apex Frame 3565
Adams 3.0 Octave Concert Series Silver Vibraphone with Apex
Frame - No Motor 4375
Adams 1.5 Octave Standard Series Chimes (GEN2) 4099
Adams 3.3 Octave Concert Series Glockenspiel 3835
Adams 3.5 Octave Soloist Synthetic Xylophone 2255
32x16 Pearl Concert Bass Drum with Stand (Includes CBS80S
Direct Mount Stand) 1572
10"x10"/12"x10" Pearl Concert Tom Set w/Stand 509
13"x11"/14"x12" Pearl Concert Tom Set w/Stand 549
Gretsch Catalina Club Jazz 4-Piece Shell Pack - 18" Bass Drum 729
Zildjian 18" Symphonic Viennese Cymbal Pair 399
Piano Black 14x5.5 Concert Series Maple Snare Drum 475
Weiss 28" Hand Selected Chau Gong no bid
Zildjian 14" New Beat Hi-Hat Cymbals 275
Zildjian 20" K Custom Dark Ride Cymbal 299
Zildjian 20" Classic Orchestral Selection Suspended Cymbal 265
Zildjian 16" K Custom Dark Crash Cymbal 219
LP Granite Block Set (LP1210) 229
Black Swamp 10" Leggiero Double Row Tambourine - LGTD1 199
TreeWorks Tre35 Classic Single-Row 35 Bar Chime 129
Ludwig Sleigh Bells 95
Sabian 06" Hand Hammered Triangle 99
Black Swamp Rock Maple Woodblock - Med (MWB2) 43
LP Black Beauty Cowbell 39
LP Twist Shaker - Medium (Blue) 20

Mccormicks-Marimba Practice Mat - 5 Octave Keyboard Pad no bid
Gibraltar Medium Weight Boom Cymbal Stand 89

no bid

no bid

Total

12695
7130

4375
4099
3835
2255

1572
509
549
729
399

1425

275
299
265
219
229
199
129
95
99
43
39
20

445

Delivery

In stock

In stock
3-4 mos. - special
order

30 days
30-60 days
30-60 days

90 days
90 days
August
15-30 days
30-45 days
August

30-45 days
30-45 days
30-45 days
30-45 days
15-30 days
15-30 days
15-30 das
In stock
30-45 days
In stock
15-30 days
In stock

In stock



Husky 52 in. W x 25 in. D Standard Duty 9-Drawer Mobile

1 Workbench Tool Chest with Solid Wood Top in Gloss Black no bid no bid

1 ROC-TIMPANI Roc-N-Soc Timpani Throne no bid no bid

1 GIB-GPRGS-L Gibraltar Gong Stand 279 279 30-45 days
1 PEA-H930 Pearl H930 Demonator Hi-Hat Stand 139 139 in stock

1 PEA-P930 Pearl P-930 Demonator Bass Drum Pedal 109 109 in stock

3 YAM-SS745 Yamaha Concert Snare Stand 109 327 in stock

1 GIB-7614 Gibraltar 7614 Concert Cymbal Cradle 97 97 in stock

3 PEA-S930 Pearl S-930 Snare Drum Stand 101 303 in stock

1 GIB-5608 Gibraltar 5608 Round Vinyl Drum Throne 74 74 in stock

1 HUM-GL526CP Humes & Berg Galaxy Cymbal Bag - 22" With Dividers 55 55 in stock

1 INN-CB5 Innovative CB5 Rollers Concert Bass Drum Mallets 48 48 15-45 days
1 INN-CB3 Innovative CB3 Medium Concert Bass Drum Mallet 37 37 15-45 days
1 SW-TRIHANGER Weiss Metal Triangle Hanger no bid no bid

2 YEP 321 4 valve Yamaha baritones 2075 4150 November

40,180 47546

In stock should ship within 2-5 days

Recorded by: Pam Steele 3.10.23



