
ANNOUNCEMENTS 
 

Monday, February 28, 2022 
Assorted Hot Sandwiches, Baked Beans, Applesauce 

 
Athletics 

 Last Thursday night the 7th grade girls’ basketball team played at home against Britton 
Deerfield.  The Lady Aggies played great defense throughout to defeat Britton Deerfield by a 
score of 21-5.  Top performances were turned in by Sydney Marks, Elise Wilkinson, Ania 
Ramirez, and Jalyn Snyder. On Saturday the 7th grade girls’ basketball team concluded their 
season by playing in the Sand Creek Middle School Basketball Tournament.  In the 1st game 
the Aggies ran into a very good Blissfield team and lost by a score of 13-26.  In the 2nd game 
the Lady Aggies played Morenci.  They fought hard to the end, but eventually fell to Morenci by 
a score of 31-36.  Top performances for the day were turned in by Emma Burns, Rameriz, 
Wilkinson, Erin Alexander, and Marks.  Emma Burns won the halftime free-throw shooting 
contest. Coach Zyla would like to thank all the girl for their hard effort this season.  Everyone 
improved greatly from the beginning of the season to the end.  Great job ladies. 

 
MooCrew Themes  

 Tomorrow’s boys game against Pittsford will be MooCrew 
 

Seniors 

 LCEF Scholarships are due TODAY. If you need assistance or have questions about your 
scholarships, please see Ms. Slusher. 

 
General Announcements 

 38 HS band members will be participating in the band trip to Florida from Tuesday March 15 
until Saturday, March 19.  Students have been marked SR in Infinite Campus and a list of 
students was emailed to teachers.   

 Attention Prom Committee – please see me if you are interested in designing the shirt for after 
prom. 

 The Tech Center class list for the 2022-2023 school year is posted across from the guidance 
office. 

 FCA meets Friday morning at 7:15 am in the JH Gym.  FCA is open to all staff and students.   
 
Job Fair 

 Attention Juniors and Seniors:  There will be a job fair at Adrian College on March 18 – see 
the posted fliers for more information and sign up in the guidance office if you are interested in 
attending. 

 
Monday, February 28 

 Jr. High Equations will meet today in Mrs. Gunter’s room. 
 
Wednesday, March 2 

 The regularly scheduled FFA Meeting for March 2nd has been postponed. 
 



Thursday, March 3 

 Teacher meeting at 7:00 am in the HS library. 

 All HS students are invited to watch a portion of this year’s play “See How They Run”.  
Students will be dismissed from their 2nd hour class at 9:20 and will report to the JH gym for a 
9:30 show time.  Students will return to their 4th hour. 

 Collin Reckner and Jack Pifer are excused SR on Thursday at 11:40 to compete in the State 
Wrestling Meet.  Good luck gentlemen! 

 All 9-12th grade softball players are to meet with Coach Randall in the cafeteria after 
announcements Thursday. 

 
Friday, March 4 

 Paige Baker and Carson Pickles are excused SR Friday for a TC trip. 

 Collin Reckner and Jack Pifer are excused SR on Friday  
 
Saturday, March 5 & Sunday, March 6 

 Mark your calendars for this Saturday and Sunday when the High School drama club will 
present: "See How They Run" by Philip King. There are three show times and all tickets are 
$5.00.  Show times are Saturday at 2:00 p.m. and 7:00 p.m. and the last performance on 
Sunday at 2:00 p.m. Doors open an hour before show time; come out and support your 
classmates. 

 
 


