
Reporting  Elements 2018–19 school year
(by January 15,

2020)

2019–20 school
year  (by April 15,

2020)

2020–21 school
year  (by April 15,

2021)

# of high school students
eligible to participate in
the  federal free and
reduced price meals
program

274 276 282

Price of ASB card for
high  school students

$35.00 $35.00 $0

Discounted price of ASB
card for students eligible
for  federal free and
reduced price meals
program

NA $15.00 $0

Athletic program fees $25, $20, $15 $25, $20, $15 $0

Discounted athletic
program  fees for students
eligible for  federal free
and reduced price meals
program

$8.00 $8.00 $0

# of high school students
who possess an ASB
card

378 358 617

# of high school students
eligible for federal free
and  reduced-price meals
program who possess
an  ASB card

67 158 282

# of high school students
participating in an athletic
program (note: just count
a  student once, even if
they  participate in
multiple
programs)

271 286 254

# of high school students
participating in an athletic
program who are eligible
for  federal free and
reduced price meals
program (note:  just count
a student once,  even if
they participate in  multiple
programs)

69 104 83


